City of Rochester Hills, Michigan

PROJECT: Aggregates for 2025 and 2026

ITB-RH-25-001 TABULATION

Bids Read: January 22, 2025 @ 3:30 P.M.

NAME

Bedrock Express Ltd.
1290 N M-15
Ortonville, Ml 48462

Edw. C. Levy Co
9300 Dix Avenue
Dearborn, Ml 48120

Fox Snap Enterprise LLC
21603 Flowering Garden Ln
Katy, TX 77449

Latigo Transport INC
2371 Graham Rd
Imlay City, Ml 48444

Mierzwa Construction LLC
1001 Cesar E Chavez Ave
Pontiac, Ml 48340

Osburn Industries, Inc.
5850 Pardee Road
Taylor, Ml 48180

6AC Natural Stone:

2025 Cost per ton $18.95 $30.54 $27.65 $27.00 $28.00 $29.00
2026 Cost per ton $19.95 $30.54 $30.00 $28.22 $29.46 $30.00
21AA Natural Stone-Road Gravel:
2025 Cost per ton $46.95 No Bid $219.69 $33.90 $30.50 $36.00
2026 Cost per ton $48.95 No Bid $242.00 $35.43 $33.63 $38.00
23A Natural Stone-Road Gravel:
2025 Cost per ton $23.75 $28.49 $37.57 $19.90 $20.00 $19.00
2026 Cost per ton $24.75 $28.49 $41.00 $20.80 $21.31 $20.00
21AA Limestone
2025 Cost per ton $24.70 No Bid $33.50 $27.80 $22.00 $25.00
2026 Cost per ton $25.24 No Bid $37.00 $29.05 $23.50 $26.00
5G Slag
2025 Cost per ton No Bid $24.64 $250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2026 Cost per ton No Bid $24.64 $375.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
21AA Crushed Concrete:
2025 Cost per ton $18.55 No Bid $31.00 $24.50 $22.00 $17.50
2026 Cost per ton $19.24 No Bid $34.00 $25.60 $23.50 $18.50
Class Il Fill Sand
2025 Cost per ton $10.90 $16.53 $28.50 $13.90 $12.74 $13.50
2026 Cost per ton $11.24 $16.53 $31.00 $14.53 $13.63 $14.50
Initialed delivery is FOB? Initialed Initaled Initaled Initaled Initaled No
Exceptions: None Left blank Left blank None N/A Left blank
Accept MasterCard? Yes Yes Yes No Yes, 3% fee Yes
Preferred Payment Method: Credit Card ACH Credit Card ACH ACH Check
Terms: 2% discount if paid within 10 3% discount payment for net 15 Left Blank Net 30
days by credit card. Net 30 days payment terms None eft Blan et

One (1) No Bid




