RFP TABULATION-CORE LIST

RFP-FH-11-12-1693

Industrial Cleaning Supply - Waterford, MI

Pyramid School Products-Tam

EST. PERCENT
ANNUAL INCREASE PER
VENDOR UNIT COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT
MFG. DESCRIPTION PART # USAGE |JUNIT SIZE PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE
bottle 1
Spartan Drain Opener 738008 gallon $ 0061$ 8.101$% 32.40 4 Will not hold price
CITY OF RQEHESTER HILLS, * .« " " .-
Neutralle Deodorizers
Technical Concepts |Ocean Breeze Aerosol Refill 10065 1 12/cs $ 086193 5211% 62.52 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
CHASE Ocean Breeze Aerosol Refill 5178 1 12/cs $2.665000 $31.98 $31.98
Claire Fresh Linen Metered Aerosol Refill 143947 8 12/cs $ 06319% 3.7913% 45.48 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
CHASE Fresh Linen Metered Aerosol Refill 5100 8 12/cs $2.665000 $31.98 $31.98
Technical (-:oncepts Apple Scent Metered
Technical Concepts |Aerosol Refill 10060 12/cs $ 0861$ 521 1% 62.52 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Technical Concepts Apple Scent Metered
CHASE Aerosol Refill 5188 12/cs $2.665000 $31.98 $31.98
12/bx
Cormatic A4051 Gel Refill Cherry Almond 6264 2bx/cs $ 3.06]% 36.67 | $ 73341 % 24.00 | Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
12/bx
Cormatic A4057 Gel Refill Apple Blossom 6269 2bx/cs $ 3.741% 448819 89761 $ 24.00| Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Pulse Pulse 2 Automatic Dispenser 400570 2 each $ 49131 $ 49.13 1% 20478 | $ 6.00 | Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Chase Model 1000 - 15 minute interval setting 4381000
Restroom Supplies
1 0z pkg
Stearns Bowl Cleaner 165132 17 72/cs $ 02713 02713 19.55 72 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
quarts
ICS Pinky Porcelain Tile & Bowl Cleaner 13340 12/cs $ 0.101$% 3.191% 38.28 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
BATH & TILE CLEANER Phosphoric Acid-
Based RTU Cleaner, Disinfectant And
Simoniz Deodorizer B0290012
quarts
Spartan Germicidal Bowl Cleaner 9625 12/cs $ 0.06 1% 19113 22.92 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
FREEDOM Nonacid Bowl Cleaner and
Simoniz Disinfectant Pleasant herbal fragrance. F1231012
Impact Toilet Bowl Swab White 128068 100/cs $ 076 1 $ 076 1% 0.76 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
TOLCO Toilet Bowl Swab White 280100 100/cs $0.490000 $49.00 $49.00
e ———
Spartan MLD Bowl Cleaner 9628, 8 12/cs $ 0071% 23619% 28.32 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
BATH & TILE CLEANER Phosphoric Acid-
Based RTU Cleaner, Disinfectant And
Simoniz Deodorizer B0290012
quarts
Spartan NABC Disf Bowl Cleaner NO DYE 9631 19 12/cs $ 0.0619% 2031% 24.36 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
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FREEDOM Nonacid Bowl Cleaner and
Simoniz Disinfectant Pleasant herbal fragrance. F1231012
rSta—Bright Bleach 31 2 gallon 6/cs | ¢ 0.011% 1671% 10.02 6 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Sunbrite Bleach 103076
quarts
Spartan Foamy Q & A Dual Acid 9602 2 12/cs $ 02619% 3.071% 36.84 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Full Strength ready to use, high acid
germicidal bowl and urinal cleaner,
deodorizer, disinfectant for institutional and
Simoniz hospital use. F1243012
quarts
Spartan Bloc-Aid Drain & Sewer Cleaner 9663| 12/cs $ 0.081% 2691% 32.28 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Digest Liquid enzyme producing bacteria for
Simoniz drain maintenance. D0860012
rSpartan Tilex RJ8 9562 $ 0091$ 2881% 34.56 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
BATH & TILE CLEANER Phosphoric Acid-
Based RTU Cleaner, Disinfectant And
Simoniz Deodorizer B0290012
rSpartan Sterephene (Lysol) 9707 $ 0111% 3.481% 41.76 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Chase Spray Disinfectant, Aerosol 4334104
Paper Products
\White Swan Toilet Tissue NO SUBSTITUTE 196920 4 48/cs $ 05119% 24701 $ 24.70 48 Will not hold price No-§id No-§id No-§id
Mainstreet 2-ply Toilet Tissue 17912 78 96/cs $ 04413 42211% 42.21 96 Will not hold price No-§id No-§id No-§id
roll 500
\VonDrehle 2-Ply Toilet Paper 4.5 X 3.6 500 sheets/roll VON 5022 sheet
rMalnstreet 2-ply Kitchen Roll Towel 218110 129 12/cs )
IBoardwalk 2-ply roll towels white 11 X 8.5 White BWK 6273 . I Y I
IMainstreet 2-ply Facial Tissue 74195 8 30/cs $ 0.731% 21.921% 21.92 30 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
ImARCAL 2-ply Facial Tissue 2930 8 30/cs $0.732666 $21.98 $21.98
CUBE FACIAL TISSUE W BOX2PLY WHI
\VonDrehle VIRGIN 36X85'S GEN 852D
Big-Fold Premium Towels Z-Fold NO
IDubl Soft SUBSTITUTE 190842 102 3500/cs | $ 0.021% 53.44 1% 53.44 3500 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Coronet 2-Ply Center Pull Towel - White 54922 22 6/cs $ 5911% 3548 | $ 35.48 6 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Centerfeed hand towel White 6 rolls/case
\VonDrehle 600'/roll VON CP600
Continental Multifold-C-Fold Disp White 990W 4815 6/cs $ 3156 | $ 3156 | $ 31.56 1 Will not hold price | $ 3171$% 18.99 | $ 113.94
\VonDrehle Multifold-C-Fold Disp 175A0
Skm Care -_______________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________|
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Hand Sanitizer mor dispensers #2220-
Purell 08) 24135 2 2000ml 2/cs| ¢ 16.78 1 $ 16.78 1 $ 67.12 4 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Purell Hand Sanitizer Refill 539202 2lcs $ 28.06 | $ 28.06 | $ 56.12 2 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Purell Hand Dispenser 27-2012 1/ea $ 17351 % 17351 % 17.35 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Gojo Orange Hand Pumice Cleaner 111130 1 gallon4/cs | ¢ 136119% 13611% 81.66 6 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Gojo Antibacterial Foam Hand Soap 167691 23 3/cs $ 15451 % 15451 $ 46.35 3 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Hand Kleen Foaming Antibacterial Hand
Auto Chlor Soap A0231610 23 6/case
Gojo Antibacterial Foam Hair & Body 168944 2 3/cs $ 14881 $ 14881 $ 44.64 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
rSpartan Antiseptic Hand Lotion & Cleaner 9776 7 l/gallon |'¢ 96313 96313% 38.52 4 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Complete Antimicrobial, Antiseptic Liquid
Simoniz lotion Hand Soap A0065004
Liners
12-16 gal
Pro Link liner, 23 x 33 TK2432XH Black 1 MIL 4942 16 500/cs $ 009]% 47.09 | $ 47.09 500 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
BG, TRSH, Width: 24 Length: 32 Mil:0.7
Inteplast Color: Clear Capacity: 12-16 Pack: 500 LD3300
31-33 gal
|Pr0 Link liner, 33 x 40 Clear 33 gal 500/cs---13 MIC 4932631 6 500/cs No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
31-33 gal
IPro Link liner, 33 x 40 Clear | H3340-13N-C 500/cs $ 0071$% 33.06 | $ 33.06 500 Will not hold price
BG, TRSH, Width: 33 Length: 40 Mil: 1.2
Inteplast Color: Clear Capacity: 33 Pack: 150 LD3340X2C
40-45 gal
fPro Link liner, 40 x 45 1.3 MIL 152020 24 100/cs No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
40-45 gal
IPro Link liner, 40 x 45 (1.3 mil) R4048-150B-C 100/cs $ 0.221% 21.901$ 21.90 100 Will not hold price
BG, TRSH, Width: 40 Length: 46 Mil: 1.2
Inteplast Color: Black Capacity: 40-45 Pack: 100 LD4046X2B
55 gal
Pro Link liner, 38 x 60 Black-55 gal 100/cs---1.3 MIL 14890467 67 100/cs No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
56 gal
Pro Link liner, 38 x 60 Black R3860-200B-C 100/cs $ 0341% 3361 1% 33.61 100 Will not hold price
BG, TRSH, Width: 40 Length: 46 Mil: 1.2
Inteplast Color: Black Capacity: 40-45 Pack: 100 LD4046X2B
55 gal
IPro Link liner, 42 x 48 Clear -55 gal 100/cs---22 MIC 1128097 7 100/cs No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
56 gal
IPro Link liner, 42 x 48 Clear 100/cs $ 0.181% 262019% 26.20 150 Will not hold price
BG, TRSH, Width: 43 Length: 47 Mil: 1.0
Inteplast Color: Clear Capacity: 56 Pack: 100 LD64347XC
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8-10 gal

Pro Link liner, 24 x 24 Clear 10 gal 1000/cs---8 MIC 4928108 10 1000/cs No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
I 8-10 gal

Pro Link liner, 24 x 24 Clear 1000/cs | $ 0021% 16.43 1 $ 16.43 1000 Will not hold price

BG, LINR, Width: 24 Length: 33 Mic: 8 Mil:
0.31 Color: Natural Capacity: 12-16 Pack:

Inteplast 1000 HD243308N
33 gal
IPro Link liner, 33 x40 Black 4944 14 150/cs No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
I 34 gal
Pro Link liner, 33 x40 Black 150/cs $ 0151%$ 1517 1 $ 15.17 100 Will not hold price
BG, TRSH, Width: 33 Length: 40 Mil: 1.2
Inteplast Color: Black Capacity: 33 Pack: 150 LD3340X2B
Sanitary Products
Sanitor Neat Seat Covers NO SUBSTITUTE 9360 4 5000/cs $ 6040193 60.40 | $ 60.40 5000 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Stayfree Maxi Pads 6772 250/cs $ 0.141% 34.05| % 34.05 250 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
STAYFREE Maxi Pads 25131073 250/cs $0.127000 $31.75 $31.75
I'Naturelle Tampons 100193 500/cs $ 0.131$% 63.53 % 63.53 500 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
|NATURELLE Tampons 25176488 500/cs $0.107960 $53.98 $53.98
| Sanitary Napkin Waxed Bags T077) 4 250/cs  |'$ 0.09]$ 2152 |$ 21.52 250 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
HOSPECO Sanitary Napkin Waxed Bags HS6141 4 250/cs $0.055920 $13.98 $13.98
Spartan Urinal Disposable Floor Mats 13733 13 6/cs No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
MAT URINAL WASHROOMFRESH SCENT e e e —— ]
Impact BLACK 6/CS imp 1525-5 | | | | | | | | |
Kitchen Area
rSpartan Blue Glo Pot & Pan 9771 5 12/cs $ 008ls 26713 32.04 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Soft Suds Concentrated liquid soap for hand
dishwashing, premium quality, long lasting
Simoniz foam 53350012
rPurge Laundry Detergent 100075 6 50/Ibeach | ¢ 56.00 | $ 56.00 | $ 56.00 1 Will not hold price No-§id No-ﬁid No-ﬁid
Powdered detergent for the cost conscious,
Simoniz Perfect for volume laundry operations. C0597050
10/bx/cs
Impact Gloves (no powder) 7060 9 100/bx $ 0.041% 44219 44.20 10 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
10/bx/cs
TRADEX Gloves (no powder) V5201 9 100/bx $3.490000 $34.90 $34.90
\Westchester Gloves (no powder) 28001/L
10/bx/cs
Gloves (with powder) 8605L 5 Blue $ 0.041% 40719 40.70 10 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
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10/bx/cs
TRADEX Gloves (with powder) V5101 5 Blue $3.450000 $34.50 $34.50
10/bx/cs
\Westchester Gloves (with powder) 8605L 5 Blue
41b

Peck's Super Pexide Dish Detergent 8577 5 container | $ 6.7813% 6.78 1% 27.12 4 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Multi Purpose
ICS One Better Germicidal Disinfectant Cleaner 4408 5 12/cs $ 0.151$% 3.011$% 36.12 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

ANTIMICROBIAL ALL-PURPOSE
Simoniz DISINFECTANT N2635004
Spartan Tough Duty - Non-Butyl 9614 1 12/cs $ 0.081% 2491% 29.88 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

Easy Clean NB Non-Butyl, extra heavy-duty
Simoniz ready-to-use cleaner/degreaser. W4320012
Spartan ASAP Multi Purpose Cleaner 9611 4 12/cs $ 0071s 22713 27.24 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Spartan Glass Cleaner w/ammonia 9670 6 12/cs $ 0071% 2271% 27.24 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Simoniz Glass Cleaner w/ammonia B0412012
Spartan Concentrated Window Cleaner NO ammonia 9570 1 4/cs $ 0.291% 9.331% 111.96 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Auto Chior cM-24 (AR Ry 2lcase — ———— —— ———————————— ————————————  ——————————— ———————————— |

BRITE PLUS Glass, Window and All-Purpose

Cleaner Dilution: 1:8 Concentrated and non-
Simoniz streaking. 4x1 gal/case B0405004
rSpartan Fast and Easy Hard Surface/Glass 9673] 11 qtl2/cs |3 00713 211 1% 25.32 12 Will not hold price No-§id No-ﬁid No-ﬁid
I‘Simoniz BRITE Glass And All-Purpose Cleaner B0400012
Pro Link Pro-Link Steel Cleaner Oil base 71803 11 12/cs $ 02313 45913 55.08 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
CHASE Pro-Link Steel Cleaner Oil base 4111 11 12/cs $2.498333 $29.98 $29.98
Simoniz STAINLESS STEEL POLISH & CLEANER S$3336012
Comet Cleanser-powdered 8818 24/cs $ 009[% 1.791$ 42.96 24 Will not hold price No-Eid No-Bid No-Bid
Spartan HDQC2 #2 Neutral Disinfectant 9721 2 21t4/cs |3 01413 952 1% 38.08 4 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Simoniz Nutral Cleaner #2 B0439065
IClorox Sanitizing Wipes in Canister 162609 18 6 tubs/cs
CLOROX Sanitizing Wipes in Canister 15948 18 6 tubs/cs e — $5.990000 $35.94 $35.94
IClorox Wipes Lemon Scent 126971 6 12/cs $ 0.0813% 34311% 34.31 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
CLOROX Wipes Lemon Scent 1593 6 12/cs $3.331666 $39.98 $39.98
|Boardwalk DISINF WIPE 75CT WIPESLEMON 6 BWK 355-W75
IMotsenbocker's Lift Off 3 Stain Remover 8439 1qt/6es | $ 0411% 13.021$% 78.12 6 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
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Floor Cleaner
rSpartan DMQ Cleaner 9595 19 gal 4/cs $ 0.06 79213% 31.68 4 Will not hold price No-§id No-Bid No-Bid
Simoniz Quat 64 Lemon Q3018004
Spartan 106004 PSQ Disinfectant 9741 2 lgaleach | g 0.08 977 13% 39.08 4 Will not hold price No-§id No-Bid No-Bid
Quat 64 Pine One step, germicidal detergent/
deodorant/disinfectant. Pseudomonacidal,
staphylocidal, salmonellacidal, bactericidal,
Simoniz mildew static, fungicidal, virucidal. Q3019004
Tor ke ———————— W ——m
Stearns Floor Neutralizer 9998 3 72/cs $ 0.40 0.401% 34.29 72 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Ap-7 Liquid, neutral for everyday cleaning of
1P2666004 floors, walls and other hard surfaces. P2666004
Spartan Floor Wax 9875 5 gal bucket] $ 7062 | $ 70.62 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Premier Floor finish, fast drying, non-slip,
detergent and black mark resistant. Higher
solids version of Premier. Extended wear
Simoniz finish CS065005
fProf Floor Cleaner & Degreaser 7275 4/cs $ 0.18 2277 1% 91.08 4 Will not hold price No-ﬁid No-Bid No-Bid
Auto Chlor Auto Floor Kitchen & Concrete Degreaser A0178280 4/case
SHOP BOSS Non-butyl, industrial strength,
solvent cleaner/degreaser for use in dip tanks,
pressure washers, steam cleaners or spray and
Simoniz wipe applications. 53252004
rSpartan Floor Stripper 9927| lgaleach | ¢ 0.09 1142 $ 46.39 4 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Release Heavy-duty floor stripper for metal
link polishes, no scrub. Contains potassium
Simoniz hydroxide. R3025004
50z pkg
Stearns Floor-Concept 915 Ice Melt Remover 9997 36/cs $ 0.67 0671% 24.12 36 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Spartan White Sun Spartan High-Gloss Floor Wax 103026 2 4/cx $ 0.10 13.04 | $ 52.16 4 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Premier Plus Floor finish, fast drying, non-
slip, detergent and black mark resistant.
Higher solids version of Premier. Extended
Simoniz wear finish CS0653005
rSpartan Floor Stripper 9930 5gal $ 0.08 53.95 [ $ 53.95 1 Will not hold price No-ﬁid No-Bid No-Bid
Release Heavy-duty floor stripper for metal
link polishes, no scrub. Contains potassium
sl hydroxide. R3025005 — |
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1 0z pkg
Stearns Floor Cleaner 168155 1 72/cs $ 0271% 0271% 40.80 180 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Misc
Impact Trigger Sprayers 6917 5 320zeach | ¢ 0581% 0581% 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Impact Bottles 6922 4 320zeach | ¢ 0711% 071 1% Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Impact Trigger Sprayers 6916 240zeach | ¢ 0581% 0581% Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Impact Bottles @2(_)' 240zeach | ¢ 0591% 0591% Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
rPro Link Mop Heads 157816 2 12/cs $ 3591% 3591% 43.08 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Continental Mop handles 155361 1 each No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
\White 84 Speed Change Handle 84 1 each 12.05 12.05 144.6 12 Will not hold price e ——
Gerpress Mop handles 6188| 1 each 15.5 15.5 186 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Golden Star Dust Mops 61438 3 12/cs $ 41419% 41413 49.68 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Texas Feather 5usters 10398 each $ 9821% 98213% 117.84 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Technical Concepts |Pulse Il Automatic Aerosol Dispenser 10050 each $ 49131 $ 491313 294.78 6 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
3M 20" Niagara Black Strip Pad 124661 5/cs $ 4669 46619 23.30 5 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
3M 19" Niagara Black Strip Oad 124662 5/cs $ 4163 4161 $ 20.80 5 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Rubbermaid E238 Blue Bend Mop 201116 240zeach | ¢ 63213% 6.321% 75.84 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
| Tanner Leather Cleaner/Conditional 5471 80z 12/cs | $ 0601$ 559 1% 67.08 12 Will not hold price No-Eid No-Bid No-Bid
Old English Old English Wipes each $ 3.741% 3741 % 22.44 6 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Murphy's Murphy's Oil Soap 7824 2 logal 4/cs | $ 01213 1579 1% 63.65 4 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
10# Box White Terry Towels Hand Towel Size 128057 5 10# $ 30951 $ 30.95 | $ 30.95 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
25# White Tee Shirt Rags 4778 25# $ 3653 $ 3653 $ 36.53 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
3M 3M #96 Scouring Pad 7581 3 20/box $ 054193 054 1% 10.80 20 Will not hold price $0.557500 $11.15 $11.15
[3M 3M 20" White Polish Pads 7656 case $ 6.0313% 6.0313% 30.15 5 Will not hold price No-Eid No-aid No-aid
3M 3M 20" White Bufﬁng Pads 12652 1 case $ 6.0313% 6.031% 30.15 5 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
3M 3M 20" White Buffing Pads 4100-20" 1 case $5.198000 $25.99 $25.99
Georgia Pacific A2 Ultimatic Grey Aire
|Georgia Pacific Dispenser 6276 $ 12001 $ 1200 | $ 144.00 12 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
ICarroll Carroll Car Wash-Wash & Wax 110432 4 4/cs 9% 1151% 4604% 4 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
AUTO FOAM High Foaming Economical
Simoniz Vehicle Wash and Wax A0200004
44-55 gal
Hold-it Band-It Liner Holder 6559 7 36/cs $ 1581% 1581% 56.88 36 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Versamatic Vac Part #5359 HE (Grommet) 5659 $ 16113% 1.61 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Exhaust Filter part #1878 1878 9 $ 5851% 5.85 No-Bid Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Windsor Filter Bag part 140168 140168 8 $ 54.37 | $ 54.37 No-Bid 10 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Microfilter part #5301ER 5301 1 $ 17.471% 47.47 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
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\Windsor Motor part F40220L 4027 $ 197.08 | $ 197.08 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor O Ring part #5116 5116 Not a valid part no. No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Eid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor O Ring part #4024 4024 $ 71313% 7.13 No-Bid Will not hold price No-Eid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor O Ring part #5463 100137| $ 1459 | $ 14.59 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Screws part #0105 #0105 $ 08915% 0.89 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Eid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Wheels part #2458 2458] $ 1094 | $ 10.94 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Motor Pulley part #2025 2025 $ 6.7713% 6.77 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Eid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Roller Ends part #2047 204 7| $ 10121 % 10.12 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Eid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Roller Ends part #2001 2001 $ 15.26 | $ 15.26 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Castex Brushes part #4028 11079 5 each $ 8871$ 8.87 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Roller Brush Replacement part #4033ER 4033 $ 75.46 1 % 75.46 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Filter (Motor) part #?5143 5143] $ 7341 3% 7.34 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No—Eid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Filter part #1825 24398 $ 7691$ 7.69 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No—Eid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Cable Part #23011 10952 3 $ 23.14 1% 23.14 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Brush Roller Part #52/6WI 18615 1 $ 3541 1% 35.41 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Support Lever Part #5129 11112 $ 13811% 13.81 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
\Windsor Support Spring Part #5107 12062 $ 1.451$% 1.45 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Windsor paper Bag Sensor 5300 5 10/pkg | '$ 1377 | $ 13.77 No-Bid 1 Will not hold price No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
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a Florida Auto Chlor System John Deere Landscapes-Clevland, OH Michigan
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING| COMPONENT
CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
12 120z CANS 15.00%
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
12 120z CANS 15.00%
_— ———— ————————— ————  — —— ————— ————————————————— —————————————————— |
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
12 120z CANS 15.00%
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid 0.42
100 EA 15.00%
e e e e e —— ———————— ——— —————————————— ————————— ————————————
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
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a Florida Auto Chlor System John Deere Landscapes-Clevland, OH Michigan
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT
CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Big No-Big No-Bid No-Big No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

[ 30BX (100/BX) 15.00%
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Big No-Big No-Bid No-Big No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

| 6 EA 15.00% 3.17 1899 1% 113.94 6 EA 15.00% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No—ﬁid No-Bid
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a Florida Auto Chlor System John Deere Landscapes-Clevland, OH Michigan
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT
CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
each| $ 1255] $ 75.30 6/800ml bags 3.00%)
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

= __________________________ |
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a Florida Auto Chlor System John Deere Landscapes-Clevland, OH Michigan
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT
CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
| 250 EA 15.00%
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
| 500 EA 15.00%
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

| 250 EA

15.00%

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

10 BX 15.00%

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
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a Florida Auto Chlor System John Deere Landscapes-Clevland, OH Michigan
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING| COMPONENT
CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE
10 BX 15.00%
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
| 1 container] $ 359515 L 2x845 0z 3'00%=======
_— _— _— _— _— _— _— _— _— _—
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Big No-Big No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
| 12 200z CANS 15.00%
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 1.80
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No—ﬁid No-Bid
No Bid NoBid
| 6 TUB (75/TUB) 15.00%
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No—ﬁid No-Bid
12 CANS
(35/CAN) 15.00%
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
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a Florida Auto Chlor System John Deere Landscapes-Clevland, OH Michigan
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING| comPONENT YEAR BEGINNING| comPoONENT YEAR BEGINNING| COMPONENT
CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No—Eiid No-Bid No—gid No-Bid
1 gallon 1575 $ 63.00 4 gallons/case 3.00%
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No—ﬁid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No—ﬁid No-Bid
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a Florida Auto Chlor System John Deere Landscapes-Clevland, OH Michigan
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING| COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING| comPoONENT YEAR BEGINNING| COMPONENT
CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Eid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 0.42
No-Bid No-Eid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 0.42
No-Bid No-Eid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 0.42
No-Bid No-Eid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 0.32
No-Bid No-Eid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 2.27
 — — — - —  — — — — — —  — —  — — — _  — | — —— — | — —— — — —— —  — | — — — ——— — — — — ———  ———— — — — — — |

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 2.62
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 7.78
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

20 EA 15.00% $0.557500 $11.15 $1L.15 20 EA 15.00% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

[ SEA 15.00%

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No—Eid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No—§id No-Bid
No-Bid No—Eid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No—§id No-Bid
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a Florida Auto Chlor System John Deere Landscapes-Clevland, OH Michigan
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING| COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING| comPoONENT YEAR BEGINNING| COMPONENT
CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE
No-Bid No-BId No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-BId No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
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Poly Supplies-Wyandotte, M| Empire Interboro Packaging-Montgomery, NY
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING
CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 2601% 31.21 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 260]3% 31.21 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
@ i (‘S eidiiiiir;ian
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 2601$% 31.21 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 11.94 1% 11.94 1 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 0251% 44.18 180 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 17713 21.18 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
1.29] $ 15.53 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 0621% 62.00 100 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
e e e e e e——— ——— ———
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 17719 21.18 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
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Poly Supplies-Wyandotte, Ml Empire Interboro Packaging-Montgomery, NY
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING| COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING
CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3

$ 1.291% 15.53 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 1531% 9.18 6 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 17713 21.18 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 206]% 24.71 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 1771 % 21.18 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 1791 $ 21.46 12 5% No-aid No-ﬁid No-ﬁid No-§id No-ﬁid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Big No-Bid No-Big No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 0341% 32.24 96 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 1381 $ 16.58 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

$ 047 1% 16.89 36 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Big No-Bid No-Big No-Big No-Bid No-Big No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 3431% 20.59 6 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No—ﬁid No-Bid No-Bid No—ﬁid No-Bid
$ 17.65 | $ 17.65 1 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
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Poly Supplies-Wyandotte, M| Empire Interboro Packaging-Montgomery, NY
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING| COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING
CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid £y $ 324419 64.88 2 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid S $ 26.86 | $ 53.72 2 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid S $ 58.76 | $ 58.76 1 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid £ $ 18.13 1 $ 72.52 4 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid S $ 13271 % 39.81 3 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid B $ 12.79 | $ 38.36 3 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

$ 559 1% 22.35 4 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

$ 36.00 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 3534 |9 3534 | $ 35.34 500* 15.00%
$ 0.04]$ 20.41 500 5%

$ 39.00 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 36.82|$ 36.82 1% 36.82 500 15.00%
$ 0.09]1$% 14.20 150 5%

$ 33.00 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 2148 1% 2148 1% 21.48 100 15.00%

Y, P 3 S e 100 % e . . . |

$ 22.50 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 19.90 | $ 1990 | $ 19.90 100 15.00%
$ 013]1% 12.71 100 5%

$ 27.50 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 27213 27213 DN, 100* 15.00%
$ 017 | $ 16.59 100 5%
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Poly Supplies-Wyandotte, Ml Empire Interboro Packaging-Montgomery, NY
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING
CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3
$ 21.00 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 227213 27213 22.72 100* 15.00%
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
| _— |
$ 0.02 19.24 1000 5%
_— ——

$ 29.00 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 2382 1% 23.821% 23.82 150* 15.00%
$ 0.09 13.02 150 5%

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ 0.01 70.29 5000 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

$ 18.90 $ 0.13 33.00 250 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

$ 77.49 $ 0.13 63.12 500 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

3 T7.51 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

S 0.06 15.00 250 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Big No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

| I I $ 5.82 34.91 6 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

$ 1.77 21.18 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

3 20.06 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Big No-Big No-Bid No-Bid

$ 0.47 23.53 50 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

$ 7.22 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

S 0.05 5.46 100 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
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Poly Supplies-Wyandotte, Ml Empire Interboro Packaging-Montgomery, NY
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING
CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
&y $ 0.06 5.93 100 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 1.74 20.89 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 1.37 16.38 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 1.47 17.65 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 5.67 22.68 4 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 157 18.78 12 5% No-§id No-§id No-§id No-§id No-ﬁid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 2.85 34.16 12 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
B $ 0.93 22.22 24 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No—ﬁid No-Bid
S 941 56.47 3 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ $ 458 27.46 6 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ $ 2.29 27.46 12 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No—ﬁid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
S 3.31 10.88 6 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

Page 21 of 24




Poly Supplies-Wyandotte, Ml Empire Interboro Packaging-Montgomery, NY
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING] COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING
CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

S 588 1% 2353 7 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

$ 5901]3% 23.58 4 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

—— ——————————————————————————

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

$ 3.8213% 15.29 4 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

$ 4821% 24.12 5 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

$ 3821% 15.29 4 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

$ 5881 3% 23.52 4 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No—ﬁid No-Bid

$ 941 1% 47.06 5 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No—ﬁid No-Bid

$ 47119 23.53 5 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

Page 22 of 24




Poly Supplies-Wyandotte, Ml Empire Interboro Packaging-Montgomery, NY
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING| comPONENT YEAR BEGINNING| COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING
CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ $ 025 s 4418 180 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
B $ 05615 0.56 1 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
B $ 05219 052 1 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
B $ 0565 0.56 1 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
B $ 041 1% 0.41 1 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid B $ 33719 2044 1 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
B S 6.26 15 6.26 1 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
3 S 5781 $ 5.78 1 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $ $ 5831% 70.00 12 5'% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
B S 87215 8.72 1 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid B $ 1018 | $ 50.88 5 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid 5 $ 929]'$ 46.47 5 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid £y $ 2651% 26.47 10 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid B $ 1001 25.00 25 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid B $ 048 $ 9.65 20 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
3 19.25 B B 52919 26.47 5 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid B S 5291 % 26.47 5 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
$ 4921% 19.67 4 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No—ﬁid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No—ﬁid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid B $ 63219 6.32 1 5% No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
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Poly Supplies-Wyandotte, Ml Empire Interboro Packaging-Montgomery, NY
PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
INCREASE PER INCREASE PER INCREASE PER
YEAR BEGINNING| COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING| COMPONENT YEAR BEGINNING
CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3 PRICE UNIT PRICE CASE PRICE CASE PACK AT YEAR 3
No-BId No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
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