

City of Rochester Hills, Michigan												
Project: Aggregates (Road Gravel) 2013 and 2014												
ITB-RH-13-009 Tabulation												
Bid Names Read: February 28, 2013 @ 3:00 PM												
<b>Name:</b>			Edw. C. Levy Co.	Glenn Eisenhardt Excavating	Osburn Industries, Inc	Gary's Transport Inc	Tri-City Aggregates, Inc					
<b>Address:</b>			8800 Dix Avenue	550 E Leonard Rd	5850 Pardee Road	54255 Card Rd	PO Box 182					
			Dearborn, MI 48209-1093	Leonard, MI 48367	Taylor, MI 48180	Macomb, MI 48042	Holly, MI 48442					
			2013	2014	2013	2014	2013	2014	2013	2014	2013	2014
			Per Ton	Per Ton	Per Ton	Per Ton	Per Ton	Per Ton	Per Ton	Per Ton	Per Ton	Per Ton
21AA Road Gravel			\$14.17**	\$14.17**	\$ 15.80	\$ 16.30	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
			BID ALTERNATE: 21AC									
22A Road Gravel			\$ 9.85	\$ 9.85	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.70	\$ 10.40	\$ 10.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.65	\$ 8.75
5G Slag			\$ 14.13	\$ 14.13	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.35	\$ 16.00	\$ 14.50	\$ 14.75	No Bid	No Bid
22X Slag			\$8.19**	\$8.19**	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.70	\$ 10.10	\$ 7.92	\$ 8.17	No Bid	No Bid
			BID ALTERNATE: 22X SF									
** denotes alternate bid			Does not meet MDOT Spec Per Vendor Noted Exception									
Accept MasterCard			Yes		No		No		No		Yes	
Payments Terms, Discounts			Net 30 days								None	
Preferred Payment Method			None		Check		ACH		Check		ACH	