City of Rochester Hills, Michigan

1TB-RH-07-003 Tabulation

Bid Names Read: January 9, 2007 @ 2:00 PM

Name:

MidTown Aggregates

Address:

11825 Green Qaks Ind. Drive

BID FORM A: 2200 Tons Bituminous Mixture

Whitmore Lake, Ml 48189

B&WwW rm:amomvm Supply

mef North Avenue

[Richmond Transport, |
4020 County Line

Osbhurmn m:agw:_mm

~>hmx Z_m.hm:ma Ooaoﬁm:o:,

O__Ro: ﬁzv. _<= 48036

Lenox, Ml 48050

5850 Pardee

830 Kirts Blvd. Suite #100

Troy,| Ml »mo,m»

Taylor, Ml 48180
. |

No Bid

44.00

Gary's Transport Inc.

Barrett Paving Materials

Edw. C. Levy Co.

No Bid

Tri-City Aggreagates

Address:

54255 Card Rd.

2040 Barrett Rd.

8800 Dix Avenue

P.o. Box 182

BID FORM A: 550 Tons Bituminaus Mixture | No Bid No Bid No Bid [NoBid  |No Bid .
BID FORM A: 120 Gallons Bituminous Bond Coat No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid ~4.00 4.00
BIiD FORM B: 10,000 Tons - 22A Road Gravel 9.66 9.86 8.30 8.80 9.40 975 |NoBid  |No Bid
BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - G Slag 13.37 13.67 13.30 13.80 | 1325 | 1325 INoBid |NoBid
BID FORM m 1,500 Tons - 22X Slag 8.79 8.93 7.50 8.00 7.75 7.75 No Bid

No Bid

Cadillac Asphalt LLC

51777 W. 12 Mile Rd.

gmoogc M gmoaw

Troy, Ml 480 &

Detroit, Ml bmmow

40.00*

No Bid

Holly, MI 48442
v

Wixom, MI 48353
|

BID FORM A: 2200 Tons WMEB_so:m Mixture ) No Bid No Bid Zo Bid
BID FORM A: 550 Tons mmﬁag_:Ocm Mixture | No Bid No Bid 40.00* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BID FORM A: 120 Galions Bituminous Bond Coat No Bid No Bid 2.25% No Bid No Bid  INo Bid No Bid  |No Bid No Bid
BID FORM B: 10,000 Tons - 22A Road Gravel 0.00 0.00 No Bid ' 8.82 8.82 880 | 9.00 |[No Bid No Bid
BID FORM B: 1 500 Tons - G m_m@ B 13.20 13.20 No Bid 13.04 13.04 |{No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - 22X Slag 7.67 7.67 No Bid 7.77 7.77 |NoBid |NoBid [NoBid |No Bid
No Bid No Bid 93.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 75.00 80.00

m__u_uo_ﬂso”mmo,_.o:mw_ﬁcgfocmg_xﬁcﬂm

* Materials Picked Up at Plant in City Trucks; These

Name:

John D, Omcoﬁ:m Trucking Inc.

"u_mzﬁ in Cit ._.En_a

prices good tifl Dec 31,2007; Hot mix mu_oxmg up mﬁ Troy

Address:

37500 Northline

BID FORM A: 2200 Tons Bituminous _smxﬂc.,m

Romulus, M AW:E

No Bid No Bid

BID FORM A: 550 Tons Bituminous Mixture] ~ |No Bid No Bid
BID FORM A: 120 Gallons Bituminous Bond Coat No Bid No Bid

BID FORM B: 10,000 Tons - 22A Road Gravel 8.60 9.10

BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - G Slag . 13.30 13.80

BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - 22X Slag 7.95 8.45

BID FORM C: 250 Tons Bituminous Mixture No Bid No Bid




