
ITB-RH-06-032
WATER SERVICE AND REPAIR PARTS COST 
Cost Comparison - Brass Only Etna Supply Cambridge Brass

Past 
Usage Bid Price Ext Cost Bid Price Ext Cost Bid Price Ext Cost

Cost Diff 
between SLC 
& Cambridge

BRASS WATER TAP MATERIALS
Estimated Quantities - Description:
500 Ford 1" B44-444 PJ-Cts Curb Stops
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 525 47.31$       24,837.75$  57.00$       29,925.00$    43.53$     22,853.25$    (1,984.50)$    
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 50.06$     
500 Ford 1" F1000 Pack Joint Cts Copper
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 375 24.07$       9,026.25$    29.00$       10,875.00$    23.48$     8,805.00$      (221.25)$       
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 27.02$     
50 Ford 1" FB600 Flare Ball Corp Stops
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 35 28.64$       1,002.40$    34.50$       1,207.50$      27.43$     960.05$         (42.35)$         
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 31.45$     
50  Ford 1" F600 Flare Corp
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 99 22.61$       2,238.39$    27.25$       2,697.75$      22.05$     2,182.95$      (55.44)$         
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 25.36$     
50 Ford Couplers C44-44
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 74 9.93$         734.82$       12.00$       888.00$         9.64$       713.36$         (21.46)$         
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 11.09$     
50 Ford 1" to 3/4" Couplers C44-43
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 30 10.08$       302.40$       12.25$       367.50$         9.87$       296.10$         (6.30)$           
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 11.35$     
50 Ford 1 1/2" Couplers C44-66
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 24 30.36$       728.64$       36.50$       876.00$         29.46$     707.04$         (21.60)$         
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 33.88$     
200 Ford 1 1/2" B44-666 PJ-CTS Curb Stops
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 30 103.50$     3,105.00$    124.50$     3,735.00$      100.53$   3,015.90$      (89.10)$         
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 115.61$   
200 Ford 1 1/2" FB1000 Ball Corp Stop Cts
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 100 61.95$       6,195.00$    74.50$       7,450.00$      61.50$     6,150.00$      (45.00)$         
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 73.80$     
100 Ford 2" B44-777 PJ-Cts Curb Stops
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 40 145.52$     5,820.80$    175.00$     7,000.00$      137.21$   5,488.40$      (332.40)$       
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 157.79$   
100 Ford 2" FB1000 Ball Corp Stop Cts
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 20 102.46$     2,049.20$    123.30$     2,466.00$      97.07$     1,941.40$      (107.80)$       
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 111.63$   
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500 Ford 6 x 1" SS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 30 35.86$       1,075.80$    43.10$       1,293.00$      63.36$     1,900.80$      825.00$        
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 72.86$     
200 Ford 6 x 1 1/2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 30 71.99$       2,159.70$    86.55$       2,596.50$      72.45$     2,173.50$      13.80$          
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 83.32$     
100 Ford 6 x 2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 30 79.11$       2,373.30$    95.10$       2,853.00$      79.60$     2,388.00$      14.70$          
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 91.54$     
500 Ford 8 x 1 SS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 300 45.71$       13,713.00$  55.00$       16,500.00$    78.43$     23,529.00$    9,816.00$     
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 90.19$     
200 Ford 8 x 1 1/2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 50 82.05$       4,102.50$    98.60$       4,930.00$      82.56$     4,128.00$      25.50$          
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 94.83$     
100 Ford 8 x 2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 50 89.32$       4,466.00$    107.35$     5,367.50$      89.88$     4,494.00$      28.00$          
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 103.36$   
500 Ford 12 x 1" SS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 25 63.70$       1,592.50$    76.55$       1,913.75$      113.70$   2,842.50$      1,250.00$     
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 130.75$   
200 Ford 12 x 1 1/2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 30 127.45$     3,823.50$    153.20$     4,596.00$      128.24$   3,847.20$      23.70$          
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 147.78$   
100 Ford 12 x 2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  8/1/2006-7/31/2007 30 129.74$     3,892.20$    156.00$     4,680.00$      130.58$   3,917.40$      25.20$          
      Unit Price:  8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 150.17$   

93,239.15$  112,217.50$  102,333.85$  


