Name	П В-RH-06-037					
Coloba Extens 2800	September 8, 2006 @ 3:00 p.m.	Name	Name	Name	Name	Name
Address: 250281 Stendale 260281 Stendale 260381 Van Diyke Awa 5020 92nd Sti SE P.O. Box 809 1		Global Extreme		Etna Supply	Kennedy Industries, Inc.	JGM/Valve Corporation
Reaction of Miles	Address		28838 Van Dyke Ave.	529 32nd St SE	P.O. Box 809	1155 Welch RoadSte D
Specifications and Cost Proposal Atm: Mark Urorey Atm: M. Merzwinski Atm: Atm: Atm: Atm: Atm: Atm: Atm: Atm:			Warren, MI 48093	Wyoming, MI 49548	Milford, MI 48381	Commerce, MI 48390-2818
Series 600 Swing Check Valve Series 600 Swing Check Valve Unit Price: \$5,802,00 X 3= Unit Price: \$2,551,04 X 3= Unit Price: \$4405 X 3= V0 BID 20 Unit Price: \$ X 3 = \$17,406.00 VCS 21 Unit Price: \$2,7653,12 VCS 22 Unit Price: \$2,255,00 X 4= V0 BID 23 Unit Price: \$2,255,00 X 4= V0 BID 24 Unit Price: \$2,255,00 X 4= V0 BID 25 Unit Price: \$2,255,00 X 4= V0 BID 26 Unit Price: \$3,365,00 X 4= Unit Price: \$3,365,00 X 4= Unit Price: \$3,365,00 X 4= Unit Price: \$13,540.00 VCS 26 VCS 27 Unit Price: \$2,255,00 X 4= V0 BID 28 VCS 29 Unit Price: \$2,255,00 X 4= V0 BID 29 VCS 20	General Specifications and Cost Proposal	Patti. Main Olorey	Aut. W. WINIEWHON			
Series 800 Swing Check Valve Unit Price: \$5.802.00 X3= Unit Price: \$4405 x3= Leading No BID Strates No BID	Manufacturer: American Flow Control					
Dunit Price: \$2,5602.00 X3=	Model: Series 600 Swing Check Valve					
Unit Price: \$x3 = Unit Price: \$802_00 X3= Unit Price: \$\$4405 X3 = Unit Price: \$\$4405 X3 = NO BID eation Met: NO NO YES NO BID NO BID Pug) Valve Unit Price: \$2259.00 X4= Unit Price: \$33,385.00 X4= Unit Price: \$35,544.00 \$	Size: 12"					See Attached Quotation:
Unit Price: \$ x3 = \$17,406.00 \$7,653.12 \$13,215.00 NO BID Eation Met: NO NO YES VES Incturer: DeZurik/Copes-Vulcan VES VES VES Plug Valive Unit Price: \$2.256.00 x 4= Unit Price: \$3.385.00 x 4= Unit Price: \$1886 x 4= Unit Price: \$ \$9,036.00 NO BID \$13,540.00 \$7,544.00 2xitor Replacement Valives \$26,442.00 \$7,653.12 \$26,755.00 \$7,544.00 2xitor Proposal is inclusive of shipping: \$26,442.00 \$7,653.12 \$26,755.00 \$7,544.00	Qty: 3	Unit Price: \$5,802.00 X 3=	Unit Price: \$2,551			\$3,707.00 (ea) Different Series
Vurik/Copes-Vulcan NO NO YES Ves Ce: \$ x4 = Unit Price: \$3,385.00 x 4= Unit Price: \$1886 x 4 = Unit Price: \$1886 x 4 = Acc: \$ x4 = \$30,36.00 NO BID YES YES Iacoment Valves \$26,442.00 \$7,653.12 \$26,755.00 \$7,544.00 al is inclusive of shipping: \$26,442.00 \$7,653.12 \$26,755.00 \$7,544.00	Unit Price: \$x3	\$17,406.00	\$7,653.12	\$13,215.00	NO BID	\$2,640.00 (ea) Different Series
Zurik/Copes-Vulcan Unit Price: \$2.259.00 x 4= Unit Price: \$3.385.00 x 4= Unit Price: \$1886 x 4 = ce: \$ x 4 = \$9.036.00 NO BID \$13,540.00 \$7,544.00 lacement Valves \$26,442.00 \$7,653.12 \$26,755.00 \$7,544.00 al is inclusive of shipping: \$7,653.12 \$26,755.00 \$7,544.00	Specification Met:	NO	NO	YES		NO
Unit Price: \$2,259,00 x 4= Unit Price: \$3,385,00 x 4= Unit Price: \$1886 x 4 = \$1,544,00	Manufacturar: Dazurik/Canac-Muloan					
Oce: \$	Model: Plug Valve					
Unit Price: \$2,259.00 x 4=	Size: 12"					
\$9,036.00 NO BID \$13,540.00 \$7,544.00 NO YES YES YES \$26,442.00 \$7,653.12 \$26,755.00 \$7,544.00 \$1,544.00 \$1,653.12 \$26,755.00 \$1,544.00		Unit Price: \$2,259.00 x 4=		Unit Price: \$3,385.00 x 4	Unit Price: \$1886 x 4	- And Andrews
NO YES YES \$26,442.00 \$7,653.12 \$26,755.00 \$7,544.00	\$x4	\$9,036.00	NO BID	\$13,540.00		NO BID
\$26,442.00 \$7,653.12 \$26,755.00 \$7,544.00	Specification Met:	NO		YES	YES	
	Total Cost of Replacement Valves	\$26,442.00	\$7,653.12	\$26,755.00	\$7,544.00	\$0.00
	*Total Cost Proposal is inclusive of shipping:					