

<b>City of Rochester Hills, MI</b>	<b>Fitness Things</b>	<b>Legend Fitness</b>	<b>G&amp;G Fitness Equipment Inc.</b>
<b>Exercise Equipment for Fire Stations</b>	<b>Did not provide address</b>	<b>5901 Middlebrook Pike</b>	<b>7350 Transit Rd.</b>
<b>RFP-RH-16-040</b>		<b>Knoxville, TN 37909</b>	<b>Williamsville, NY 14221</b>
Type of organization:	Information not provided	Information not provided	Corporation
Firm established:	Information not provided	Information not provided	1990
Years company has been providing exercise equipment?	32 Years	Information not provided	Has been providing fitness equipment for 26 years. Starting with retail stores then moving to Commercial equipment.
Minimum of five (5) client references.	Northville Twp. Fire Department Rob McAllister, Firefighter-810-965-2072	Tennessee Tech University Casey Kramer, Strength & Conditioning-931-372-6278	Clinton Twp. Fire Department Mike Phy Sold equipment, delivered and installed
	Dearborn Community Center Erica Lyght, Assistant Recreation Director-313-943-2191	Southern Illinois University Meade Smith, Strength & Conditioning-314-698-1554	St. Clair Fire Department -Eric Retzbach Purchased New Life Fitness cardio and hammer strength equipment for stations. Delivered and installed.
	Great Lakes Athletic Club Rob McIntyre, Athletic Director-248-393-3082	Vanderbilt University Darren Edgington, Strength & Conditioning-615-766-6432	Sterling Heights Fire Department-James Buhlinger Purchased fitness accessories and delivered.
		Tennessee Titans Steve Watterson, Strength & Conditioning-615-565-4000	Dearborn Fire Department-Joey Thorington Purchased new fitness equipment for Training Center and Station. Delivering and installing soon.
		Jacksonville Jaguars Tom Myslinski, Strength & Conditioning-904-633-6557	Zaragon Inc.-Rick Zaragon Supply, deliver and install fitness equipment for student housing in Michigan.
Explain process used to ensure that City staff is fully trained. If there are subcontractors involved, please identify subcontractor's name and experience.	Vendor will bring a certified personal trainer that specializes in corrective exercises to focus on preventative and corrective routines that are tailored specifically to the end users. By end of sessions, the fire fighters will be educated how to use the product and how to use it most effectively.	Vendor will be onsite during the installs and will provide the information regarding use of equipment, maintenance and any questions the stations have. Will also provide a digital and hard copy of their maintenance guidelines.	Training will be organized with contact person (Steve Wisniewski) and FD. They will set a date and time for the training after equipment is delivered and installed.
Describe the warranty terms, and procedures to be followed if a warranty claim is filed.	Warranty terms are on literature provided. Warranty is back by Fitness Things factory trained technicians. Vendor states a quote for maintenance is on a separate page. Not included in the pack. Response says they anticipate the cost to be \$475 per year for the 4 stations if all of the maintenances can be done in one day.	Limited lifetime warranty-structural welds and frames Five year warranty-bronze bushings, pillow block bearings and pulley wheels. One year warranty-cables, weight plates, guide rods, sealer roller bearings. Ninety-day warranty-upholstery and grips.	Warranty varies by equipment and is provided separately along with quotes.

<b>City of Rochester Hills, MI</b>	<b>Fitness Things</b>	<b>Legend Fitness</b>	<b>G&amp;G Fitness Equipment Inc.</b>
<b>Exercise Equipment for Fire Stations</b>	<b>Did not provide address</b>	<b>5901 Middlebrook Pike</b>	<b>7350 Transit Rd.</b>
<b>RFP-RH-16-040</b>		<b>Knoxville, TN 37909</b>	<b>Williamsville, NY 14221</b>
Please describe maintenance programs.	Information not provided	Information not provided	All maintenance programs are sold separate from the equipment. These would need to be discussed after equipment is purchased and decide on best maintenance routine for the equipment.
Indicate estimated delivery date after receipt of City's order. Explain how the equipment will arrive and how it will be unloaded.	Information not provided	Delivery time after ARO is 60 days	ETA is 8 weeks after order is placed, but might be shorter depending on numbers of orders are ahead in on the FD order.
List any exceptions/alternates to the specifications contained in this RFP.	Nothing listed		All equipment is a different brand but equivalent comparison.
Specifications/literature for proposed equipment included?	No. Web links are listed on vendor response.	Yes	Yes
Initialed to acknowledge that delivery is to be FOB:	No	Yes	Initialed
Does your company accept MasterCard?	Information not provided	Yes	Yes
If yes, please state any applicable discounts, fees, etc for this payment.	Information not provided		2% fee for orders over \$10,000
Desired payment method:	Information not provided	ACH	Check
Additional information or points not addressed.	Information not provided		

<b>City of Rochester Hills, MI</b>	<b>BSN Sports</b>	<b>Direct Fitness Solutions, LLC</b>	<b>Pro Maxima</b>
<b>Exercise Equipment for Fire Stations</b>	<b>P.O. Box 7726</b>	<b>600 Tower Road</b>	<b>5310 Ashbrook Dr.</b>
<b>RFP-RH-16-040</b>	<b>Dallas, TX 75209</b>	<b>Mundelein, IL 60060</b>	<b>Houston, TX 77081</b>
Type of organization:	Corporation	Corporation LLC	Partnership
Firm established:	1982	1998	1971
Years company has been providing exercise equipment?	Has been supplying fitness equipment for over 30 years to the US market. They currently brand under the Champion Barbel and Wilder Fitness banners.	Was formed in 1998 with the founding principle providing customers with quality fitness equipment combined with commitment to service and support. Today they are the largest commercial fitness equipment dealer in the Midwest. Currently serve customers in Michigan, Indiana, Kentucky, Tennessee, Wisconsin, Illinois, and Northern Ohio.	Pro Maxima has been manufacturing and installing strength equipment for 45 years. They supply all types of facilities commercial grade equipment worldwide.
Minimum of five (5) client references.	University of Mary Washington Kunle Lawson, 540-654-1039 or alawson2@umw.edu Weight racks and retrofit platform into existing flooring.	Southfield Fire Department- Brent Wilson 248-884-2529 Provided strength and cardio equipment and service.	Pittsburgh State University-Kendall Gammon 913-284-6515 Installed 11,000 square foot training center.
	La Vega High School Don Hyde, 254-223-7272 Full weight room	Macomb Recreation Center -Gina Muszynski 586-992-2905 Provided cardio equipment as well as service since 2010	University of Central Missouri-Scott Thomason 660-543-4011 Installed strength equipment-football programs
	Sullivan High School Chad Adams, Principal 773-972-4555 Weight room	Sterling Heights Fire Department-Rob Duke 586-446-2991 Purchased seven precor treadmills in 2015. They also service them.	Fresno State University-Johnny Olguin 559-389-1905 Installed strength equipment
	Kenwood High School Dr. Greg Jones, Principal 773-535-1350 Weight room	Novi High School-Brian Gordon 248-449-1506 Purchased 28,000 pounds of TAG plates, dumb bells, and accessories in Spring of 2016.	Hinds Community College-Ben Dew 601-953-3091 Equipment and flooring-football and basketball programs
	Junction City High School Matt Westerhaus, 785-717-4226 Full weight room	Novi Ice Arena- Kris Barnes 248-347-1010 They installed strengthen equipment for the arena in Fall of 2015.	Union High School- Kyle Friedrich 918-357-4323 Installed custom weight room
Explain process used to ensure that City staff is fully trained. If there are subcontractors involved, please identify subcontractor's name and experience.	All training will be done by BSN outside sale Pros. They will be available to demonstrate the use of machines and to answer any questions. The BSN sales account assigned to City would be Tim Gignac.	Training equipment will be conducted by Mark Kwiatkowski, the regional sales manager for Direct Fitness in SE Michigan. Mark will conduct training sessions with different stations as needed to make sure all firefighters are trained. If that means conducting multiple sessions per station, no problem. They are flexible to make sure it is done correctly.	Promaxima factory trained technicians will provide training and how to operate the machines at the time of installation.
Describe the warranty terms, and procedures to be followed if a warranty claim is filed.	Warranty on Stairmaster Equipment-15 yrs on frame, 2 yrs on parts, 1 year on labor. Warranty on Spirit Fitness Equipment-Lifetime on the frame, 5 yr on electronics and parts, 2 yrs on labor. Warranty on all other products- 1 year standard manufacturer warranty.	Length of warranty and their terms vary by product. If service is needed, the RHFDD can contact DFS through Mark Kwiatkowski, 248-755-5748 or through their service department directly, 847-680-9300. See attached product sheets for warranty specific to equipment.	All warranty issues will go through Promaxima. Once a warranty issue has been called in Promaxima will have a verified technician respond within 24-48 hours.

City of Rochester Hills, MI	BSN Sports	Direct Fitness Solutions, LLC	Pro Maxima
Exercise Equipment for Fire Stations	P.O. Box 7726	600 Tower Road	5310 Ashbrook Dr.
RFP-RH-16-040	Dallas, TX 75209	Mundelein, IL 60060	Houston, TX 77081
Please describe maintenance programs.	At least once a year the BSN sales Pro will do a site visit to locations to check on the equipment and the conditions they are in. At that time he will <u>offer suggestions</u> as to improving or replacing worn items. Any items out of warranty is the City's responsibility to pay for and acquire. In the event that there are immediate maintenance to a specific machine, either the sales pro or customer service rep in Dallas will handle the warranty items paperwork. Photos will need to be taken and submitted to establish validity.	Maintenance program sheets detail the items and the price for maintenance plus a \$75 trip charge. Maintenance sheet lists what the maintenance entails per machine.	Offers preventative maintenance plans. Call for pricing options. Services provided for maintenance attached without prices.
Indicate estimated delivery date after receipt of City's order. Explain how the equipment will arrive and how it will be unloaded.	All weight machines will be truck shipped, scheduled to arrive at the same time or date requested. They will need a name and contact information for any individual wishing to meet the delivery truck. All other items will either be shipped common carrier or Fed Ex.	Delivery can be expected 4-6 weeks after receipt of the order. Delivery is done by DFS factory trained crews and trucks with lift gates.	Delivery time will be 30 day ARO. Will deliver the equipment on of their trucks and the equipment will be installed the same day by one of their factory trained techs.
List any exceptions/alternates to the specifications contained in this RFP.		No exceptions taken. Alternates are listed on price sheets. Note: Treadmill unit they are bidding is the exact same treadmill as the one specified. Pro Maxima private labels the treadmill they buy from Spirits parent company. The step mill specified is based on the SM916 that was discontinued in 2011. They are bidding the Stairmaster SM5, which succeed the SM916.	All items bid are the exact items specified.
Specifications/literature for proposed equipment included?	Vendor states to see specs all specs attached in their website <a href="http://www.bsnsports.com">www.bsnsports.com</a>	Yes	Yes
Initialed to acknowledge that delivery is to be FOB:	Yes	Initialed	Initialed
Does your company accept MasterCard?	Yes	Yes	Yes
If yes, please state any applicable discounts, fees, etc for this payment.		None	0 net 30
Desired payment method:	Credit Card	ACH	Credit Card
Additional information or points not addressed.			

Equipment Fire Station #1, 1111 Horizon Court, Rochester Hills, MI				Fitness Things Address not Provided			G&F Fitness 7350 Transit Road Williamsville, NY 14221			Legend Fitness 5901 Middlebrook Pike Knoxville, TN 37909			BSN Sports, LLC P.O. Box 7726 Dallas, TX 75209			Pro Maxima 5310 Ashrook Houston, TX 77081			All Pro 45255 5 Mile Plymouth, MI 48170			Direct Fitness 600 Tower Road Mundelein, IL 60060		
Equipment Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	Qty	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price
Outlaw Multi Rack System	Promaxima	CF-9300	1	Hoist Fitness Mi7-SMITH-ENS-PL	\$4,650.00	\$4,650.00	Body Solid GS348q4	\$2,049.00	\$2,049.00	Legend 3142-FT	\$4,165.50	\$4,165.50	No Bid		\$0.00		\$2,995.00	\$2,995.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Hoist M17 Function Training System	\$4,200.00	\$4,200.00
Club Rower, chain driven, 500 lb user weight	Promaxima	CV-1100	1	Body Craft VR400	\$895.00	\$895.00	Body Craft VR500	\$845.00	\$845.00	Concept 2 Model D Rower	\$842.39	\$842.39	BSN/Spirit #1390989	\$1,463.78	\$1,463.78		\$895.00	\$895.00	Concept 2	\$945.00	\$945.00	Concept 2 Model D	\$965.00	\$965.00
Assault Dual Action Air Bike	Promaxima	CV-AIR-A	1	Life Core AS-Assault G	\$850.00	\$850.00	AS-ASSAULTB	\$759.00	\$759.00	Schwinn Air Dyne AD Pro	\$725.00	\$725.00	BSN/Stairmaster #1388449	\$2,596.08	\$2,596.08		\$895.00	\$895.00	Schwinn Air Dyne Pro	\$945.00	\$945.00	Same as Spec	\$850.00	\$850.00
25 lb Rubber encased kettle bell with chrome handle	Promaxima	Kettle BPRO	1	Bodysport BDSKB25	\$53.50	\$53.50	UFG XM 04604	\$33.00	\$33.00	Troy Barbell CKB-025	\$40.63	\$40.63	BSN #1267297	\$48.87	\$48.87		\$31.25	\$31.25	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Kettlebell	\$44.00	\$44.00
35 lb Rubber encased kettle bell with chrome handle	Promaxima	Kettle BPRO	1	Bodysport BDSKB35	\$69.55	\$69.55	UFG XM 04605	\$45.00	\$45.00	Troy Barbell CKB-035	\$56.88	\$56.88	BSN #1267310	\$63.69	\$63.69		\$43.75	\$43.75	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Kettlebell	\$61.60	\$61.60
45 lb Rubber encased kettle bell with chrome handle	Promaxima	Kettle BPRO	1	Bodysport BDSKB45	\$91.90	\$91.90	UFG XM 04606	\$56.00	\$56.00	Troy Barbell CKB-045	\$73.13	\$73.13	BSN #1267334	\$74.98	\$74.98		\$56.25	\$56.25	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Kettlebell	\$79.20	\$79.20
50 lb Rubber encased kettle bell with chrome handle	Promaxima	Kettle BPRO	1	Bodysport BDSKB45	\$101.50	\$101.50	UFG XM 04607	\$65.00	\$65.00	Troy Barbell CKB-050	\$81.25	\$81.25	No Bid		\$0.00		\$62.50	\$62.50	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Kettlebell	\$88.00	\$88.00
Soft Medicine Ball 14 lb	Promaxima	11084	1	Dynamax DYM10014LB	\$94.95	\$94.95	UFG XM 100-3161	\$45.00	\$45.00	Troy PWB-014	\$47.50	\$47.50	BSN #PMTA1366	\$75.58	\$75.58		\$39.95	\$39.95	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy Leather Wall Ball	\$49.80	\$49.80
Soft Medicine Ball 20 lb	Promaxima	11087	1	Dynamax DYM10020LB	\$109.95	\$109.95	UFG XM 100-3162	\$50.00	\$50.00	Troy PWB-020	\$58.75	\$58.75	BSN #PMTA1369	\$92.49	\$92.49		\$47.95	\$47.95	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy Leather Wall Ball	\$102.00	\$102.00
15 lb Deluxe Medicine Ball	Promaxima	MB-015	1	Dynamax DYM10016LB	\$99.95	\$99.95	UFG 100-3068	\$42.00	\$42.00	Perform Better 2616	\$49.94	\$49.94	No Bid		\$0.00		\$48.50	\$48.50	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Medicine Ball	\$51.00	\$51.00
25 lb Deluxe Medicine Ball	Promaxima	MB-025	1	Dynamax DYM10025LB	\$119.95	\$119.95	UFG 100-3070	\$72.00	\$72.00	Perform Better 2619	\$73.69	\$73.69	No Bid		\$0.00		\$84.95	\$84.95	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Medicine Ball	\$77.00	\$77.00
Adjustable Deluxe Work Bench	Promaxima	FW-150	1	Hoist Fitness HF5165	\$375.00	\$375.00	Gronk 80027	\$249.00	\$249.00	Legend 3103	\$462.50	\$462.50	No Bid		\$0.00		\$349.00	\$349.00	In Flight 5005	\$445.00	\$445.00	Tag Flatline Incline Folding Bench	\$298.00	\$298.00
Pro/Collegiate Trap bar accommodates small and large from adults	Promaxima	OLY-TRAP	1	Troy Barbell AOT56	\$195.00	\$195.00	Troy Barbell AOT-56	\$155.00	\$155.00	Perform Better 9701	\$123.75	\$123.75	BSN #1101247	\$204.62	\$204.62		\$179.00	\$179.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy AOT-56	\$159.00	\$159.00
Black Olympic 1500 lb Test bar	Promaxima	OLY-BAR-1500	1	Troy Barbell GOB1800	\$209.00	\$209.00	Troy Model GOB-180	\$205.00	\$205.00	Legend LGD-OLY-BKSV	\$193.75	\$193.75	BSN #CHCOCBXX	\$172.08	\$172.08		\$179.00	\$179.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy Olympic Bar	\$195.60	\$195.60
Olympic Power Curl Bar Solid ends no collars included	Promaxima	OLY-CURL-PO	1	Troy Barbell TOZ47	\$109.00	\$109.00	Tro TOZ-47	\$105.00	\$105.00	Troy Barbell TOZ-47B	\$79.05	\$79.05	BSN #1272604	\$52.08	\$52.08		\$125.00	\$125.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag 47" EZ Curl Bar	\$100.00	\$100.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 45 lb	Promaxima	EZR-45	2	York Barbell 29083	\$70.88	\$141.76	Gronk 80053	\$45.00	\$90.00	Troy GP-045R	\$2.81	\$5.62	BSN #1272598	\$56.66	\$113.32		\$45.00	\$90.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate	\$63.00	\$126.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 35 lb	Promaxima	EZR-35	2	York Barbell 29082	\$55.13	\$110.26	Gronk 80052	\$35.00	\$70.00	Troy GP-035R	\$5.63	\$11.26	BSN #1272581	\$52.59	\$105.18		\$35.00	\$70.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate	\$49.00	\$98.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 25 lb	Promaxima	EZR-25	2	York Barbell 29081	\$39.38	\$78.76	Gronk 80051	\$25.00	\$50.00	Troy GP-025R	\$11.25	\$22.50	BSN #1272574	\$31.48	\$62.96		\$25.00	\$50.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate	\$35.00	\$70.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 10 lb	Promaxima	EZR-10	2	York Barbell 29080	\$15.75	\$31.50	Gronk 80050	\$10.00	\$20.00	Troy GP-010R	\$28.13	\$56.26	BSN #1272567	\$14.84	\$29.68		\$10.00	\$20.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate	\$14.00	\$28.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 5 lb	Promaxima	EZR-05	4	York Barbell 29079	\$7.88	\$31.52	Gronk 80049	\$5.00	\$20.00	Troy GP-005R	\$39.38	\$157.52	BSN #1272550	\$8.09	\$32.36		\$5.00	\$20.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate	\$7.00	\$28.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 2.5 lb	Promaxima	EZR-02.5	2	York Barbell 29078	\$3.93	\$7.86	Gronk 80048	\$2.50	\$5.00	Troy GP-002R	\$50.63	\$101.26	BSN #1388432	\$5.22	\$10.44		\$2.50	\$5.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate	\$3.50	\$7.00
45 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black) each	Promaxima	BUMHI-45LB	2	York Barbell 29071	\$81.00	\$162.00	UFG XM 5146	\$72.00	\$144.00	Troy GBO-0045SBP	\$46.25	\$92.50	BSN #1388431	\$177.08	\$354.16		\$45.00	\$90.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate	\$55.68	\$111.36
35 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black) each	Promaxima	BUMHI-35LB	2	York Barbell 29070	\$63.00	\$126.00	UFG XM 5145	\$56.00	\$112.00	Troy GBO-0035SBP	\$36.13	\$72.26	BSN #1388430	\$141.54	\$283.08		\$35.00	\$70.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate	\$43.44	\$86.88
25 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black) each	Promaxima	BUMHI-25LB	2	York Barbell 29069	\$45.00	\$90.00	UFG XM 5144	\$40.00	\$80.00	Troy GBO-0025SBP	\$26.00	\$52.00	BSN #1388429	\$94.63	\$189.26		\$25.00	\$50.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate	\$31.20	\$62.40
10 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black) each	Promaxima	BUMHI-10LB	2	York Barbell 29067	\$18.00	\$36.00	UFG XM 5142	\$16.00	\$32.00	Troy GBO-010SBP	\$16.88	\$33.76	BSN #1369609	\$67.43	\$134.86		\$20.00	\$40.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate	\$19.20	\$38.40
Abdominal Mat. 100% foam core	Promaxima	ABMAT	2	ABMAT ABMAT	\$29.99	\$59.98	Xtreme Monkey Model L	\$39.00	\$78.00	Perform Better 1238	\$31.25	\$62.50	BSN #1377202	\$17.29	\$34.58		\$39.95	\$79.90	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Deluxe Eyelet Fitness Mat	\$31.50	\$63.00
ST-Extreme suspension training kit. With English and Spanish owners manual and carry bag.	Promaxima	ACST-XTREM	1	TRX Club4 Suspension Trainer	\$195.00	\$195.00	Commercial TRXCLUB4	\$165.00	\$165.00	Jungle Gym XT	\$81.25	\$81.25	BSN #137702	\$258.48	\$258.48		\$125.00	\$125.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Lifetime JungleGym XT	\$79.95	\$79.95
No limits timer (MDUSA)	Promaxima	AC-Timer	1	Pro Edition XTR100	\$350.00	\$350.00	UFG XM 100-3300	\$195.00	\$195.00	Perform Better 5456	\$249.94	\$249.94	No Bid		\$0.00		\$375.00	\$375.00	No Bid		\$0.00	First Place Interval Timer	\$229.00	\$229.00
				Freight	\$975.00	\$975.00	Deliver/Assembly	\$712.20	\$712.20	Freight	\$1,163.75	\$1,163.75	Freight		\$0.00	Freight and Install	\$1,600.00	\$1,600.00						
				Install	\$0.00	\$0.00	Public Service Discount	\$75.00	\$75.00	Install	\$800.00	\$800.00	Install											
				<b>Subtotal Station #1</b>	<b>\$10,419.89</b>	<b>\$10,419.89</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #1</b>	<b>\$6,473.20</b>	<b>\$6,473.20</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #1</b>	<b>\$10,036.09</b>	<b>\$10,036.09</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #1</b>	<b>\$6,452.61</b>	<b>\$6,452.61</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #1</b>	<b>\$8,717.00</b>	<b>\$8,717.00</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #1</b>	<b>\$2,335.00</b>	<b>\$2,335.00</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #1</b>	<b>\$8,348.19</b>	<b>\$8,348.19</b>
<b>Equipment Fire Station #2, 1251 E. Auburn Rd., Rochester Hills, MI</b>																								
Equipment Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	Qty	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price
VIPER Commercial Treadmill	Promaxima	CV-77141	1	Cybox 525T	\$3,750.00	\$3,750.00	BH LK500i	\$2,495.00	\$2,495.00	Octane Fitness T3X	\$3,810.00	\$3,810.00	BSN /Spirit #1364697	\$3,215.08	\$3,215.08		\$2,195.00	\$2,195.00	Matrix T3X	\$3,595.00	\$3,595.00	Spirit Fitness CT800	\$2,195.00	\$2,195.00
Assault Dual Action Air Bike	Promaxima	CV-AIR-A	1	Life Core AS-Assault G	\$850.00	\$850.00	Assault Air Bike	\$759.00	\$759.00	Schwinn Airdyne AD Pro	\$725.00	\$725.00	BSN/Stairmaster #1388449	\$2,596.08	\$2,596.08		\$895.00	\$895.00	Schwinn Air Dyne Pro	\$945.00	\$945.00	Same as spec	\$850.00	\$850.00
10 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-010	2	York Barbell 34053	\$15.75	\$31.50	SDR-010	\$10.00	\$20.00	Troy HD-010R	\$11.13	\$22.26	BSN #1347777	\$12.18	\$24.36		\$10.00	\$20.00	No Bid		\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$13.50	\$27.00
15 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-015	2	York Barbell 34055	\$23.63	\$47.26	SDR-015	\$15.00	\$30.00	HD-015R	\$16.69	\$33.38	BSN #1347784	\$17.64	\$35.28		\$15.00	\$30.00	No Bid		\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$20.25	\$40.50
20 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-020	2	York Barbell 34057	\$31.50	\$63.00	SDR-020	\$20.00	\$40.00	HD-020R	\$22.25	\$44.50	BSN #1347791	\$24.38	\$48.76		\$20.00	\$40.00	No Bid		\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$27.00	\$54.00
25 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-025	2	York Barbell 34059	\$39.38	\$78.76	SDR-025	\$25.00	\$50.00	HD-025R	\$27.81	\$55.62	BSN #1347807	\$29.84	\$59.68		\$25.00	\$50.00	No Bid		\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$33.75	\$67.50
30 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-030	2	York Barbell 34061	\$47.25	\$94.50	SDR-030	\$30.00	\$60.00	HD-030R	\$33.38	\$66.76	BSN #1347814	\$37.62	\$75.24		\$30.00	\$60.00	No Bid		\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$40.50	\$81.00
35 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-035	2	York Barbell 34062	\$55.13	\$110.26	SDR-035	\$35.00	\$70.00	HD-035R	\$38.94	\$77.88	BSN #1347821	\$46.32	\$92.64		\$35.00	\$70.00	No Bid		\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$47.25	\$94.50
40 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-040	2	York Barbell 34063	\$63.00	\$126.00	SDR-040	\$40.00	\$80.00	HD-040R	\$44.50	\$89.00	BSN #1347838	\$52.72	\$105.44		\$40.00	\$80.00	No Bid		\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$54.00	\$108.00
45 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-045	2	York Barbell 34064	\$70.88	\$141.76	SDR-045	\$45.00	\$90.00	HD-045R	\$50.06	\$100.12	BSN #1347845	\$58.54	\$117.08		\$45.00	\$90.00	No Bid		\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$60.75	\$121.50
50 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-050	2	York Barbell 34065	\$78.75	\$157.50	SDR-050	\$50.00	\$100.00	HD-050R	\$55.63	\$111.26	BSN #1347869	\$68.16	\$13									

				Fitness Things Address not Provided			G&F Fitness 7350 Transit Road Williamsville, NY 14221			Legend Fitness 5901 Middlebrook Pike Knoxville, TN 37909			BSN Sports, LLC P.O. Box 7726 Dallas, TX 75209			Pro Maxima 5310 Ashrook Houston, TX 77081			All Pro 45255 5 Mile Plymouth, MI 48170			Direct Fitness 600 Tower Road Mundelein, IL 60060		
Soft medicine ball 20 lb	Promaxima	11087	1	Dynamax DYM10020LB	\$109.95	\$109.95	UFG XM 100-3162	\$50.00	\$50.00	Troy PWB-020	\$58.75	\$58.75	BSN #PMTA1369	\$92.49	\$92.49	\$47.95	\$47.95	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy Leather Wall Ball	\$102.00	\$102.00	
15 lb deluxe medicine ball	Promaxima	MB-015	1	Dynamax DYM10016LB	\$99.95	\$99.95	UFG 100-3068	\$45.00	\$45.00	Perform Better 2616	\$49.94	\$49.94	No Bid		\$0.00	\$48.50	\$48.50	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Medicine Ball	\$51.00	\$51.00	
20 lb deluxe medicine ball	Promaxima	MB-020	1	Dynamax DYM10025LB	\$119.95	\$119.95	UFG 200-3069	\$54.00	\$54.00	No Bid		\$0.00	BSN #PMTA1369	\$94.49	\$94.49	\$57.00	\$57.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Medicine Ball	\$61.60	\$61.60	
25 lb deluxe medicine ball	Promaxima	MB-025	1	Dynamax DYM10025LB	\$120.00	\$120.00	UFG 100-3070	\$72.00	\$72.00	Perform Better 2619	\$73.39	\$73.39	No Bid		\$0.00	\$84.95	\$84.95	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Medicine Ball	\$77.00	\$77.00	
45 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black) each	Promaxima	BUMHI-45LB	2	York Barbell 29071	\$81.00	\$162.00	UFG XM 5146	\$72.00	\$144.00	Troy GBO-045SBP	\$46.25	\$92.50	BSN #1388432	\$177.08	\$354.16	\$45.00	\$90.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate-45#	\$55.68	\$111.36	
35 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black) each	Promaxima	BUMHI-35LB	2	York Barbell 29070	\$63.00	\$126.00	UFG XM 5145	\$56.00	\$112.00	Troy GBO-035SBP	\$36.13	\$72.26	BSN #1388431	\$141.54	\$283.08	\$35.00	\$70.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate-35#	\$43.44	\$86.88	
25 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black) each	Promaxima	BUMHI-25LB	2	York Barbell 29069	\$45.00	\$90.00	UFG XM 5144	\$40.00	\$80.00	Troy GBO-025SBP	\$26.00	\$52.00	BSN #1388430	\$94.63	\$189.26	\$25.00	\$50.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate-25#	\$31.20	\$62.40	
10 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black) each	Promaxima	BUMHI-10LB	2	York Barbell 29067	\$18.00	\$36.00	UFG XM 5142	\$16.00	\$32.00	Troy GBO-010SBP	\$16.88	\$33.76	BSN #1388429	\$67.43	\$134.86	\$20.00	\$40.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate-10#	\$19.20	\$38.40	
Black Olympic 1500 lb Test bar	Promaxima	OLY-BAR-1500	1	Troy Barbell GOB1800	\$209.00	\$209.00	Troy VTX GOB-1800	\$205.00	\$205.00	Legend LGD-OLY-BKSV	\$193.75	\$193.75	BSN #1101247	\$172.08	\$172.08	\$179.00	\$179.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy AOB-1500B 1500# olympic bar	\$195.60	\$195.60	
Olympic Power Curl Bar Solid ends no collars included	Promaxima	OLY-CURL-PO	1	Troy Barbell TOZ47	\$109.00	\$109.00	Troy Model TOZ-47	\$105.00	\$105.00	Troy TOZ-47B	\$79.05	\$79.05	BSN CHCOCBXX	\$52.08	\$52.08	\$125.00	\$125.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag 47" EZ Curl Bar	\$100.00	\$100.00	
Pro/Collegiate Trap bar accommodates small and large from adults	Promaxima	OLY-TRAP	1	Troy Barbell AOT56	\$195.00	\$195.00	Troy AOT-56	\$155.00	\$155.00	Perform Better 9701	\$123.75	\$123.75	BSN #PMWT126	\$204.62	\$204.62	\$179.00	\$179.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy AOT-56	\$159.00	\$159.00	
Abdominal Mat. 100% foam core	Promaxima	ABMAT	2	ABMAT ABMAT	\$29.99	\$59.98	Xtremem Model L	\$39.00	\$78.00	Perform Better 1238	\$31.25	\$62.50	BSN #1369609	\$17.29	\$34.58	\$39.95	\$79.90	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Deluxe Eyelet Fitness Mat	\$31.50	\$63.00	
ST-Extreme suspension training kit	Promaxima	ACST-XTREM	1	TRX Club4 Suspension Trailer	\$195.00	\$195.00	Commercial TRXCLUB4	\$165.00	\$165.00	Perform Better 7826	\$81.25	\$81.25	BSN #1377202	\$258.48	\$258.48	\$125.00	\$125.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Jungle Gym XT	\$79.95	\$79.95	
No limits timer (MDUSA)	Promaxima	AC-Timer	1	Pro Edition XTR100	\$350.00	\$350.00	UFG 100-3300	\$195.00	\$195.00	Perform Better 5456	\$249.94	\$249.94	No Bid		\$0.00	\$375.00	\$375.00	No Bid		\$0.00	First Place Interval Timer	\$229.00	\$229.00	
				Freight	\$795.00	\$795.00	Delivery/Assembly	\$695.80	\$695.80	Freight and Installation	\$2,070.42	\$2,070.42	Freight		\$0.00	Freight and Install	\$1,300.00	\$1,300.00						
							Public Service Discount	\$75.00	\$75.00															
				<b>Subtotal Station #2</b>	<b>\$9,500.03</b>	<b>\$9,500.03</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #2</b>	<b>\$6,628.80</b>	<b>\$6,628.80</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #2</b>	<b>\$9,389.31</b>	<b>\$9,389.31</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #2</b>	<b>\$8,995.99</b>	<b>\$8,995.99</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #2</b>	<b>\$7,270.00</b>	<b>\$7,270.00</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #2</b>	<b>\$4,540.00</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #2</b>	<b>\$6,344.29</b>	<b>\$6,344.29</b>	

**Equipment Fire Station #3, 2137 W. Auburn Road, Rochester Hills, MI**

Equipment Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	Qty	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price
Promaxima Half Rack	Promaxima	PL-340	1	Tuff Stuff PXL57910	\$2,110.00	\$2,110.00			\$0.00	Legend 3142	\$937.50	\$937.50	No Bid		\$0.00		\$995.00	\$995.00	No Bid		\$0.00	TAG Fitness Power Rack	\$1,100.00	\$1,100.00
Promaxima Centurion Stepmill	Promaxima	CV-25SM	1	Life Fitness CLPM Integrity PowerMill	\$6,375.00	\$6,375.00	Lifetime CLPM-ALLXX-05	\$6,889.00	\$6,889.00	Matrix Fitness CSX	\$5,435.00	\$5,435.00	BSN/Stairmaster #1388450	\$3,802.96	\$3,802.96		\$4,295.00	\$4,295.00	Matrix T3X	\$4,495.00	\$4,495.00	Stairmaster SM5 Stepmill	\$4,095.00	\$4,095.00
VIPER Commercial Treadmill	Promaxima	CV-77141	1	Cybox 525T	\$3,750.00	\$3,750.00	BH LK500TI	\$2,495.00	\$2,495.00	Matrix T3x	\$3,810.00	\$3,810.00	BSN/Spirit #1364697	\$3,215.08	\$3,215.08		\$2,195.00	\$2,195.00	Schwinn Air Dyme Pro	\$3,595.00	\$3,595.00	Spirit CT800 Treadmill	\$2,195.00	\$2,195.00
Club Rower, chain driven, 500 lb user weight	Promaxima	CV-1100	1	Bodycraft VR400	\$895.00	\$895.00	Body Craft VR500-55	\$845.00	\$845.00	Concept 2 2712-US	\$842.39	\$842.39	BSN #1390989	\$1,463.78	\$1,463.78		\$895.00	\$895.00	Concept 2	\$945.00	\$945.00	Concept 2 Model D	\$965.00	\$965.00
Assault Dual Action Air Bike	Promaxima	CV-AIR-A	1	Life Core AS-Assault G	\$850.00	\$850.00	AS-ASSAULTB	\$759.00	\$759.00	Schwinn AirDyne AD Pro	\$725.00	\$725.00	BSN/Stairmaster #1388449	\$2,956.08	\$2,956.08		\$895.00	\$895.00	Schwinn Air Dyme Pro	\$945.00	\$945.00	Same as spec	\$850.00	\$850.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 45 lb	Promaxima	EZR-45	2	York Barbell 29083	\$70.88	\$141.76	Gronk 80053	\$45.00	\$90.00	No Bid		\$0.00	BSN #1272604	\$56.66	\$113.32		\$45.00	\$90.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate 45#	\$63.00	\$126.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 35 lb	Promaxima	EZR-35	2	York Barbell 29082	\$55.13	\$110.26	Gronk 80052	\$35.00	\$70.00	No Bid		\$0.00	BSN #1272598	\$52.59	\$105.18		\$35.00	\$70.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate 35#	\$49.00	\$98.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 25 lb	Promaxima	EZR-25	2	York Barbell 29081	\$39.38	\$78.76	Gronk 80051	\$25.00	\$50.00	No Bid		\$0.00	BSN #1272581	\$31.48	\$62.96		\$25.00	\$50.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate 25#	\$35.00	\$70.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 10 lb	Promaxima	EZR-10	2	York Barbell 29080	\$15.75	\$31.50	Gronk 80050	\$10.00	\$20.00	No Bid		\$0.00	BSN #1272574	\$14.84	\$29.68		\$10.00	\$20.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate 10#	\$14.00	\$28.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 5 lb	Promaxima	EZR-05	4	York Barbell 29079	\$7.88	\$31.52	Gronk 80049	\$5.00	\$20.00	No Bid		\$0.00	BSN #1272567	\$8.09	\$32.36		\$5.00	\$20.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate 5#	\$7.00	\$28.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 2.5 lb	Promaxima	EZR-02.5	2	York Barbell 29078	\$3.93	\$7.86	Gronk 80048	\$2.50	\$5.00	No Bid		\$0.00	BSN #1272550	\$5.22	\$10.44		\$2.50	\$5.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate 2.5#	\$3.50	\$7.00
45 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black)	Promaxima	BUMHI-45LB	2	York Barbell 29071	\$81.00	\$162.00	UFG XM 5146	\$72.00	\$144.00	Troy Barbell GBO-045SBP	\$46.25	\$92.50	BSN #1388432	\$177.08	\$354.16		\$45.00	\$90.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate 45#	\$55.68	\$111.36
35 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black)	Promaxima	BUMHI-35LB	2	York Barbell 29070	\$63.00	\$126.00	UFG XM 5145	\$56.00	\$112.00	Troy Barbell GBO-035SBP	\$36.13	\$72.26	BSN #1388431	\$141.54	\$283.08		\$35.00	\$70.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate 35#	\$43.44	\$86.88
25 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black)	Promaxima	BUMHI-25LB	2	York Barbell 29069	\$45.00	\$90.00	UFG XM 5144	\$40.00	\$80.00	Troy Barbell GBO-025SBP	\$26.00	\$52.00	BSN #1388430	\$94.63	\$189.26		\$25.00	\$50.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate 25#	\$31.20	\$62.40
10 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black)	Promaxima	BUMHI-10LB	2	York Barbell 29067	\$18.00	\$36.00	UFG XM 5142	\$16.00	\$32.00	Troy Barbell GBO-010SBP	\$16.88	\$33.76	BSN #1388429	\$67.43	\$134.86		\$20.00	\$40.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate 10#	\$19.20	\$38.40
10 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-010	2	York Barbell 34053	\$15.75	\$31.50	SDR-010	\$10.00	\$20.00	HD-010R	\$11.13	\$22.26	BSN #1347777	\$12.18	\$24.36		\$10.00	\$20.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Fitness Rubber Hex	\$13.50	\$27.00
15 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-015	2	York Barbell 34055	\$23.63	\$47.26	SDR-015	\$15.00	\$30.00	HD-015R	\$16.69	\$33.38	BSN #1347784	\$17.64	\$35.28		\$15.00	\$30.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Fitness Rubber Hex	\$20.25	\$40.50
20 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-020	2	York Barbell 34057	\$31.50	\$63.00	SDR-020	\$20.00	\$40.00	HD-020R	\$22.25	\$44.50	BSN #1347791	\$24.38	\$48.76		\$20.00	\$40.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Fitness Rubber Hex	\$27.00	\$54.00
25 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-025	2	York Barbell 34059	\$39.38	\$78.76	SDR-025	\$25.00	\$50.00	HD-025R	\$27.81	\$55.62	BSN #1347807	\$29.84	\$59.68		\$25.00	\$50.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Fitness Rubber Hex	\$33.75	\$67.50
30 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-030	2	York Barbell 34061	\$47.25	\$94.50	SDR-030	\$30.00	\$60.00	HD-030R	\$33.38	\$66.76	BSN #1347814	\$37.62	\$75.24		\$30.00	\$60.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Fitness Rubber Hex	\$40.50	\$81.00
35 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-035	2	York Barbell 34062	\$55.13	\$110.26	SDR-035	\$35.00	\$70.00	HD-035R	\$38.94	\$77.88	BSN #1347821	\$46.32	\$92.64		\$35.00	\$70.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Fitness Rubber Hex	\$47.25	\$94.50
40 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-040	2	York Barbell 34063	\$63.00	\$126.00	SDR-040	\$40.00	\$80.00	HD-040R	\$44.50	\$89.00	BSN #1347838	\$52.72	\$105.44		\$40.00	\$80.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Fitness Rubber Hex	\$54.00	\$108.00
45 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-045	2	York Barbell 34064	\$70.88	\$141.76	SDR-045	\$45.00	\$90.00	HD-045R	\$50.06	\$100.12	BSN #1347845	\$58.54	\$117.08		\$45.00	\$90.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Fitness Rubber Hex	\$60.75	\$121.50
50 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-050	2	York Barbell 34065	\$78.75	\$157.50	SDR-050	\$50.00	\$100.00	HD-050R	\$55.63	\$111.26	BSN #1347869	\$68.16	\$136.32		\$50.00	\$100.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Fitness Rubber Hex	\$67.50	\$135.00
55 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-055	2	York Barbell 34066	\$86.63	\$173.26	SDR-055	\$55.00	\$110.00	HD-055R	\$61.19	\$122.38	BSN #1347876	\$83.28	\$166.56		\$55.00	\$110.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Fitness Rubber Hex	\$74.25	\$148.50
60 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-060	2	York Barbell 34067	\$94.50	\$189.00	SDR-060	\$60.00	\$120.00	HD-060R	\$66.75	\$133.50												

				Fitness Things Address not Provided			G&F Fitness 7350 Transit Road Williamsville, NY 14221			Legend Fitness 5901 Middlebrook Pike Knoxville, TN 37909			BSN Sports, LLC P.O. Box 7726 Knoxville, TN 75209			Pro Maxima 5310 Ashrook Houston, TX 77081			All Pro 45255 5 Mile Plymouth, MI 48170			Direct Fitness 600 Tower Road Mundelein, IL 60060		
Soft medicine ball 14 lb	Promaxima	11084	1	Dynamax DYM10014LB	\$94.95	\$94.95	UFG XM 100-3161	\$45.00	\$45.00	Troy Barbell CKB-014	\$47.50	\$47.50	BSN #PMTA1366	\$75.58	\$75.58	\$39.95	\$39.95	No Bid	\$0.00	Troy Leather Wall Ball	\$49.80	\$49.80		
Soft medicine ball 20 lb	Promaxima	11087	1	Dynamax DYM10020LB	\$109.95	\$109.95	UFG XM 100-3162	\$50.00	\$50.00	Troy Barbell CKB-020	\$60.26	\$60.26	BSN #PMTA1369	\$92.49	\$92.49	\$47.95	\$47.95	No Bid	\$0.00	Troy Leather Wall Ball	\$102.00	\$102.00		
Black Olympic 1500 lb Test bar	Promaxima	OLY-BAR-1500	1	Troy Barbell GOB1800	\$209.00	\$209.00	Troy GOB-1800	\$205.00	\$205.00	Legend Fitness LGD-OLY-BKSV	\$193.75	\$193.75	BSN #1101247	\$172.08	\$172.08	\$179.00	\$179.00	No Bid	\$0.00	Troy AOB-1500B 1500# Olympic Bar	\$195.60	\$195.60		
Olympic Power Curl Bar Solid ends no collars included	Promaxima	OLY-CURL-PO	1	Troy Barbell TOZ47	\$109.00	\$109.00	Troy TOZ-47	\$105.00	\$105.00	Troy Barbell TOZ-47B	\$79.05	\$79.05	BSN #CHCOCBXX	\$52.08	\$52.08	\$125.00	\$125.00	No Bid	\$0.00	Tag 47" EZ Curl Bar	\$100.00	\$100.00		
Pro/Collegiate Trap bar accommodates small and large from adults	Promaxima	OLY-TRAP	1	Troy Barbell AOT56	\$195.00	\$195.00	Troy AOT-56	\$155.00	\$155.00	Perform Better 9701	\$123.75	\$123.75	BSN #PMWT126	\$204.62	\$204.62	\$179.00	\$179.00	No Bid	\$0.00	Troy AOT-56	\$159.00	\$159.00		
Adjustable Deluxe Work Bench	Promaxima	FW-150	1	Hoist Fitness HF5165	\$375.00	\$375.00	Gronk 80027	\$249.00	\$249.00	Legend Fitness 3103	\$462.50	\$462.50	No Bid	\$0.00	\$349.00	\$349.00	No Bid	\$0.00	Tag Flat Incline Folding Bench (F16350)	\$298.00	\$298.00			
Abdominal Mat. 100% foam core	Promaxima	ABMAT	2	ABMAT ABMAT	\$29.95	\$59.90	Xtreme Monkey Model L	\$39.00	\$78.00	Perform Better 1238	\$31.25	\$62.50	BSN #1369609	\$17.29	\$34.58	\$39.95	\$79.90	No Bid	\$0.00	Tag Deluxe Eyelet Fitness Mat	\$31.50	\$63.00		
ST-Extreme suspension training kit	Promaxima	ACST-XTREM	1	TRX Club4 Suspension Trainer	\$195.00	\$195.00	Commercial TRXCLUB4	\$165.00	\$165.00	Perform Better 7826	\$81.25	\$81.25	BSN #1377202	\$258.48	\$258.48	\$125.00	\$125.00	No Bid	\$0.00	Jungle Gym XT	\$79.95	\$79.95		
No limits timer (MDUSA)	Promaxima	AC-Timer	1	Pro Edition XTR100	\$350.00	\$350.00	UFG XM 100-3300	\$195.00	\$195.00	Perform Better 5456	\$249.94	\$249.94	No Bid	\$0.00	\$375.00	\$375.00	No Bid	\$0.00	First Place Interval Timer	\$229.00	\$229.00			
				Freight	\$975.00	\$975.00	Delivery/Assembly	\$885.50	\$885.50	Freight and Install	\$3,178.69	\$3,178.69	Installation for Second Floor	\$3,568.71	\$3,568.71	Freight and Install	\$2,400.00	\$2,400.00	\$0.00					
							Public Service Discount	\$125.00	\$125.00															
				<b>Subtotal Station #3</b>	<b>\$19,716.61</b>	<b>\$19,716.61</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #3</b>	<b>\$14,956.50</b>	<b>\$14,956.50</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #3</b>	<b>\$18,176.78</b>	<b>\$18,176.78</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #3</b>	<b>\$18,450.90</b>	<b>\$18,450.90</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #3</b>	<b>\$15,102.00</b>	<b>\$15,102.00</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #3</b>	<b>\$9,980.00</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #3</b>	<b>\$13,097.69</b>		

**Equipment Fire Station #4, 2723 Walton Blvd, Rochester Hills, MI**

Equipment Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	Qty	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price	State Alternate	Price	Extended Price
VIPER Commercial Treadmill	Promaxima	CV-77141	1	Cybox 525T	\$3,750.00	\$3,750.00	BH LK5000i	\$2,495.00	\$2,495.00	Octane Fitness T3X	\$3,810.00	\$3,810.00	BSN /Spirit #1364697	\$3,215.08	\$3,215.08	\$2,195.00	\$2,195.00	Matrix T3X	\$3,595.00	\$3,595.00	Spirit Fitness CT800	\$2,195.00	\$2,195.00	
Promaxima Half Rack	Promaxima	PL-340	1	Tuff Stuff PXL57910	\$2,110.00	\$2,110.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Legend 3142	\$937.50	\$937.50	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$995.00	\$995.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	TAG Fitness Power Rack	\$1,100.00	\$1,100.00	
Assault Dual Action Air Bike	Promaxima	CV-AIR-A	1	Life Core AS-Assault G	\$850.00	\$850.00	Assault Air Bike	\$759.00	\$759.00	Schwinn Airdyne AD Pro	\$725.00	\$725.00	BSN/Stairmaster #1388449	\$2,596.08	\$2,596.08	\$895.00	\$895.00	Schwinn Air Dyne Pro	\$945.00	\$945.00	Same as spec	\$850.00	\$850.00	
10 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-010	2	York Barbell 34053	\$15.75	\$31.50	SDR-010	\$10.00	\$20.00	Troy HD-010R	\$11.13	\$22.26	BSN #1347777	\$12.18	\$24.36	\$10.00	\$20.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$13.50	\$27.00	
15 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-015	2	York Barbell 34055	\$23.63	\$47.26	SDR-015	\$15.00	\$30.00	HD-015R	\$16.69	\$33.38	BSN #1347784	\$17.64	\$35.28	\$15.00	\$30.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$20.25	\$40.50	
20 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-020	2	York Barbell 34057	\$31.50	\$63.00	SDR-020	\$20.00	\$40.00	HD-020R	\$22.25	\$44.50	BSN #1347791	\$24.38	\$48.76	\$20.00	\$40.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$27.00	\$54.00	
25 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-025	2	York Barbell 34059	\$39.38	\$78.76	SDR-025	\$25.00	\$50.00	HD-025R	\$27.81	\$55.62	BSN #1347807	\$29.84	\$59.68	\$25.00	\$50.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$33.75	\$67.50	
30 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-030	2	York Barbell 34061	\$47.25	\$94.50	SDR-030	\$30.00	\$60.00	HD-030R	\$33.38	\$66.76	BSN #1347814	\$37.62	\$75.24	\$30.00	\$60.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$40.50	\$81.00	
35 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-035	2	York Barbell 34062	\$55.13	\$110.26	SDR-035	\$35.00	\$70.00	HD-035R	\$38.94	\$77.88	BSN #1347821	\$46.32	\$92.64	\$35.00	\$70.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$47.25	\$94.50	
40 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-040	2	York Barbell 34063	\$63.00	\$126.00	SDR-040	\$40.00	\$80.00	HD-040R	\$44.50	\$89.00	BSN #1347838	\$52.72	\$105.44	\$40.00	\$80.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$54.00	\$108.00	
45 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-045	2	York Barbell 34064	\$70.88	\$141.76	SDR-045	\$45.00	\$90.00	HD-045R	\$50.06	\$100.12	BSN #1347845	\$58.54	\$117.08	\$45.00	\$90.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$60.75	\$121.50	
50 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-050	2	York Barbell 34065	\$78.75	\$157.50	SDR-050	\$50.00	\$100.00	HD-050R	\$55.63	\$111.26	BSN #1347869	\$68.16	\$136.32	\$50.00	\$100.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$67.50	\$135.00	
55 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-055	2	York Barbell 34066	\$86.63	\$173.26	SDR-055	\$55.00	\$110.00	HD-055R	\$61.19	\$122.38	BSN #1347876	\$83.28	\$166.56	\$55.00	\$110.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$74.25	\$148.50	
60 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-060	2	York Barbell 34067	\$94.50	\$189.00	SDR-060	\$60.00	\$120.00	HD-060R	\$66.75	\$133.50	BSN #1347883	\$95.09	\$190.18	\$60.00	\$120.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$81.00	\$162.00	
3 Tier shelf dumbbell rack, 5 ft. long, holds 15 pair	Promaxima	FW-233	1	USA/Troy Barbell GTDR-3	\$499.00	\$499.00	Body Solid GDR60 2 Tier Rack & Model GDRT6	\$248.00	\$248.00	Troy GTDR-3	\$405.00	\$405.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$325.00	\$325.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	TAG Fitness 3 Tier Dumbbell Rack	\$520.00	\$520.00	
25 lb Rubber encased kettle bell with chrome handle	Promaxima	Kettle BPRO	1	Bodysport BDSKB25	\$53.50	\$53.50	UFG XM 4604	\$33.00	\$33.00	Troy CKB-025	\$40.63	\$40.63	BSN #1267297	\$48.87	\$48.87	\$31.25	\$31.25	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Tag Kettlebell	\$44.00	\$44.00	
35 lb Rubber encased kettle bell with chrome handle	Promaxima	Kettle BPRO	1	Bodysport BDSKB35	\$69.55	\$69.55	UFG XM 4605	\$45.00	\$45.00	Troy CKB-035	\$56.88	\$56.88	BSN #1267310	\$63.68	\$63.68	\$43.75	\$43.75	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Tag Kettlebell	\$61.60	\$61.60	
45 lb Rubber encased kettle bell with chrome handle	Promaxima	Kettle BPRO	1	Bodysport BDSKB45	\$91.90	\$91.90	UFG XM 4606	\$56.00	\$56.00	Troy CKB-045	\$73.13	\$73.13	BSN #1267334	\$74.98	\$74.98	\$56.25	\$56.25	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Tag Kettlebell	\$79.20	\$79.20	
50 lb Rubber encased kettle bell with chrome handle	Promaxima	Kettle BPRO	1	Bodysport BDSKB50	\$101.50	\$101.50	UFG XM 100-4607	\$65.00	\$65.00	Troy CKB-050	\$81.25	\$81.25	No Bid	\$60.50	\$60.50	\$62.50	\$62.50	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Tag Kettlebell	\$88.00	\$88.00	
Soft medicine ball 14 lb	Promaxima	11084	1	Dynamax DYM10014LB	\$94.95	\$94.95	UFG XM 100-3161	\$45.00	\$45.00	Troy PWB-014	\$47.50	\$47.50	BSN #PMTA1366	\$75.58	\$75.58	\$39.95	\$39.95	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Troy Leather Wall Ball	\$49.80	\$49.80	
Soft medicine ball 20 lb	Promaxima	11087	1	Dynamax DYM10020LB	\$109.95	\$109.95	UFG XM 100-3162	\$50.00	\$50.00	Troy PWB-020	\$58.75	\$58.75	BSN #PMTA1369	\$92.49	\$92.49	\$47.95	\$47.95	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Troy Leather Wall Ball	\$102.00	\$102.00	
15 lb deluxe medicine ball	Promaxima	MB-015	1	Dynamax DYM10016LB	\$99.95	\$99.95	UFG 100-3068	\$45.00	\$45.00	Perform Better 2616	\$49.94	\$49.94	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$48.50	\$48.50	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Tag Medicine Ball	\$51.00	\$51.00	
20 lb deluxe medicine ball	Promaxima	MB-020	1	Dynamax DYM10025LB	\$119.95	\$119.95	UFG 200-3069	\$54.00	\$54.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	BSN #PMTA1369	\$94.49	\$94.49	\$57.00	\$57.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Tag Medicine Ball	\$61.60	\$61.60	
25 lb deluxe medicine ball	Promaxima	MB-025	1	Dynamax DYM10025LB	\$120.00	\$120.00	UFG 100-3070	\$72.00	\$72.00	Perform Better 2619	\$73.39	\$73.39	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$84.95	\$84.95	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Tag Medicine Ball	\$77.00	\$77.00	
45 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black) each	Promaxima	BUMHI-45LB	2	York Barbell 29071	\$81.00	\$162.00	UFG XM 5146	\$72.00	\$144.00	Troy GBO-045SBP	\$46.25	\$92.50	BSN #1388432	\$177.08	\$354.16	\$45.00	\$90.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate-45#	\$55.68	\$111.36	
35 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black) each	Promaxima	BUMHI-35LB	2	York Barbell 29070	\$63.00	\$126.00	UFG XM 5145	\$56.00	\$112.00	Troy GBO-035SBP	\$36.13	\$72.26	BSN #1388431	\$141.54	\$283.08	\$35.00	\$70.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate-35#	\$43.44	\$86.88	
25 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black) each	Promaxima	BUMHI-25LB	2	York Barbell 29069	\$45.00	\$90.00	UFG XM 5144	\$40.00	\$80.00	Troy GBO-025SBP	\$26.00	\$52.00	BSN #1388430	\$94.63	\$189.26	\$25.00	\$50.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate-25#	\$31.20	\$62.40	
10 lb Solid rubber bumper plate with stainless steel insert (black) each	Promaxima	BUMHI-10LB	2	York Barbell 29067	\$18.00	\$36.00	UFG XM 5142	\$16.00	\$32.00	Troy GBO-010SBP	\$16.88	\$33.76	BSN #1388429	\$67.43	\$134.86	\$20.00	\$40.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Troy GBO Bumper Plate-10#	\$19.20	\$38.40	
Black Olympic 1500 lb Test bar	Promaxima	OLY-BAR-1500	1	Troy Barbell GOB1800	\$209.00	\$209.00	Troy VTX GOB-1800	\$205.00	\$205.00	Legend LGD-OLY-BKSV	\$193.75	\$193.75	BSN #1101247	\$172.08	\$172.08	\$179.00	\$179.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Troy AOB-1500B 1500# olympic bar	\$195.60	\$195.60	
Olympic Power Curl Bar Solid ends no collars included	Promaxima	OLY-CURL-PO	1	Troy Barbell TOZ47	\$109.00	\$109.00	Troy Model TOZ-47	\$105.00	\$105.00	Troy TOZ-47B	\$79.05	\$79.05	BSN CHCOCBXX	\$52.08	\$52.08	\$125.00	\$125.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Tag 47" EZ Curl Bar	\$100.00	\$100.00	
Pro/Collegiate Trap bar accommodates small and large from adults	Promaxima	OLY-TRAP	1	Troy Barbell AOT56	\$195.00	\$195.00	Troy AOT-56	\$155.00	\$155.00	Perform Better 9701	\$123.75	\$123.75	BSN #PMWT126	\$204.62	\$									

				Fitness Things Address not Provided			G&F Fitness 7350 Transit Road Williamsville, NY 14221			Legend Fitness 5901 Middlebrook Pike Knoxville, TN 37909			BSN Sports, LLC P.O. Box 7726 Dallas, TX 75209			Pro Maxima 5310 Ashrook Houston, TX 77081			All Pro 45255 5 Mile Plymouth, MI 48170			Direct Fitness 600 Tower Road Mundelein, IL 60060		
Equipment Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	Qty	Alternate Make and Part Number	Price	Extended Price	Alternate Make and Part Number	Price	Extended Price	Alternate Make and Part Number	Price	Extended Price	Alternate Make and Part Number	Price	Extended Price	Alternate Make and Part Number	Price	Extended Price	Alternate Make and Part Number	Price	Extended Price	Alternate Make and Part Number	Price	Extended Price
Pro Half Rack 3"x3" Heavy wall steel double laser notched uprights 2	Promaxima	PL-340	1	TUFF STUFF PXL5-7910	\$2,110.00	\$2,110.00	Xtremem Model L	\$1,285.00	\$1,285.00	Legend Fitness 3142	\$937.50	\$937.50	No Bid		\$0.00		\$995.00	\$995.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Tag Fitness Power Rack	\$1,100.00	\$1,100.00
Assault Dual Action Air Bike:	Promaxima	CV-AIR-A	1	Life Core AS-Assault G	\$850.00	\$850.00	AS-ASSAULTB	\$759.00	\$759.00	Schwinn Airdyne AD	\$725.00	\$725.00	BSN/Stairmaster #1388449	\$2,596.08	\$2,596.08		\$895.00	\$895.00	Schwinn Air Dyme Pro	\$945.00	\$945.00	Same as spec	\$850.00	\$850.00
Promaxima Centurion Stepmill.	Promaxima	CV-25SM	1	Life Fitness CLPM Integrity Powermill	\$6,375.00	\$6,375.00	Lifetime CLPM-ALLXX-05	\$6,889.00	\$6,889.00	Matrix Fitness CSX	\$5,122.50	\$5,122.50	BSN/Stairmaster #1388450	\$3,802.96	\$3,802.96		\$4,295.00	\$4,295.00	Matrix C3X	\$4,495.00	\$4,495.00	Stairmaster SM5 Stepmill	\$4,095.00	\$4,095.00
VIPER Commercial Treadmill	Promaxima	CV-77141	1	Cybox 525T	\$3,750.00	\$3,750.00	BH LK500i	\$2,495.00	\$2,495.00	Matrix Fitness TX3	\$3,810.00	\$3,810.00	BSN/Spirit #1364697	\$3,215.08	\$3,215.08		\$2,195.00	\$2,195.00	Matrix T3X	\$3,595.00	\$3,595.00	Spirit Fitness CT800 Treadmill	\$2,195.00	\$2,195.00
Pro/Collegiate Trap Bar	Promaxima	OLY-TRAP	1	Troy Barbell AOT56	\$195.00	\$195.00			\$0.00	Perform Better 9701	\$123.75	\$123.75	BSN #PMWT126	\$204.62	\$204.62		\$179.00	\$179.00	No Bid		\$0.00	Troy AOT-56	\$159.00	\$159.00
Club Rower, chain driven, 500 lb user weight	Promaxima	CV-1100	1	Bodycraft VR400	\$895.00	\$895.00	Body Craft VR500-55	\$845.00	\$845.00	Concept 2 2712-US	\$842.39	\$842.39	BSN #1390989	\$1,463.78	\$1,463.78		\$895.00	\$895.00	Concept 2	\$945.00	\$945.00	Concept 2 Model D	\$965.00	\$965.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 45 lb	Promaxima	EZR-45	2	York Barbell 29083	\$70.88	\$141.76	Gronk 80053	\$45.00	\$90.00	Troy Barbell GP-045R	\$2.81	\$5.62	BSN #1272604	\$56.66	\$113.32		\$45.00	\$90.00			\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate-45#	\$63.00	\$126.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 35 lb	Promaxima	EZR-35	2	York Barbell 29082	\$55.13	\$110.26	Gronk 80052	\$35.00	\$70.00	Troy Barbell GP-035R	\$5.63	\$11.26	BSN #1272598	\$52.59	\$105.18		\$35.00	\$70.00			\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate-35#	\$49.00	\$98.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 25 lb	Promaxima	EZR-25	2	York Barbell 29081	\$39.38	\$78.76	Gronk 80051	\$25.00	\$50.00	Troy Barbell GP-025R	\$11.25	\$22.50	BSN #1272581	\$31.48	\$62.96		\$25.00	\$50.00			\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate-25#	\$35.00	\$70.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 10 lb	Promaxima	EZR-10	2	York Barbell 29080	\$15.75	\$31.50	Gronk 80050	\$10.00	\$20.00	Troy Barbell GP-010R	\$28.13	\$56.26	BSN #1272574	\$14.84	\$29.68		\$10.00	\$20.00			\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate-10#	\$14.00	\$28.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 5 lb	Promaxima	EZR-05	4	York Barbell 29079	\$7.88	\$31.52	Gronk 80049	\$5.00	\$20.00	Troy Barbell GP-005R	\$39.38	\$157.52	BSN #1272567	\$8.09	\$32.36		\$5.00	\$20.00			\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate-5#	\$7.00	\$28.00
Olympic Rubber Grip Plate 2.5 lb	Promaxima	EZR-02.5	2	York Barbell 29078	\$3.93	\$7.86	Gronk 80048	\$2.50	\$5.00	Troy Barbell GP-002R	\$50.63	\$101.26	BSN #1272550	\$5.22	\$10.44		\$2.50	\$5.00			\$0.00	Tag Rubber Grip Plate-2.5#	\$3.50	\$7.00
10 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-010	2	York Barbell 34053	\$15.75	\$31.50	SDR-010	\$10.00	\$20.00	Troy Barbell HD-010R	\$11.13	\$22.26	BSN #1347777	\$12.18	\$24.36		\$10.00	\$20.00			\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$13.50	\$27.00
20 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-020	2	York Barbell 34055	\$31.50	\$63.00	SDR-015	\$15.00	\$30.00	Troy Barbell HD-020R	\$22.25	\$44.50	BSN #1347791	\$24.38	\$48.76		\$20.00	\$40.00			\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$27.00	\$54.00
25 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-025	2	York Barbell 34059	\$39.38	\$78.76	SDR-025	\$25.00	\$50.00	Troy Barbell HD-025R	\$27.81	\$55.62	BSN #1347809	\$29.84	\$59.68		\$25.00	\$50.00			\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$33.75	\$67.50
30 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-030	2	York Barbell 34061	\$47.25	\$94.50	SDR-030	\$30.00	\$60.00	Troy Barbell HD-030R	\$33.38	\$66.76	BSN #1347814	\$37.62	\$75.24		\$30.00	\$60.00			\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$40.50	\$81.00
35 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-035	2	York Barbell 34062	\$55.13	\$110.26	SDR-035	\$35.00	\$70.00	Troy Barbell HD-035R	\$38.94	\$77.88	BSN #1347821	\$46.32	\$92.64		\$35.00	\$70.00			\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$47.25	\$94.50
40 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-040	2	York Barbell 34063	\$63.00	\$126.00	SDR-040	\$40.00	\$80.00	Troy Barbell HD-040R	\$44.50	\$89.00	BSN #1347838	\$52.72	\$105.44		\$40.00	\$80.00			\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$54.00	\$108.00
45 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-045	2	York Barbell 34064	\$70.88	\$141.76	SDR-045	\$45.00	\$90.00	Troy Barbell HD-045R	\$50.06	\$100.12	BSN #1347845	\$58.54	\$117.08		\$45.00	\$90.00			\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$60.75	\$121.50
50 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-050	2	York Barbell 34065	\$78.75	\$157.50	SDR-050	\$50.00	\$100.00	Troy Barbell HD-050R	\$55.63	\$111.26	BSN #1347869	\$68.16	\$136.32		\$50.00	\$100.00			\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$67.50	\$135.00
55 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-055	2	York Barbell 34066	\$86.63	\$173.26	SDR-055	\$55.00	\$110.00	Troy Barbell HD-055R	\$61.19	\$122.38	BSN #1347876	\$83.28	\$166.56		\$55.00	\$110.00			\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$74.25	\$148.50
60 lb Hex rubber dumbbells single	Promaxima	HEXR-060	2	York Barbell 34067	\$94.50	\$189.00	SDR-060	\$60.00	\$120.00	Troy Barbell HD-060R	\$66.75	\$133.50	BSN #1347883	\$95.09	\$190.18		\$60.00	\$120.00			\$0.00	TAG Fitness Rubber Hex	\$81.00	\$162.00
3 Tier shelve dumbbell rack, 5 ft. long, holds 15 pair	Promaxima	FW-233	1	USA/Troy Barbell GTDR-3	\$499.00	\$499.00	Body Solid Model GDR60 & GDR76	\$248.00	\$248.00	Troy Barbell GTDR-3	\$405.00	\$405.00	No Bid		\$0.00		\$325.00	\$325.00			\$0.00	TAG Fitness 3 Tier Dumbbell Rack	\$520.00	\$520.00
25 lb Rubber encased kettle bell with chrome handle	Promaxima	Kettle BPRO	1	Bodysport BDSKB25	\$53.50	\$53.50	UFG XM 4604	\$33.00	\$33.00	Troy Barbell CKB-025	\$40.63	\$40.63	BSN #1267297	\$48.87	\$48.87		\$31.25	\$31.25			\$0.00	Tag Kettlebell	\$44.00	\$44.00
35 lb Rubber encased kettle bell with chrome handle	Promaxima	Kettle BPRO	1	Bodysport BDSKB35	\$69.55	\$69.55	UFG XM 4605	\$45.00	\$45.00	Troy Barbell CKB-035	\$56.88	\$56.88	BSN #1267310	\$63.69	\$63.69		\$43.75	\$43.75			\$0.00	Tag Kettlebell	\$61.60	\$61.60
45 lb Rubber encased kettle bell with chrome handle	Promaxima	Kettle BPRO	1	Bodysport BDSKB45	\$91.90	\$91.90	UFG XM 4606	\$56.00	\$56.00	Troy Barbell CKB-045	\$73.13	\$73.13	BSN #1267334	\$74.98	\$74.98		\$56.25	\$56.25			\$0.00	Tag Kettlebell	\$79.20	\$79.20
50 lb Rubber encased kettle bell with chrome handle	Promaxima	Kettle BPRO	1	Bodysport BDSKB50	\$101.50	\$101.50	UFG 100-4607	\$65.00	\$65.00	Troy Barbell CKB-050	\$81.25	\$81.25	No Bid		\$0.00		\$62.50	\$62.50			\$0.00	Tag Kettlebell	\$88.00	\$88.00
15 lb deluxe medicine ball	Promaxima	MB-015	1	Dynamax DYM10016LB	\$99.95	\$99.95	UFG 100-3068	\$42.00	\$42.00	Perform Better 2616	\$49.94	\$49.94	No Bid		\$0.00		\$48.50	\$48.50			\$0.00	Tag Medicine Ball	\$51.00	\$51.00
25 lb deluxe medicine ball	Promaxima	MB-025	1	Dynamax DYM10025LB	\$119.95	\$119.95	UFG 100-3070	\$72.00	\$72.00	Perform Better 2619	\$73.69	\$73.69	No Bid		\$0.00		\$84.95	\$84.95			\$0.00	Tag Medicine Ball	\$77.00	\$77.00
Soft medicine ball 14 lb	Promaxima	11084	1	Dynamax DYM10014LB	\$94.95	\$94.95	UFG 100-3161	\$45.00	\$45.00	Troy Barbell PWB-014	\$47.50	\$47.50	BSN #PMTA1366	\$75.58	\$75.58		\$39.95	\$39.95			\$0.00	Troy Leather Wall Ball	\$49.80	\$49.80
Soft medicine ball 20 lb	Promaxima	11087	1	Dynamax DYM10014LB	\$109.95	\$109.95	UFG 100-3162	\$50.00	\$50.00	Troy Barbell PWB-020	\$58.75	\$58.75	BSN #PMTA1369	\$92.49	\$92.49		\$47.95	\$47.95			\$0.00	Troy Leather Wall Ball	\$102.00	\$102.00
Black Olympic 1500 lb Test ba	Promaxima	OLY-BAR-1500	1	Troy Barbell GOB1800	\$209.00	\$209.00	Troy GOB-1800	\$205.00	\$205.00	Legend LGD-OLY-BKSV	\$193.75	\$193.75	BSN #1101247	\$172.08	\$172.08		\$179.00	\$179.00			\$0.00	Troy AOB-1500# Olympic Bar	\$195.60	\$195.60
Olympic Power Curl Bar Solid ends no collars included	Promaxima	OLY-CURL-PO	1	Troy Barbell TOZ47	\$109.00	\$109.00	Troy TOZ-47	\$105.00	\$105.00	Troy Barbell TOZ-47B	\$79.05	\$79.05	BSN #CHCOBXX	\$52.08	\$52.08		\$125.00	\$125.00			\$0.00	Tag 47" EZ Curl Bar	\$100.00	\$100.00
Abdominal Mat. 100% foam core	Promaxima	ABMAT	2	ABMAT ABMAT	\$29.95	\$59.90	Xtreme Model L	\$39.00	\$78.00	Perform Better 1238	\$31.25	\$62.50	BSN #1369609	\$17.29	\$34.58		\$39.95	\$79.90			\$0.00	Tag Deluxe Eyelet Fitness Mat	\$31.50	\$63.00
ST-Extreme suspension training kit	Promaxima	ACST-XTREM	1	TRX Club4 Suspension Trailer	\$195.00	\$195.00	Commercial TRXClub4	\$165.00	\$165.00	Perform Better 7826	\$81.25	\$81.25	BSN #1377202	\$258.48	\$258.48		\$125.00	\$125.00			\$0.00	Jungle Gym XT	\$79.95	\$79.95
No limits timer (MDUSA)	Promaxima	AC-Timer	1	Pro Edition XTR 100	\$350.00	\$350.00	UFG Model 100-3300	\$195.00	\$195.00	Perform Better 5456	\$249.94	\$249.94	No Bid		\$0.00		\$375.00	\$375.00			\$0.00	First Place Interval Timer	\$229.00	\$229.00
				Freight	\$975.00	\$975.00	Delivery/Assembly	\$983.50	\$983.50	Freight and Install	\$3,210.69	\$3,210.69	Installation on Second floor	\$3,568.71	\$3,568.71	Freight and Install	\$2,400.00	\$2,400.00						
							Public Service Discount	\$125.00	\$125.00															
				<b>Subtotal Station #5</b>		<b>\$18,880.35</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #5</b>		<b>\$15,520.50</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #5</b>		<b>\$17,502.79</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #5</b>		<b>\$17,094.26</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #5</b>		<b>\$14,473.00</b>	<b>Subtotal Station #5</b>		<b>\$9,980.00</b>			<b>\$12,460.15</b>

\*\*Bid is different for station #5 because it listed items not quoted for this fire station

Totals for Fire Stations per Vendor

\$70,126.91

\$50,207.80

\$65,431.78

\$59,989.75

\$53,827.00

\$31,375.00

\$47,694.61