

Bleacher Safety Retrofitting/Purchasing New

RFP-RH-05-044

	Tallman Contracting	Michigan Playground	Engan-Tooley-Doyle
Base Proposal: Retrofitting Existing Bleachers			
<u>Borden Park - six (6) 10 row x 21' bleachers</u>			
Guardrails	\$ 6,630.00	No Bid	No Bid
Foot Boards	\$ 9,600.00	No Bid	No Bid
Kick Plate	\$ 5,400.00	No Bid	No Bid
In-Fill Material	\$ 7,200.00	No Bid	No Bid
In-Fill Material to be Used	Fencing	No Bid	No Bid
Mesh Size	1" x 1"	No Bid	No Bid
<u>Avondale Park - one (1) 5 row x 15' bleachers</u>			
Guardrails	\$ 1,105.00	No Bid	No Bid
Foot Boards	\$ 450.00	No Bid	No Bid
Kick Plate	\$ 300.00	No Bid	No Bid
In-Fill Material	\$ 630.00	No Bid	No Bid
In-Fill Material to be Used	Fencing	No Bid	No Bid
Mesh Size	1" x 1"	No Bid	No Bid
Base Bid Subtotal:	\$ 31,315.00	No Bid	No Bid
Alternate Proposal A: Retrofitting Additional Bleachers			
<u>Borden Park - four (4) 5 row x 15' bleachers</u>			
Guardrails	\$ 4,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Foot Boards	\$ 1,800.00	No Bid	No Bid
Kick Plate	\$ 1,200.00	No Bid	No Bid
In-Fill Material	\$ 2,520.00	No Bid	No Bid
In-Fill Material to be Used	Fencing	No Bid	No Bid
Mesh Size	1" x 1"	No Bid	No Bid
<u>Spencer Park - two (2) 5 row x 15' bleachers</u>			
Guardrails	\$ 2,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Foot Boards	\$ 900.00	No Bid	No Bid
Kick Plate	\$ 600.00	No Bid	No Bid
In-Fill Material	\$ 1,260.00	No Bid	No Bid

	Tallman Contracting	Michigan Playground	Engan-Tooley-Doyle
In-Fill Material to be Used	Fencing	No Bid	No Bid
Mesh Size	1" x 1"	No Bid	No Bid
Alternate A Subtotal:	\$ 14,280.00	No Bid	No Bid
Alternate Proposal B: Replacement Bleachers			
Borden Park - six (6) 10 row x 21' bleachers	\$ 66,000.00	\$ 61,576.00	\$ 51,900.00
Avondale Park - one (1) 5 row x 15' bleachers	\$ 4,050.00	\$ 3,915.00	\$ 3,245.00
Spencer Park - six (6) 3 row x 15' bleachers	\$ 18,000.00	\$ 6,408.00	\$ 6,900.00
Bleacher manufacturer	Highland Products	Jaypro	Sturdisteel Bleacher
Type of Frame	Aluminum	Galvanized Steel	Galvized Steel
*Storage Trailer and Dumpster		\$ 875.00	
Alternate B Subtotal:	\$ 88,050.00	\$ 72,774.00	\$ 62,045.00
Alternate Proposal C: Disposal of Existing Bleachers			
Borden Park - six (6) 10 row x 21' bleachers	\$ 5,100.00	\$ 1,140.00	\$ 3,900.00
Borden Park - four (4) 5 row x 15' bleachers	\$ 1,600.00	\$ 376.00	\$ 1,200.00
Avondale Park - one (1) 5 row x 15' bleachers	\$ 400.00	\$ 219.00	\$ 300.00
Spencer Park - two (2) 5 row x 15' bleachers	\$ 800.00	\$ 188.00	\$ 800.00
*Dumpster Rental:		\$ 425.00	
Alternate C Subtotal:	\$ 7,900.00	\$ 2,348.00	\$ 6,200.00