Van Hoosen Cemetary Irrigation Project
ITB-RH-25-037

Bids Opened: Thursday, May 29, 2025 @ 3:00 p.m.

Marc Dutton Irrigation, Inc.
4720 Hatchery Road
Waterford, MI 48329

Michigan Automatic Sprinkler
4350 Pineview Drive, Suite A
Commerce Township, MI 48390

American Sprinkler
34567 Glendale
Livonia, MI 48150

Item Number and Description | Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount
1. Mobilization, Max (5%) 1 Lump Sum no bid no bid $0.00 $0.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00
2. Audio Video Route Survey / Utility tracking 1 Lump Sum no bid no bid $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
3. Pavt, Rem, Mod 300 Square Yard no bid no bid $10.00 $3,000.00 $16.00 $4,800.00
4, Sidewalk, Rem 100 Square Yard no bid no bid $25.00 $2,500.00 $20.00 $2,000.00
5. Sidewalk, Conc, 4 inch, Modified 600 Square Feet no bid no bid $8.30 $4,980.00 $12.00 $7,200.00
6. Handpatching 25 Ton no bid no bid $110.00 $2,750.00 $600.00 $15,000.00
7. 2.5" PVS - Trench / Fittings 3,000 Foot $13.30 $39,900.00 $5.00 $15,000.00 $8.00 $24,000.00
8. 2" PVC - Trench / Fittings 1,600 Foot $3.50 $5,600.00 $1.50 $2,400.00 $6.00 $9,600.00
9. 1.5" PVC - Trench / Fittings 1,400 Foot $2.53 $3,542.00 $1.00 $1,400.00 $5.00 $7,000.00
10. 1.25" PVC - Trench / Fittings 6,800 Foot $0.93 $6,324.00 $0.80 $5,440.00 $4.20 $28,560.00
11. 1" PVC - Trench / Fittings 13,700 Foot $0.67 $9,179.00 $0.50 $6,850.00 $3.80 $52,060.00
12. 4" Pop-Up Sprinkler Assembly 510 Each $104.35 $53,218.50 $90.00 $45,900.00 $85.00 $43,350.00
13. 12" Pop-Up Sprinkler Assembly 300 Each $214.07 $64,221.00 $100.00 $30,000.00 $105.00 $31,500.00
14. I-25 Sprinkler Assembly 10 Each $700.00 $7,000.00 $359.00 $3,590.00 $150.00 $1,500.00
15. Quick Coupling Valve Assembly 5 Each $950.00 $4,750.00 $450.00 $2,250.00 $350.00 $1,750.00
16. 1" Valve Assembly 10 Each $500.00 $5,000.00 $295.00 $2,950.00 $500.00 $5,000.00
17. 1.5" Valve Assembly 58 Each $568.00 $32,944.00 $295.00 $17,110.00 $540.00 $31,320.00
18. 2" Valve Assembly 7 Each $1,171.00 $8,197.00 $295.00 $2,065.00 $600.00 $4,200.00
19. Irrigation Controller 2 Each $4,500.00 $9,000.00 $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00
20. Huter IDWIRE 3100 Foot $6.45 $19,995.00 $0.90 $2,790.00 $1.50 $4,650.00
21. Irrigation Boring (4") 200 Foot $125.00 $25,000.00 $35.00 $7,000.00 $30.00 $6,000.00
22. Watering Station 8 Each $1,875.00 $15,000.00 $800.00 $6,400.00 $300.00 $2,400.00
23. Mainline Master Valve Flow Sensor 2 Each $5,500.00 $11,000.00 $2,750.00 $5,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00
24, 2" Tap 2 Each no bid no bid $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00
25. 2HP Booster Pump Assembly 1 Lump Sum no bid no bid $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00
26. Project Restoration 1 Lump Sum $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00
27. Traffic Maintenance and Control 1 Lump Sum no bid no bid $450.00 $450.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00
Total [Total (Items 1-27): $349,870.50 $193,225.00 $343,890.00

* Corrected mathematical amount
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