ITB-RH-06-032

WATER SERVICE AND REPAIR PARTS COST

S.L.C. Meter Service, Inc.

Etna Supply

Cambridge Brass

10375 Dixie Hwy.

3175 Union SE

P.O. Box 249

Davisburg, Ml 48350

Grand Rapids, Ml 49548

140 Orion Place

Cambridge, Ontario

Canada NIR 5V1

Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
BRASS WATER TAP MATERIALS

Estimated Quantities - Description:
500 Ford 1" B44-444 PJ-Cts Curb Stops

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 47.31 57.00 43.53

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 50.06
500 Ford 1" F1000 Pack Joint Cts Copper

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 24.07 29.00 23.48

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 27.02
50 Ford 1" FB600 Flare Ball Corp Stops

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 28.64 34.50 27.43

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 31.45
50 Ford 1" F600 Flare Corp

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 22.61 27.25 22.05

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 25.36
50 Ford Couplers C44-44

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 9.93 12.00 9.64

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 11.09
50 Ford 1" to 3/4" Couplers C44-43

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 10.08 12.25 9.87

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 11.35
50 Ford 1 1/2" Couplers C44-66

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 30.36 36.50 29.46

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 33.88
50 Ford 1 1/2' 45 Degree Bends LA04-66

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 34.27 41.25 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid No Bid
50 Ford 1 1/2" 90 Degree Bends L92-66

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 43.47 52.25 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid No Bid
200 Ford 1 1/2" B44-666 PJ-CTS Curb Stops

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 103.50 124.50 100.53

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 115.61
200 Ford 1 1/2" FB1000 Ball Corp Stop Cts

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 61.95 74.50 61.50

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 73.80

100 Ford 2" B44-777 PJ-Cts Curb Stops




ITB-RH-06-032

WATER SERVICE AND REPAIR PARTS COST

S.L.C. Meter Service, Inc.

Etna Supply

Cambridge Brass

10375 Dixie Hwy.

3175 Union SE

P.O. Box 249

Davisburg, Ml 48350

Grand Rapids, Ml 49548

140 Orion Place

Cambridge, Ontario

Canada NIR 5V1

Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 145.52 175.00 137.21

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 157.79
100 Ford 2" FB1000 Ball Corp Stop Cts

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 102.46 123.30 97.07

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 111.63
50 Ford 2" 45 Degree Bends LA04-77

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 52.48 63.10 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid No Bid
50 Ford 2" 90 Degree Bends L04-77

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 74.19 89.25 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid
500 Ford 6 x 1" SS Brass Tapping Saddle

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 35.86 43.10 63.36

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 72.86
200 Ford 6 x 1 1/2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 71.99 86.55 72.45

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 83.32
100 Ford 6 x 2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 79.11 95.10 79.60

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 91.54
500 Ford 8 x 1 SS Brass Tapping Saddle

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 45.71 55.00 78.43

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 90.19
200 Ford 8 x 1 1/2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 82.05 98.60 82.56

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 94.83
100 Ford 8 x 2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 89.32 107.35 89.88

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 103.36
500 Ford 12 x 1" SS Brass Tapping Saddle

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 63.70 76.55 113.70

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 130.75
200 Ford 12 x 1 1/2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 127.45 153.20 128.24

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 147.78

100 Ford 12 x 2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
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Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 129.74 156.00 130.58
Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid 150.17
500 Ford 16 x 1" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 276.70 332.60 No Bid
Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid No Bid
200 Ford 16 x 1 1/2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 293.60 353.00 No Bid
Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid No Bid
100 Ford 16 x 2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 324.44 390.00 No Bid
Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid No Bid
800 Hadley W2ISK50A Plastic Curb Boxes with 3'
Steel Rods
Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 28.00 30.00 No Bid
Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid No Bid No Bid
WATER MAIN REPAIR CLAMPS
Estimated Quantities - Description:
10 Smith Blair 6 x 20" Stainless Steel Repair Clamps
- Super Range
Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 85.47 180.00 No Bid
Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 200.00 No Bid
10 Smith Blair 8 x 20" Stainless Steel Repair Clamps
- Super Range
Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 92.35 205.00 No Bid
Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 230.00 No Bid
10 Smith Blair 12 x 20" Stainless Steel Repair
Clamps - Super Range
Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 135.81 295.00 No Bid
Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 330.00 No Bid
MISCELLANEOUS
Estimated Quantities - Description:
15,000 5/8" Leather Gaskets Washer
Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 0.12 0.75 No Bid
Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 1.00 No Bid
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5,000 1" Leather Gaskets Washer

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 0.18 0.75 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 1.00 No Bid
400 1 1/2" Rubber Gasket

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 0.85 3.00 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 4.00 No Bid
400 2" Rubber Gasket

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 0.95 3.00 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 3.00 No Bid
100 3" Rubber Gasket

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 2.75 1.80 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 2.00 No Bid
50 4" Rubber Gasket

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 3.75 1.80 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 2.00 No Bid
5 Stopbox Wrench

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 13.60 25.00 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 30.00 No Bid
5 3' Stopbox Key

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 26.00 50.00 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 55.00 No Bid
5 6" Stopbox Key

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 28.00 55.00 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 60.00 No Bid
5 Gate Value Key

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 45.00 90.00 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 100.00 No Bid
25 Fernco 6 x 6 PVC

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 8.00 15.00 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 20.00 No Bid
15 Hydrant Wrench - Standard

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 25.00 25.00 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 35.00 No Bid
1 Ford D 77 Drill Tap 1" Machine

Unit Price: 8/1/2006-7/31/2007 621.00 1480.00 No Bid

Unit Price: 8/1/2007-8/01/2008 No Bid 1750.00 No Bid




