City of Rochester Hills, Michigan

Progect Agreegates for 2007 & 2008
ITB- RH-07-003 Tabulation |

Address 3 ] ' 11825 Green Oaks ind. Dnvg_ 43291 North Avenue ] 4020 C{}umy Lme - i 5850 Pardee 1830 Kirts Blvd. Suite #100
Wh__;f[more Lake Mi 48189 Cllnton Twp, E\/i[ 48036 . Lenex MI 48050 Taylor Mi 4818{) Troy,| Mi 48984

BID FORM A 2200 Tons Bltumlnous Mixture No Bid _INe Bid No Bid _INoBid  INoBid  [$85,800.00]$94,600.00

BID FORM A: 550 Tons Bituminous Mixture | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ) No Bld ~ INoBid No Bid $22,000.00] $24,200.00}

BID FORM A: 120 Gallons Bituminous Bond Coat No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid  |NoBid | NoBid [NoBid No Bid $480.00 | $480.00

BID FORM B: 10,000 Tons - 22A Road Gravel $95,000.00 | $97,000.00 | $96,600.00 | $98,600.00 | $83,000.00. 1$94,000.00| $97,500.00 |No Bid No Bid

BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - G Slag $20,325.00 | $20,625.00 | $20,055.00 | $20,505.00 | $19,950.00 $19,875.00{ $19,875.00 |No Bid No Bid

BiD FORM B: 1,500 Tons - 22X Slag $13,425.00 | $13,725.00 | $13,185.00 | $13,395.00 | $11,250.00 $12 000.00 {$11,625.00{ $11,625.00 |No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No No No Bid

Name: Gary's Transport Inc. Barrett Paving Materials  |Edw. C. Levy Co. {Tri-City Aggreagates Cadifiac Asphalt LLC
Address: 54255 Card Rd. 2040 Barrett Rd. 8800 Dix Avenue P.o. Box 182 51777 W. 12 Mile Rd.
Macomb, MI_48042 ~|Troy, MI 480 Detroit, MI 48209 Holly, M 48442 Wixom, Mi 48353

BID FORM A: 2200 Tons Bituminous Mixture No Bid |No Bid $88,000" No Bid [No Bid No Bid [INo Bid No Bid NoBid  [No Bid
BID FORM A: 550 Tons Bituminous Mixture | No Bid No Bid $22,000* | NoBid [NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid  |No Bid
BID FORM A: 120 Gallons Bituminous Bond Coat No Bid No Bid | $270* | NoBid |NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BID FORM B: 10,000 Tons - 22A Road Gravel 0.00 000  INoBid No Bid $88,200.00 | $88,200.00 | $88,000.00| $90,000.00 [No Bid No Bid
BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - G Slag 13.20 13.20 No Bid No Bid $19,560.00 § $19,560.00 ||No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - 22X Slag ' 7.67 7.67 No Bid No Bid $11,655.00{ $116,550.00 /[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BID FORM C: 250 Tons Bituminous Mixture | No Bid No Bid $23,250.00 [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18,750.00| $20,000.00

* Materials Picked Up at Plant in City Trucks; These

prices good {ill Dec 31,2007; Hot mix Picked up at Troy

Plant in City Trucks.(Barrett Paving Materials)

Name: John D. Osborne Trucking Inc.
Address. 37500 Northiine

Romulus, Ml 48174
|

BID FORM A: 2200 Tons Bituminous Mixture

BID FORM A: 550 Tons Bituminous Mixture | i No Bid

BID FORM A: 120 Galions Bituminous Bond Coat No Bid No Bid

BID FORM B: 10,000 Tons - 22A Road Gravel $86,000.00 .| $91,000.00

BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - G Slag $19,950.00 | $2070000 | |
BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - 22X Slag | $11,925.00 | $12,675.00

BID FORM C: 250 Tons Bituminous Mixture "|No Bid No Bid




