
CITY OF ROCHESTER HILLS, MICHIGAN

PROJECT: Fire Department Equipment

ITB-RH-15-036

Bid Opening June 29, 2015 @ 3:00 p.m.

NAME

ADDRESS

Fittings, Valves & Hardware: Qty. Make/Model Unit Cost Ext. Cost Make/Model Unit Cost Ext. Cost Make/Model Unit Cost Ext. Cost Make/Model Unit Cost Ext. Cost

2.5" to 1.5" Gated WYE Valve (DST on 2.5" Female) 7 Akron 1581 $614.98 Kochek 22K15025 $288.44 $2,019.08 No Bid No Bid

2.5" Threaded Encased Line Gauge (DST on both Male and 

Female) 9 Kochek LG25 $139.80 $1,258.20 Kochek LG25 $147.33 No Bid No Bid

Deluge Quad Stacked Tips 2.5" Inlet x 1.75" x 1.50" x 1-

3/8" Outlet 2 Elkhart ST-191-1 $358.23 $716.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Deluge Quad Stacked Tip  2.5" Inlet x 2.0" x 1.75" x 1.50" 

Outlets 3 Elkhart ST-191 $358.23 $1,074.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.5” Streamshaper for Portable Monitor 2 Elkhart 282A $137.43 $274.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Aerial Stream Shaper Elkhart Model 283B (Satin) (NST) 

Thread 3 Elkhart 283B $177.68 $533.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Air Aspirating Foam Nozzle- Elkhart Model 247-S (150 

GPM) 9 Elkhart 247-S $172.50 $1,552.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Elkhart Inline Eductor, 150 GPM, 2.5" inlet (DST) and 1.5" 

outlet (NST) 4 Elkhart 241-150 $468.05 $1,872.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Handline Nozzle Stream Shaper 1.5” (NST) Inlet x 1.5” 

(NST) Outlet 18 Elkhart 281-A $73.03 $1,314.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Smoothbore Handline Tips (Triple Stacked 1.5" Inlet x 1-

1/4"x1-1/8"x1.0" Outlet 18 Elkhart ST-190B $268.53 $4,833.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.5" Solid Strike Nozzle Elkhart Model SS-475-GAT 9 Elkhart SS-475GAT $519.80 $4,678.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4" to 5" Stortz Adapter with Swivel 9 Kochek S60S54 $128.93 $1,160.37 Kochek S60S54 $131.96 No Bid No Bid

Turbo Draft 4" Stortz and 2.5" (DST on Female End) 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4" Stortz to (2) 2.5" 2-Way Ball Valve (DST on Male End) 9 Kochek 21K2504 $290.79 $2,617.11 Kochek 21K2504 $301.88 No Bid No Bid

5" (NST) Female to 4" Stortz 1 Kochek S37S45 $103.85 $103.85 Kochek S37S45 $110.48 No Bid No Bid

Elkhart TSM-30FLP (Break away Nozzle only) 2 Elkhart TSM-30FLP $558.90 $1,117.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.5" (DST) Female Swivel to 2.5" NST Male 1 Kochek 54R2525 $49.96 $49.96 Kochek 54R2525 $64.43 No Bid No Bid

2.5" (DST) Swivel Female to 4" Stortz 2 Kochek S54R425 $96.77 $193.54 Kochek S54R425 $107.84 No Bid No Bid

2.5" Gate Valve with (DST Male and Female) 2 Kochek 09K25225M $182.69 $365.38 Kochek 09K25225M $186.88 No Bid No Bid

2.5" (DST) Female to 2.5" (NST) Male Adapter 14 Kochek 37R2525 $21.20 Kochek 37R2525 $21.14 $295.96 No Bid No Bid

2.5" (NST) Female to 2.5 (DST) Male (Sweep Elbow) 2 Kochek KE25R25 $83.33 $166.66 Kochek KEP25L25 $139.39 No Bid No Bid

Hose Clamp (2.5" to 3" Hose) 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Storz Spanner & Bracket Set 13 Kochek KS34 $67.50 $877.50 Kochek KS34 $82.42 No Bid No Bid

2 Spanner Wrenches and Bracket Set 13 Kochek K46.-2 $45.89 $596.57 Kochek KS34 $82.42 No Bid No Bid

Electrical:

Electric Cord Keeper- Model AM062 ( 2 per Pack) 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fire Vulcan Box Lights Model AZ117 45 Streamlight 44401 $104.72 Streamlight Vulcan LED 44450 $142.08 Streamlight 44450 $157.85 Streamlight 44401 $100.59 $4,526.55

Hot Stick Voltage Detector with Padded Pouch – Model 

BL318 5 No Bid Hot Stick w/ padded case $305.50 No Bid Hot Stick USA $273.26 $1,366.30

500 Watt Halogen Portable Light with household plug  - 

Model AR301 18 No Bid No Bid No Bid Akron E-500PL $252.39 $4,543.02

16" Electrical Ram Fan - Model EX400 1 Tempest VS-16-R-20 $2,300.99 Supervac 716E2* $1,537.50 Euramco EB0600 $2,630.26 Ramfan EX400 $2,139.65 $2,139.65

18” Electrical Ram Fan - Model EX500 3 Tempest VS-18-R-20 $2,371.79 Supervac 718VR3* $2,235.00 Euramco EK85500 $2,908.95 Ramfan EX500 $2,297.50 $6,892.50

First Due  Fire Supply

207 E. Kipp Rd., Suite A

Mason, MI 48854

Essential Equipment Solutions

941 Enterprise Drive 

St. Charles, IL 60174

Douglass Safety Systems

2655 N. Meridian Rd, # 6

Sanford, MI 48657

Safeware Inc

4403 Forbes Boulevard

Lanham, MD 20706



CITY OF ROCHESTER HILLS, MICHIGAN

PROJECT: Fire Department Equipment

ITB-RH-15-036

Bid Opening June 29, 2015 @ 3:00 p.m.

NAME

ADDRESS

Tools/Equipment: Make/Model Unit Cost Ext. Cost Make/Model Unit Cost Ext. Cost Make/Model Unit Cost Ext. Cost Make/Model Unit Cost Ext. Cost

Glasmaster Extrication Saw - Model AB-885 7 Glasmaster GMM-2 $181.72 No Bid No Bid Glasmaster $150.99 $1,056.93

K-950 Partner Rescue Saw 14"- Model K-12FD 8 Firehooks K-12FD 14 x 30 $1,380.60 Supervac Tiger Tooth SVC4-14 $1,612.50 FireHooks K12FD14x30 $1,806.90 Partner K12FD 14 x 30 $1,360.47 $10,883.76

Piraya Diamond Rescue Blade 14" 8 Firehooks SUP14 $171.10 Supervac Tiger Tooth SVC310-14$255.00 FireHooks PRO14 $168.17 $1,345.36 No Bid

Fol-Da-Tank - Floating Dock Strainer with 4” Stortz 1 Fol-Da-Tank FDS40 $517.91 FDS4 $470.25 No Bid Fol-Da-Tank FDS 4.0-STORZ $437.44 $437.44

Two Person Hand Held Hose Roller  Model AF155 9 No Bid Kochek KHR-2 $150.49 $1,354.41 No Bid Kochek KHR-2** $14.70

Firehooks Unlimited 6' FDNY Roof Hook 4 Firehooks RH-6 $82.80 $331.20 RH-6 $99.95 FireHooks RH-6 $110.51 No Bid

Hydra Ram Hydraulic Emergency Entry Tool 3 Firehooks HR-1* $1,610.00 HR-1* $1,600.00 FireHooks HR-2 $1,922.20 Firehooks Hydra Ram 2 $1,839.08 $5,517.24

Elevator Key Sets 7 Firehooks EKS-12 $166.75 $1,167.25 EKS-12 $173.99 FireHooks EKS-112 $187.39 Firehooks EKS-12 $168.60

Firehooks Unlimited Dynamic Trio Forcible Entry Kit 4 Firehooks DT-3 $276.00 $1,104.00 DT-3 $283.20 FireHooks DT-3 $293.10 Firehooks DT-3 $279.07

Firehooks Unlimited 30" Pro Halligan Bar 1 Firehooks PB-30 $201.25 $201.25 PB-30 $225.00 FireHooks PB-30 $216.22 Firehooks PB-30 $203.49

Avon: Hydrant Bucket, Multi-Purpose 9 No Bid No Bid No Bid Avon CM-2079 $56.43 $507.87

R&B Fabrications Milwaukee Strap Hose Pack-HP 9 R&B M/S-HP $119.37 $1,074.33 No Bid No Bid R&B Fab* $116.00

R&B Fabrications Milwaukee Continental Carry Pack 9 R&B M/S-HP-36* $110.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hydrant Wrench – Triangle Head 4 Akron Brass # 15 $61.37 Zepher Z52/D1 $69.59 FireHooks HW-1 $38.89 $155.56 No Bid

L957 Flat Head Axe 1 Akron Brass FHY-6 $55.37 No Bid FireHooks FA-6 $48.05 $48.05 No Bid

D114 Steel Fire Brush Rake 18 Akron Brass FR-12 $27.35 $492.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Safety:

Mustang Survival Universal Swiftwater Rescue Vest 6 RNR-Sterns 4185* $119.14 Mustang MRV150 $195.00 NRS Extrasport Swift Water $225.79 Mustang MRV-150 $152.94 $917.64

RQ3 Storm Pro Water Rescue Helmet 8 RNR Havoc 42604 $36.76 No Bid NRS Havoc Helmet 2042 $38.39 RQ3 HL7050 L/XL Red $31.34 $250.72

RQ3 Second Chance Throwbag 6 RNR ST675* $44.28 Mustang MRD 175* $50.22 NRS Throwbag 1821 $77.79 RQ3 BG3144 $61.57 $369.42

J922L Large (46” to 48”) Nylon Ladder Belt with Pompier 

Hook 2 No Bid Gemtor 531-3 $207.43 No Bid Gemtor 531-3 $153.14 $306.28

Junkin Stokes Basket (1 piece) Model  JSA-200 4 RNR SAF200 $652.97 JSA200 $599.00 PMI PE42143 $432.45 $1,729.80 Junkin JSA-200 $560.86

CMC Pro Series Litter Harness 4 RNR WLB $88.96 CMC 724121 $241.49 CMC 371290-REG Combo $456.47 CMC 724121 $212.82 $851.28

XL Steel Locking Carabiners (NFPA 1983 Class G) 16 RNR BINER23* $27.57 $441.12 CMC 371290 $35.33 CMC 371290 $36.28 CMC 371290 $29.57

Velcro Irons Marrying Strap Model AJ-114 9 Firehooks MS-1 $10.93 $98.37 Firehooks MS-1 $13.00 FireHooks MS-1 $12.49 Firehooks MS-1 $11.18

Fire Research Corp - Safer Search System Model  BG543 

(200') 4 No Bid Fire Researse  SDA220-A20 $1,143.18 No Bid FRC -SDA200-A20 $956.73 $3,826.92

28” Collapsible Traffic Cones (set of five) 5 MDI SA-43331 $184.35 $921.75 SA-52148 $245.00 No Bid

$31,188.54 $3,669.45 $3,278.77 $44,393.52

Four bids deemed non-responsive

Douglass Safety Systems First Due  Fire Supply Essential Equipment Solutions Safeware Inc

2655 N. Meridian Rd, # 6 207 E. Kipp Rd., Suite A 941 Enterprise Drive 4403 Forbes Boulevard

Sanford, MI 48657 Mason, MI 48854 St. Charles, IL 60174 Lanham, MD 20706

Total Purchase Cost = $82,530.28

*Product bid not approved by City as equal.


