
ITB-RH-07-033
WATER SERVICE AND REPAIR PARTS COST

Name: ETNA SUPPLY Cambridge Brass Limited SLC Meter
Address: 3175 Union SE 140 Orion Pl 10375 Dixie Hwy

Grand Rapids, MI 49548 Cambridge ON, Canada N1T1R9 Davisburg, MI  48350-1305
Attn:  Juan Gonzales Attn:  Greg Bell Attn: Jason Durham

Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
BRASS WATER TAP MATERIALS
Estimated Quantities - Description:

500 Ford 1" B44-444 PJ-Cts Curb Stops
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 44.51$                             44.58$                                          46.25$                                   
      Unit Price: 9/1/2008-8/31/2009 52.36$                             46.81$                                          No Bid
500 Ford 1" F1000 Pack Joint Cts Copper
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 22.64$                             22.68$                                          23.52$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-831/2009 26.63$                             23.81$                                          No Bid
50 Ford 1" FB600 Flare Ball Corp Stops
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 26.93$                             26.98$                                          27.98$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 31.68$                             28.32$                                          No Bid
50  Ford 1" F600 Flare Corp
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 21.27$                             21.31$                                          22.10$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 25.02$                             22.37$                                          No Bid
50 Ford Couplers C44-44
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 9.33$                               9.35$                                            9.70$                                     
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 10.97$                             9.82$                                            No Bid
50 Ford 1" to 3/4" Couplers C44-43
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 9.48$                               9.50$                                            9.86$                                     
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 11.15$                             9.97$                                            No Bid
50 Ford 1 1/2" Couplers C44-66
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 28.56$                             28.61$                                          29.68$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 33.60$                             30.04$                                          No Bid
50 Ford 1 1/2' 45 Degree Bends LA04-66
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 32.24$                             No Bid 33.50$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 37.93$                             No Bid No Bid
50 Ford 1 1/2" 90 Degree Bends L02-66
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 40.89$                             No Bid 42.48$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 48.10$                             No Bid No Bid
200 Ford 1 1/2" B44-666 PJ-CTS Curb Stops
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 97.37$                             97.53$                                          101.16$                                 
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 114.55$                           102.41$                                        No Bid
200 Ford 1 1/2" FB1000 Ball Corp Stop Cts
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 58.28$                             58.37$                                          60.56$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 68.56$                             61.29$                                          No Bid
100 Ford 2" B44-777 PJ-Cts Curb Stops



ITB-RH-07-033
WATER SERVICE AND REPAIR PARTS COST

Name: ETNA SUPPLY Cambridge Brass Limited SLC Meter
Address: 3175 Union SE 140 Orion Pl 10375 Dixie Hwy

Grand Rapids, MI 49548 Cambridge ON, Canada N1T1R9 Davisburg, MI  48350-1305
Attn:  Juan Gonzales Attn:  Greg Bell Attn: Jason Durham

Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 136.90$                           137.12$                                        142.23$                                 
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 161.05$                           143.97$                                        No Bid
100 Ford 2" FB1000 Ball Corp Stop Cts
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 96.39$                             96.54$                                          100.15$                                 
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 113.40$                           101.37$                                        No Bid
50 Ford 2" 45 Degree Bends LA04-77
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 49.37$                             No Bid 51.30$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 58.08$                             No Bid No Bid
50 Ford 2" 90 Degree Bends L04-77
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 69.80$                             No Bid 75.52$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 82.11$                             No Bid No Bid
500 Ford 6 x 1" SS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 33.73$                             39.90$                                          35.05$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 39.68$                             41.90$                                          No Bid
200 Ford 6 x 1 1/2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 67.73$                             67.84$                                          70.37$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 79.68$                             71.23$                                          No Bid
100 Ford 6 x 2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 74.42$                             74.54$                                          77.32$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 87.55$                             78.27$                                          No Bid
500 Ford 8 x 1 SS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 43.00$                             50.85$                                          44.68$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 50.58$                             53.40$                                          No Bid
200 Ford 8 x 1 1/2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 77.20$                             77.32$                                          80.20$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 90.82$                             81.18$                                          No Bid
100 Ford 8 x 2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 84.03$                             84.16$                                          87.31$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 98.86$                             88.37$                                          No Bid
500 Ford 12 x 1" SS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 59.93$                             70.87$                                          62.27$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 70.50$                             74.41$                                          No Bid
200 Ford 12 x 1 1/2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 119.90$                           120.09$                                        124.56$                                 
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 141.05$                           126.09$                                        No Bid
100 Ford 12 x 2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 122.06$                           122.26$                                        126.81$                                 
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 143.60$                           128.37$                                        No Bid



ITB-RH-07-033
WATER SERVICE AND REPAIR PARTS COST

Name: ETNA SUPPLY Cambridge Brass Limited SLC Meter
Address: 3175 Union SE 140 Orion Pl 10375 Dixie Hwy

Grand Rapids, MI 49548 Cambridge ON, Canada N1T1R9 Davisburg, MI  48350-1305
Attn:  Juan Gonzales Attn:  Greg Bell Attn: Jason Durham

Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
500 Ford 16 x 1" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 260.33$                           No Bid 270.45$                                 
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 306.27$                           No Bid No Bid
200 Ford 16 x 1 1/2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 276.22$                           No Bid 286.97$                                 
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 324.96$                           No Bid No Bid
100 Ford 16 x 2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 305.25$                           No Bid 317.11$                                 
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 359.11$                           No Bid No Bid
800 Hadley W21SK50A Plastic Curb Boxes
With 3' Steel Rods
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 20.85$                             No Bid 30.00$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 24.53$                             No Bid No Bid

WATER MAIN REPAIR CLAMPS
Estimated Quantities - Description:
10 Smith Blair 6 x 20" Stainless Steel Repair 
Clamps - Super Range
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 150.06$                           No Bid 116.61$                                 
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 176.54$                           No Bid No Bid

10 Smith Blair 8 x 20" Stainless Steel Repair 
Clamps - Super Range
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 170.32$                           No Bid 126.00$                                 
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 200.37$                           No Bid No Bid

10 Smith Blair 12 x 20" Stainless Steel Repair 
Clamps - Super Range
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 241.52$                           No Bid 185.29$                                 
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 284.14$                           No Bid No Bid

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS
Estimated Quantities - Description:
15,000    5/8" Leather Gaskets Washer
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 0.29$                               No Bid 0.30$                                     
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 0.38$                               No Bid No Bid
5,000    1" Leather Gaskets Washer



ITB-RH-07-033
WATER SERVICE AND REPAIR PARTS COST

Name: ETNA SUPPLY Cambridge Brass Limited SLC Meter
Address: 3175 Union SE 140 Orion Pl 10375 Dixie Hwy

Grand Rapids, MI 49548 Cambridge ON, Canada N1T1R9 Davisburg, MI  48350-1305
Attn:  Juan Gonzales Attn:  Greg Bell Attn: Jason Durham

Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 0.31$                               No Bid 0.32$                                     
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 0.41$                               No Bid No Bid
400   1 1/2" Rubber Gasket
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 1.36$                               No Bid 1.40$                                     
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 1.81$                               No Bid No Bid
400   2" Rubber Gasket
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 1.54$                               No Bid 1.60$                                     
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 2.05$                               No Bid No Bid
100   3" Rubber Gasket
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 1.00$                               No Bid 3.00$                                     
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 1.30$                               No Bid No Bid
50    4" Rubber Gasket
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 1.00$                               No Bid 4.00$                                     
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 1.30$                               No Bid No Bid
5    Stopbox Wrench
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 12.43$                             No Bid 15.00$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 16.57$                             No Bid No Bid
5    3' Stopbox Key
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 24.02$                             No Bid 32.00$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 32.02$                             No Bid No Bid
5    6" Stopbox Key
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 31.42$                             No Bid 35.00$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 41.89$                             No Bid No Bid
5    Gate Value Key
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 51.38$                             No Bid 80.00$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 68.50$                             No Bid No Bid

**6' valve key
25   Fernco 6 x 6 PVC
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 7.80$                               No Bid 8.00$                                     
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 10.40$                             No Bid No Bid
15   Hydrant Wrench - Standard
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 30.00$                             No Bid 24.00$                                   
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 40.00$                             No Bid No Bid
1    Ford D 77 Drill Tap 1" Machine
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008 609.26$                           No Bid 575.00$                                 
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009 716.77$                           No Bid No Bid



ITB-RH-07-033
WATER SERVICE AND REPAIR PARTS COST

Name: ETNA SUPPLY Cambridge Brass Limited SLC Meter
Address: 3175 Union SE 140 Orion Pl 10375 Dixie Hwy

Grand Rapids, MI 49548 Cambridge ON, Canada N1T1R9 Davisburg, MI  48350-1305
Attn:  Juan Gonzales Attn:  Greg Bell Attn: Jason Durham

Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price

 **W/ 3/4" & 1" boaring bars - 
no bits machine only 



ITB-RH-07-033
WATER SERVICE AND REPAIR PARTS COST

Name:
Address:

BRASS WATER TAP MATERIALS
Estimated Quantities - Description:

500 Ford 1" B44-444 PJ-Cts Curb Stops
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price: 9/1/2008-8/31/2009
500 Ford 1" F1000 Pack Joint Cts Copper
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-831/2009
50 Ford 1" FB600 Flare Ball Corp Stops
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
50  Ford 1" F600 Flare Corp
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
50 Ford Couplers C44-44
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
50 Ford 1" to 3/4" Couplers C44-43
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
50 Ford 1 1/2" Couplers C44-66
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
50 Ford 1 1/2' 45 Degree Bends LA04-66
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
50 Ford 1 1/2" 90 Degree Bends L02-66
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
200 Ford 1 1/2" B44-666 PJ-CTS Curb Stops
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
200 Ford 1 1/2" FB1000 Ball Corp Stop Cts
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
100 Ford 2" B44-777 PJ-Cts Curb Stops

Gunners Meters and Parts Jett Pump & Valve LLC
454 N. Cass Ave 4770 Pontiac Lake Rd
Pontiac, MI  48342 Waterford, MI  48328
Attn: Jeff Kovich Attn: Paul M. Marchi

Bid Price Bid Price

**Quoted Alternate A.Y. 
McDonald Brass

42.25$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

21.50$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

25.80$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

20.40$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

8.95$                                     No Bid
No Bid No Bid

9.10$                                     No Bid
No Bid No Bid

27.40$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

60.15$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

65.35$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

93.50$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

55.95$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid



ITB-RH-07-033
WATER SERVICE AND REPAIR PARTS COST

Name:
Address:

      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
100 Ford 2" FB1000 Ball Corp Stop Cts
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
50 Ford 2" 45 Degree Bends LA04-77
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
50 Ford 2" 90 Degree Bends L04-77
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
500 Ford 6 x 1" SS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
200 Ford 6 x 1 1/2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
100 Ford 6 x 2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
500 Ford 8 x 1 SS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
200 Ford 8 x 1 1/2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
100 Ford 8 x 2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
500 Ford 12 x 1" SS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
200 Ford 12 x 1 1/2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
100 Ford 12 x 2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009

Gunners Meters and Parts Jett Pump & Valve LLC
454 N. Cass Ave 4770 Pontiac Lake Rd
Pontiac, MI  48342 Waterford, MI  48328
Attn: Jeff Kovich Attn: Paul M. Marchi

Bid Price Bid Price
131.40$                                 No Bid

No Bid No Bid

92.50$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

88.10$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

91.50$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

29.15$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

58.50$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

64.35$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

37.15$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

66.70$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

72.50$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

51.80$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

103.60$                                 No Bid
No Bid No Bid

105.50$                                 No Bid
No Bid No Bid



ITB-RH-07-033
WATER SERVICE AND REPAIR PARTS COST

Name:
Address:

500 Ford 16 x 1" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
200 Ford 16 x 1 1/2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
100 Ford 16 x 2" DS Brass Tapping Saddle
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
800 Hadley W21SK50A Plastic Curb Boxes
With 3' Steel Rods
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009

WATER MAIN REPAIR CLAMPS
Estimated Quantities - Description:
10 Smith Blair 6 x 20" Stainless Steel Repair 
Clamps - Super Range
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009

10 Smith Blair 8 x 20" Stainless Steel Repair 
Clamps - Super Range
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009

10 Smith Blair 12 x 20" Stainless Steel Repair 
Clamps - Super Range
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS
Estimated Quantities - Description:
15,000    5/8" Leather Gaskets Washer
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
5,000    1" Leather Gaskets Washer

Gunners Meters and Parts Jett Pump & Valve LLC
454 N. Cass Ave 4770 Pontiac Lake Rd
Pontiac, MI  48342 Waterford, MI  48328
Attn: Jeff Kovich Attn: Paul M. Marchi

Bid Price Bid Price

225.05$                                 No Bid
No Bid No Bid

239.20$                                 No Bid
No Bid No Bid

260.10$                                 No Bid
No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

No Bid 244.77
No Bid 257.66

Part No 261-00069020-000

No Bid 275.07
No Bid 289.55

Part No 261-00090520-000

No Bid 395.88
No Bid 416.71

Part No 261-00132020-000

0.32$                                     No Bid
No Bid No Bid



ITB-RH-07-033
WATER SERVICE AND REPAIR PARTS COST

Name:
Address:

      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
400   1 1/2" Rubber Gasket
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
400   2" Rubber Gasket
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
100   3" Rubber Gasket
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
50    4" Rubber Gasket
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
5    Stopbox Wrench
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
5    3' Stopbox Key
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
5    6" Stopbox Key
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
5    Gate Value Key
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009

25   Fernco 6 x 6 PVC
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
15   Hydrant Wrench - Standard
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009
1    Ford D 77 Drill Tap 1" Machine
      Unit Price:  9/1/2007-8/31/2008
      Unit Price:  9/1/2008-8/31/2009

Gunners Meters and Parts Jett Pump & Valve LLC
454 N. Cass Ave 4770 Pontiac Lake Rd
Pontiac, MI  48342 Waterford, MI  48328
Attn: Jeff Kovich Attn: Paul M. Marchi

Bid Price Bid Price
0.35$                                     No Bid

No Bid No Bid

1.25$                                     No Bid
No Bid No Bid

1.35$                                     No Bid
No Bid No Bid

2.25$                                     No Bid
No Bid No Bid

2.65$                                     No Bid
No Bid No Bid

31.20$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

28.90$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

32.20$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

38.80$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

10.00$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

25.00$                                   No Bid
No Bid No Bid

750.00$                                 No Bid
No Bid No Bid



ITB-RH-07-033
WATER SERVICE AND REPAIR PARTS COST

Name:
Address:

Gunners Meters and Parts Jett Pump & Valve LLC
454 N. Cass Ave 4770 Pontiac Lake Rd
Pontiac, MI  48342 Waterford, MI  48328
Attn: Jeff Kovich Attn: Paul M. Marchi

Bid Price Bid Price


