City of Farmington Hills, Ml
Historical Rock Salt Bid Resulis

Low Bid ¥r to Yr

Year North American |Cargill Salf, Inc. {Morton, Salt, Inc. Others | Avg $/Ton | Increase/Decrease
2009 $60.77 $67.77

2008 345,82 No bid $54.34 $44.45 26%
2007 $37.82 $49.50 $37.62 $33.94 0%
2008 $32.58 No Bid $30.61 10%
2005 $33.81 No Bid $20.44 -19%
2004 $35.83 $35.39 $50.59 | $37.62 0%
2003 $36.32 $33.39 $32.21 0%
2002 $33.96 iR2865. $33.26 -£1%
2001 No bid No bid 346,35 227.21%
2000 $27.47 $26.79 $26.34 8.80%
1999 $24.70 $23.85 i $21.16 ~28%
1998 $31.00 Lo gpEan $26.22 -8.70%
1947 $32.00 $29.78 $29.97 9.7%
1996 $25.64 $29.78 32768 -1.4%
1965 --$26.007 $30.11 $27 .97 -1.3%
1994 $28.48 $28.68 $27.84 11.3%
1993 $24.70 $25.93 $24.77 7.9%
1992 $26.93 $23.40 $24.09

Denotas lowbid =

rock salt price evaluations.xis

Tray
Early Late

$25.16  $32.13
$23.96 $27.17
$20.48 $25.31

Sterling Hgis
Early Late

$36.95
$22.67
$20.84
$21.11



