CITY OF ROCHESTER HILLS, MICHIGAN

PROJECT: Aggregates 2010

ITB-RH-09-005 TABULATION

Bids Read: January 21, 2010 @ 3:00 P.M.

NAME Edw. C. Levy Company Richmond Transport, Inc. Tri City Aggregates, Inc.

ADDRESS 8800 Dix Avenue 4020 County Line 14300 Shields Road
Detroit, Michigan 48209 Lenox, Michigan 48050 Holly, Ml 48442

YEAR 2010

2200 Tons / Bitumin-

ous Mixture 1100L No Bid No Bid No Bid

550 Tons / Bituminous

Mixture 1100T No Bid No Bid No Bid

120 Gallons / Bitum-

inous Bond Coat No Bid No Bid No Bid

10,000 Tons / 22A Road
Gravel

$9.50 per ton

$9.00 per ton

$8.70 per ton

1,500 Tons / 5G Slag $14.05 per ton $13.90 per ton No Bid
1,500 Tons / 22X Slag  |$7.80 per ton $7.95 per ton No Bid
250 Tons / Bituminous

Mixture CP-7 No Bid No Bid No Bid

*Do not carry umbrella liability insurance




CITY OF ROCHESTER HILLS, MICHIGAN

PROJECT: Aggregates 2010

ITB-RH-09-005 TABULATION

Bids Read: January 21, 2010 @ 3:00 P.M.

NAME Gary's Transport, Inc. Barrett Paving Materials, Inc. Osburn Industries, Inc.
ADDRESS 54255 Card Rd. 2040 Barrett Street 5850 Pardee Road

Macomb, Ml 48042 Troy, Michigan 48084 Taylor, Ml 48180
YEAR 2010
2200 Tons / Bitumin-
ous Mixture 1100L No Bid $55.00 per ton No Bid
550 Tons / Bituminous
Mixture 1100T No Bid $55.00 per ton No Bid
120 Gallons / Bitum-
inous Bond Coat No Bid No Bid No Bid

*Hot Mix picked up at plant in City Truck

10,000 Tons / 22A Road
Gravel No Bid No Bid $9.55 per ton
1,500 Tons / 5G Slag $14.45 per ton No Bid $14.55 per ton
1,500 Tons /22X Slag  |$7.98 per ton No Bid $8.10 per ton

250 Tons / Bituminous
Mixture CP-7

No Bid

$95.00 per ton

No Bid

*Bid based on availablility of material from
pit quotes were provided from

*Delivered 50 ton minimum load




CITY OF ROCHESTER HILLS, MICHIGAN

PROJECT: Aggregates 2010

ITB-RH-09-005 TABULATION

Bids Read: January 21, 2010 @ 3:00 P.M.

NAME Ajax Materials Corporation Tebben Brothers Ltd

ADDRESS 830 Kirts Blvd. Suite #100 231 Romeo Road
Troy, Ml 48084 Rochester, Ml 48307

YEAR 2010

2200 Tons /

Bituminous Mixture

1100L $44.75 per ton No Bid

550 Tons / Bituminous

Mixture 1100T $45.15 per ton No Bid

120 Gallons / Bitum-

inous Bond Coat $4.00 per gallon No Bid

*Material p/up at Crooks plant/Bald Mt. plant

10,000 Tons / 22A Road

Gravel No Bid $10.60 per ton
1,500 Tons / 5G Slag No Bid $15.50 per ton
1,500 Tons / 22X Slag No Bid $9.65 per ton

250 Tons / Bitumin-ous
Mixture CP-7

$96.25 per ton

No Bid




