City of Rochester Hills:
ITB-RH-07-001

i

READY MIX CONCRETE §b._.mm_>rw

Reads: January ¢, 2007 @ 3.00 pm

i

|
Name: , |Arlington Transit Mix & Masonry Supply [Clawson & Kitliins Concrete Companies Utica Transit Mix

Address: K, 7500 23 Miie Road! 27575 Wixom Road/ P.O. Box 768 _|42380 Yearego Drive

“ Shelby Township, Mi 48316-4422  |Novi, Mi 48376-0768 Sterling Heights, M 48314
Materials: e il aam ,
35P-6 Sack Concrete (Yd) - 77 .00 81.75 77.00 82.00 76.50 79.00
Additional Sack: {yd) - 6.25 6.25 ~ 5.00 506 | 800 10.00 N
>Q—ﬁmxﬂ:u\mm” TR RN = s R i e ¥ = S R i = S SRR i 2 i
Water Reducing Agent: (per sack Treatment 055 0.60 4.50 4.50 2.75/6Sack 3.00/6 Sack

, reg. Or retarding v _
Gmﬁ_:g Chloride {1% Add) (Yd) 1.80 1.85 200 200 1.00 1.50
Calcium Chloride (2% Add) (Yd) 3.60 3.70 4.00 4.00 2.00 2.50
Others Describe: Short Load Charges|5 to 5.75=560.00; 4 to
- 4.75= $70.00, 3-3.75=$80.00,2-2.75=
$90.00; 1-1.75=$100.00

Expansion Paper (5 Foot rmnu%mv

2" X 1/2" 0.97 1.05 “No Bid NoBd | 020 0.23

3" x 12" 1985 2.05 1.75 1,75 0.30 0.33

4" X 12" - 2.60 2.73 2.25 2.25 0.40 0.43
6" X 1/2" 3.49 3.66 3.25 3.25 0.60 0.63
8" X 1/2" 5.39 5.66 No Bid No Bid 1.35 1.40
Delivery: )

Monday thru Friday/Late Pour Charges 6.00 6.00 5.00 500 1 600 7.00
(per yard after __pm) After 5:00 PM After 5:00 PM >mmﬂ 6:00 PM , After 6:00 PM After 5 PM After 5 PM
Saturday Delivery (yard) 6.00 ) 6.00 6.00 6.00

Sunday Delivery (yard) e No Bid No Bid Quote Upon Request! Quote Upon Request

Holiday D@___<mﬁ< {yard) No Bid No Bid Quote Upon Request Quote Upon Request

Demurrage: .- . - - . . - . - . - - . - . N
Unloading Time {hour) Blank Blank 60.00 ) 60.00 90.00

fn excess of Min) 60 minutes 60 minutes 60 minutes

Heating/Winter Delivery/$ _ /cu.yd) 6.00 6.00 5.00 ~ 6.00 6.50

From to i

Spiit Loads:

More than one _.oom:o:




