City of Rochester Hills, Michigan |

Project: Agreggates for 2009 & 2010

ITB-RH-08-057 Tabulation \

Bid Names Read: December 17, 2008 @ 3:0

0 PM

Name: Richmond Transport, Inc. Edw. C. Levy Co. Tri-City Aggregates,inc. Gary's Transport, Inc. Osburn Industries, Inc.
Address: 4020 County Line 8800 Dix Ave. P.O. Box 182 54255 Card Road 5850 Pardee Road

Lenox, Michigan 48050 Dearborn, Michigan 48290 ([Holly, Ml 48442 Macomb, Ml 48042 Taylor, Ml 48180

2009 2010 2009 2010 2009 2010 2009 2010 2009 2010

BID FORM A: 2200 Tons Bituminous Mixture No Bid No Bid $10.14 $10.14 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BID FORM A: 550 Tons Bituminous Mixture \ No Bid No Bid $10.14 $10.14 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BID FORM A: 120 Gallons Bituminous Bond Coat No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BID FORM B: 10,000 Tons - 22A Road Gravel $8.85 $9.30 $9.29 $9.29 $8.80 $9.05 No Bid No Bid $9.65 $9.65
BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - G Slag $14.55 $15.25 $13.93 $13.93 No Bid No Bid $14.45 $14.45 $15.05 $15.05
BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - 22X Slag $8.55 $8.95 $7.99 $7.99 No Bid No Bid $7.98 $7.98 $9.20 $9.20
BID FORM C: 250 Tons Bituminous Mixture No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Name: Ajax Materials Corporation Barrett Paving Materials Inc [John D. Osborne Trucking Inc. |Troy Aggregate Carrier's Inc.
Address: 830 Kirts Blvd. , Suite 100 2040 Barrett Rd. 37500 Northline Rd. 6075 Elmridge

P.O. Box 7058 Troy, Michigan 48084 Romulus, Ml 48174 Sterling Hgts., MI 48313

Troy, Ml 48084

2009 2010 2009 2010 2009 2010 2009 2010 2009 2010

BID FORM A: 2200 Tons Bituminous Mixture $54.00 [No Bid $50.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BID FORM A: 550 Tons Bituminous Mixture | $55.00 |No Bid $50.00 No Bid  |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BID FORM A: 120 Gallons Bituminous Bond Coat $5.00 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BID FORM B: 10,000 Tons - 22A Road Gravel $9.50* No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.10 $9.60 $9.40 $9.40
BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - G Slag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.30 $14.80 $10.45 $10.45
BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - 22X Slag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.30 $8.80 $8.60 $8.60
BID FORM C: 250 Tons Bituminous Mixture $94.45 |No Bid $94.83 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

* Alternate Bid
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