

City of Rochester Hills, Michigan
 Project: Aggregates for 2011 & 2012
 ITB-RH-11-004 Tabulation
 Bid Names Read: January 26, 2011 @ 3:00 PM

Name:	Glenn Eisenhardt Exc., Inc.	B&W Landscape Supply	Richmond Transport Inc	B.J. Forrest Trucking, Inc	Barrett Paving Materials Inc	Tebben Brothers Ltd	Osburn Industries Inc					
Address:	550 E Leonard Rd Leonard, MI 48367	43291 North Avenue Clinton Twp, MI 48036	4020 County Line Lenox, MI 48050	PO Box 116 Metamora, MI 48455	2040 Barrett Rd Troy, MI 48084	231 Romeo Road Rochester, MI 48307	5850 Pardee Road Taylor, MI 48180					
	2011	2012	2011	2012	2011	2012	2011	2012	2011	2012		
BID FORM A: 2200 Tons Bituminous Mixture							\$ 45.00	No Bid				
BID FORM A: 550 Tons Bituminous Mixture							\$ 45.00	No Bid				
BID FORM A: 120 Gallons Bituminous Bond Coat							No Bid	No Bid				
BID FORM B: 10,000 Tons - 22A Road Gravel	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.70	\$ 9.95	\$ 10.95	\$ 9.30	\$ 9.50	\$ 9.25	\$ 9.50	\$ 10.50	\$ 11.00	\$ 9.65	\$ 9.65
BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - G Slag	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.88	\$ 15.74	\$ 13.90	\$ 13.90	\$ 14.50	\$ 14.75	\$ 16.25	\$ 16.75	\$ 15.10	\$ 15.10
BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - 22X Slag	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.35	\$ 8.65	\$ 7.95	\$ 7.95	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.90	\$ 9.75	\$ 10.25	\$ 8.60	\$ 8.60
BID FORM C: 250 Tons Bituminous Mixture							\$ 94.75	No Bid			\$ 104.00	No Bid

Cannot meet Ins.
Requirement

Name:	Bedrock Express Ltd	Edw. C. Levy Co.	Gary's Transport Inc.	Cadillac Asphalt LLC	Tri-City Aggregates Inc	Ajax Materials Corporation				
Address:	1290 N M-15 Ortonville, MI 48462	8800 Dix Avenue Detroit, MI 48209-1093	54255 Card Rd Macomb, MI 48042	51777 W Twelve Mile Rd Wixom, MI 48393	PO Box 182 Holly, MI 48442	830 Kirts Blvd, Ste 100 Troy, MI 48084				
	2011	2012	2011	2012	2011	2012	2011	2012	2011	2012
BID FORM A: 2200 Tons Bituminous Mixture					\$ 46.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 51.00		
BID FORM A: 550 Tons Bituminous Mixture					\$ 46.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 46.00	\$ 52.00		
BID FORM A: 120 Gallons Bituminous Bond Coat					\$ 3.00	\$ 4.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 7.00		
BID FORM B: 10,000 Tons - 22A Road Gravel	\$ 9.83	\$ 9.83	\$ 9.50	\$ 9.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.70	\$ 9.00		
BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - G Slag	\$ 14.24	\$ 14.24	\$ 14.05	\$ 14.05	\$ 14.45	\$ 14.45	No Bid	No Bid		
BID FORM B: 1,500 Tons - 22X Slag	\$ 6.94	\$ 6.94	\$ 7.80	\$ 7.80	\$ 7.92	\$ 7.92	No Bid	No Bid		
BID FORM C: 250 Tons Bituminous Mixture					\$ 88.00	\$ 92.00	\$ 91.00	\$ 100.00		

Bid Alternate