CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS
RFP-FH-07-08-1376

Emergency Medical Supplies
MLP Disocunt Tabulation

Diagnostic Equipment No-bid -15% ~10% -10%
i.e. Pulse Oximeter, Blood Pressure Cuffs, Stethoscopes, Thermometers,
Penlights, EKG Electrodes, Defib Supplies, Magil Forceps & Flashiights
Welch Allyn & Conmed Welch Allyn -5%
Immobilization & Extrication .
No-bid -10% ~10% ~10%
i.e. Backboards, Backboard straps, Cervical Collars, Head Immiobilizers, Mast
Pants, Tractions splints, Disposable and reusable Splints, Basket stretchers &
Scoop Stretchers I-tec, Ambu & Morrison Ferno -5%
Patient Transport Equipment No-bid ~15% -10% -10%
i.e. Cot Accessories, patient Restraints, Cot Blankets, Cot Sheets, Stair Chairs,
soft stretchers, clipboards, triage vests & triage supplics
P ¢ 8o Sipp Saunders Ferno -5%
Equipment Bags & Cases No-bid -16% -10% ~10%
i.e. Oxygen bags, stocked oxygen kits, trauma bags, airway bags, ALS bags,
drug bags & boxes, first call in bags, rescue packs, fanny packs & rescue bags
Ferngj Ferno -5%
Medical Education & Training No-bidj -15% -10% -10%
AED trainers, CPR manikins, intubation trainers, Defib manikins, EKG
simulators, IV training arms, ALS training maniking, Choking Manikins &
Rescue Randy Ambu & Medtronic Nasco & Simulaids -5%
Disaster Preparedness 10% OFF LIST -15% -10%
Coveralls, ear protection, fit test kits, gloves, head protection, oxygen manifolds,
respiration masks & hoods, traffic control & iriage Teleflex/Hudsorn
Tools & Personal Items No-bidj -15% ~10% ~10%
Field guides, forceps, scalpels, holsters, shears & scissors, penlights, ring
cutters, hammers, seat belt cutters & window punches Covidien
Remaining Line Discount
No-bid} -11% -10% -10%
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Penlights, EKG Electrodes, Defib Supplies, Magil Forceps & Flashlights

-15%

Welch Allyn & Conmed

-10%

Welch Allyn -5%

Immebilization & Extrication

No-bid{ -10% ~10% -10%
i.e. Backboards, Backboard straps, Cervical Collars, Head Immobilizers, Mast
Pants, Tractions splinis, Disposable and reusable Splints, Basket stretchers &
Scoop Stretchers I-tec, Amibu & Morrisonf Ferno -5%
Fatient Transport Equipment No-bid} ~15% -10% -10%
i.e. Cot Accessories, patient Restraints, Cot Blankets, Cot Sheets, Stair Chairs,
soft stretchers, clipboards, friage vests & triage supplies .
P & 8¢ supp Saunders| Ferno -5%
Equipment Bags & Cases No-hid] -10% -10% -16%
i.c. Oxygen bags, stocked oxygen kits, trauma bags, airway bags, ALS bags,
drg bags & boxes, first call in bags, rescue packs, fanny packs & rescue bags
Ferno, Ferno -5%
Medical Education & Training No-bid] -15% -10% -10%
AED trainers, CPR manikins, intubation trainers, Defib manikins, EXG
sirnulators, IV training arms, ALS training manikins, Choking Manikins &
Rescue Randy Ambu & Medtronic Nasco & Simulaids -5%,
Disaster Preparedness 10% OFF LIST -15% -10%
Coveralls, ear protection, fit test kits, gloves, head protection, oxyzen manifolds,
respiration masks & hoods, traffic control & triage Teleflex/Huadson
Tools & Personal Items Ne-bidj -15% -10% -10%
Ficld guides, forceps, scalpels, holsters, shears & scissors, penlights, ring
cutters, harmmers, seat belt cutters & window punches Covidien
Remaining Line Discount
No-bid ~11% -10% -10%
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Emergency Medical Supplics
” I "

bulati

RBaxter Extension Sets 6" 2Y sites NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID §.0000
Alternate Alternate NO-BID | AMSINO A30060606 £.4000] ASMINO 044-000606 1.2000f ASMINO EDI-3242: § 11866 21864
Baxter IV Set [0drop 2Y 1clave 1 split NO-B1D§ EMS3114 1.5200 118-EMS3110 1.5900 EDI-3256; § 1.4800 148400
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMSINO AS108306 52000 ASMING 044-108306 1.4400F ASMINO EDI-3240; § 13804 1.3800
Raxter [V Set 60drop 2Y 1clave | split NO-BID EMS3160 Laong }]8-EMS3[60§ 1.6700; EDI-BZS?% $ 1.7900 1.l
Bulb Syringe non-sterite NO-BID AMSINO AS005025 0.2700 044-A800502 0.2600 EFA-34011 § 0.8800 L2660
KENDAILL
1.0. Needle 15ga NO-BID 8881245164 12.5009 04-DINTS15XEA 13.9960 ED-3420-5! § 8.8500 8.8504
Laerdal Medical CPR Mask in case NO-BID NO-BID 485-82001933 88000 EAW-2758, 3 9.6900, 8.8000
{ MEDSOURCE 533
Alternate Alternate) NO-BID AMBU 252103 4.4000) MS-PM163 38380 EAW-27591 § 4.1500) 3.9560
BITE STICK. NO-BID: ADC 4010T 32960 G06-4010 0.3260 CBAW.27900 & 0.4804 02960
Wool Blanket NO-BID GRAHAM 52038 5.5000 094-PX100¢ 45060 NO-BID 4. 5000
SABEE PRODUCTS:
Underpads biue 300/ca NO-BID 13@001% 0.0758 276-11724 2.49680 NO-BID! a.0680
Pitlow Cases NO-BID GRAHAM 47256 0.3100 351-47250 92178 ]EIC~5102§j $ 2.3500 8.2170
Disposable Cot Sheet fiat 50/ca NO-BID: GRAHAM 332 0.6000; 351-52166 04758 .EIC-1875§ $ 0.8900! 84750
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Emergency Medical Supplies
Raxter Dextrose 150l NO-BID 2BO0G1] §  1.3500 118-2B0061 8.9500 NO-BID 0.9500
Baxter Dextrose 250m] NO-BID 2BOO62 §  0.9500 118-2B00620 0.9460 NO-BID 6.9400
Baxter NACL 3500m| NO-BID 2BIABQ § 09100 118-2B1323Q 0.8900 NO-BID 0.8900
Raxter NACL 1000mi NO-BID IBI3AX § 10170 118-2B1324% 0.9490 NO-BID! 9.9490
Raxter LR 500ml NO-BID 2B23Q 5§ 10300 118-2B2323Q) ¢ 1.0800 NO-BID 1.0300
Baxtor LR 100m] NO-BID 2B2324X $ 12100 118-2B2324X 1.2000 NO-BID 1.2000
Raxter Water 250ml NO-RID 27128 11700 118-2F7112 10799 NO-BID 10790
Baxter Water 500ml NO-BID 27113 §  1.0900 118-2F7113 14560 NO-BID 10506

Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID N()-BID. &.0000
Baxter Water 1000ml NO-BID 71140 § 11600 118-2F7114 11500 NO-BID 11500

Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 00008

| BAYER 121-9663,
Glucometer Capillary Styfe NO-B[D% DDI 518500 §  19.7500 12195458 FREE NO-BID 0. (0G4
BAYER 121-3873,
Glucose Capittary Style Test Strips NO-BID DDIS28000 §  £.2970 121-70998 0.5000 EFA0OT-E §  27.9500 0.2970

BD Medical Systems 1V Cath, Insyte 24ga NO-BID 381412 132-38-1412 2.2000 EDI-3005-A] § 14206 11260

Alternate Alternate NO-BID; NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID! 6.6060
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LY OF FARMING  ON H L L |
RFP-FH-07-08-1376
Emergency Medical Supplies
Tabulati
BD Medical Systems IV Cath, Insyte 22ga NO-BID 381423 % 2.197¢ 132-38-1423 2.2060 EDI-3004-A0 8 11200 11280
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 2.0600
BD Medical Sysiems TV Cath, Insyte 20za NO-BID 381434) § 2.1970) 132-38~1434 2.2000 EDL-3003-A 8 11200 11200
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 60600
BD Medical Sysiems IV Cath, Insyte 18ga NO-BID 3814440 § 2.1970 132-38-1444 2.2000 EDI-3002-A § 11200 1.1200
Alternate Alternate NO-BID! NO-BID NO-BID NO-BIDY 0.6000
BD Medical Systems 1V Cath, Insyte 16ga NC-BID 3gl454 §  2.1970 132-38-1454 2.2000 EDI-3001-A, § 20200 L1200
Alernate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID . NO-BID 6.6600
BD Medicat Systems IV Cath, Insyte 14ga NO-BID! 381467 3 21970 132-38-1467 2.2000 EDI-3000-A § 11260 L1200
Saction Canister, 6", 1200cc NO-BID BEMIS 484410, § 249661 BEMIS 133-484410. § 2.2800 EAW-22200 § 21800 2.6940
Suction Canister, 5", 1200cc NO-BID BEMIS 4854101 $ 2.8000, NG-BID: EAW-2221§ 5 2.6400 L6400
BETA 134-B505- '
Dura sensor Adult finger clip NO-BID> NO-BID 10i1; § FH.G000 BCS-7030, § 131.5000 78,6800
Simiths Medical BCI Pulee OX NO-BID 3301, §  470.0000 162-3301, §  490.0000 ELS-70200 $  492.0000 470.6060
VALUEMED 301+
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID P6142. % 265.0000 NO-BID 2650000
Smiths Medical Finger Pulse Oximeter NO-BID 3420Y. § 265.0000 162-3420Y§ & 2256000 ELS % 319.0000 225.0008
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CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS :
REP-FH-O7-08:-0370 e
Emergency Medical Supplies
Co 1 Tabulation
: SPO MEDICAL ELS-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 7{)55§ g 178. 3600 F78.56068
MEDSOURCE 533~ ‘
Yankaver w/control NG-BID ASMINO A5833) & 0.5800 MS-YK10 § 0.3708 EAW-2209 § 0.4700 3708
CARELINE 206-089-
Disposable Pillow NO-BID PUTNAM P1824] § 1,95001 7015 % 1.9400 EIC-5102; § 04450 4458
Beaumont Citrus I1 22 oz cleaner NO-BID 633712927 § 38000 212-633712927. $ 4.2500) NO-BID 38000
Beaumont Citrus II gallon cleaner NO-BID 6337129280 &  13.8000 212-633712928! % 16.0000) NO-BID 13.8008
WESTERN 96-PX-;
Oxygen Tank, Alum fumbo D w/oggle NO-BID ALLIED 31-10:2017) §  86.5000 8709-IT: § 76.9000 EAW-2811: § 84,2500 4. 2508
Alternate Alternate NQO-BID MADA 1502)i §  8L5064 NO-BID NO-BID 81,5066
Humidifier empty NO-BID ALLIED 64375 § 1.4900 21-64375 $ 1.6000 EAW-ZOSO% & 14800 14800
Conmed Suction Tubing [/4" NG-BID 34290: § 0.8800 218-0034290: 0.9400 FAW-2210! § 0.8400 68400
COVIDIEN
Alternate Alternate NO-BID 8BR8301606; 3 4. 77404 NO-BID NO-BID 86,7700
Conmed Aduit Diaphoretic Electric 30/box NQO-BID 01-3630! § 01758 218-01-3630 § ¢.1800 EDI-31 ]2 $ 3.8400 81758
Alternate Alternate NO-BID COVIDIEN 22853 §  6./556 NO-BID NG-BID #1550
Conmed Electrode 30/pak NOwBiD% 01-3633 § G175 23 8-01-3633: $ 0.1800 EDI-3116 § 3.8400 0.i75G
Alternate Alternate N’O—BIDé COVIDIEN22850, § g Ery] NO-BID NO-BID! o 1446
EDI-3104 445 BOX
Conmed Electrode Pedi NO-BID! 1620-0031 § 0.1750 218-1620-003 § 0.1800 30§ 05184 1484
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CITY OF FARMINGTON H
RFP-FH-07-08-1376

‘Emergency Medical Supplies

COVIDIEN;
Alternate Alternate NO-BID: 31112496 §  0.7200 NO-BID NO-BID 0.1200
Medtronic Quick Combo Adult NO-BID 11996-000091] $ 254000 218-2516M § 129250 EDI3168-5 $ 232500 12.9250
COMED PAD PRO,
Alternate Alternate NO-BID: CONMED 2516M §  25.2500 NO-BID ADULT EDI-3180-5| §  19.1500 19.1500
Medtronic Quick Combo Pedi NO-BID 11996-000093] §  25.7500 218-2603M: § 729250 EDI-3172:50 §  27.2500 12,9250
COMED PAD PRO,
Alternate Alternate NO-BID CONMED 2603M, $ 252500 NO-BID PEDI EDL-3183-5: §  79.7500 19,1500
Conmed Veni-gard Adult NO-BID: 7054431 §  0.3920 218-705-4431| § 04117 FFA-3505 § 0.3460 04,3400
Head-on Head Disposable System NO-BID 40105 56500 224-401-5| § 7.2400 5 9.3500 5.6500
CUMBERLAND-;
Alcohol 16 oz NO-BID, SWAN 81043 §  1.0800f SWAND255-81043 §  £.0813 EFA-4101 § £.5500 0.0813
? CUMBERLAND-
Peroxide 160z NO-BID SWANS7143 §  0.4800] SWAND255-87143 §  0.0406 EFA-4100) § 0.9200 0.0406
Smiths Medical IV Cath Protective 16x1.25 NO-BID 3042 §  1.9700) 258-30421 $ 2.1000 EDI-3001-P 5 L&400 1.8400
Smiths Medical IV Cath Protective 14x1.25 NO-BID 3048 § 19700 2583048 $ 2.1000 EDI-3000-P § 1.8400 1.8406
Stiths Medical 1V Cath Protective 22x1 NO-BID 3050, $ L9700 258-3050. $ 2,1000 EDI-3004-P! § 1.8400 1.8464
Smiths Medical IV Caih Profective 24%.75 NO-BID! 30530 $ 19700 258-3053 § 2,1900 EDI-3005-P; § 1.8480 1.8400
Smiths Medical IV Cath Protective 18x1.25 NO-BID 3055 1.9700 258.3055 § 2.1000 EDI-3002-P! § L8460 18400
Smiths Medical IV Cath Protective 20x1 .25 NO-BID! 3056 $ 19700 2583056 $ 2.1000 EDI-3003-F| § 1.8400 18400
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CTTY OF FARMINGTON HILLS %
REP-FH-07-08-1376
Emergency Medical Supplies
Core Item Tabulation
Smiths Medigal IV Cath 14gx2" NO-BID 4088 §$ 1.9700 258-4088: § 8400 EDI-2298-P: § 1.8400, 88400
Kendall Healtheare Vaseline gauze 3x9 NO-BID 8884413605: 3 $.5700] 478884413605.000 % 0.7500 EFA-10652; $ 0.7460 03760
DERMA SERVICE
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID» 263-DK20056; 3 0.5860 NG-BID 8.5900
Microflex (Hove, Ultra One Latex Glove Small UL-315-5: §  0.0685 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BIDY 80685
INNOVATIVE DIGICARE 263
Alternate Alternate NO-BID 115100, § Ghaz20 XTG10-1BX: $ 0.0585 NO-BID 98321
Microflex Glove, Ultra One Latex Glove Medium UL-3153-M: §  9.0685 NO-BID! NO-BID NO-BID U683
: INNOVATIVE DIGICARE 265- :
Alternate Alternate NO-BID 115200: 3 G320 XTG10-2BX: § (1.0585 NO-BID! #6320
Microflex Glove, Ultra One Latex Glove Large UL-315-Li 8§ 0.0685 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 085
INNOVATIVE DIGICARE 265-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID 115300 & 8.6324 XTGi10-3BX § 0.0585] NO-BID 049320
Microflex Glove, Ultra One Latex Glove X Large UL-3i5-XL: §  £.4685% NO-BIBX NO-BID NO-BIDY §.0685
INNOVATIVE DIGICARE 265~ :
Alternate Alternate NO-BID; 115350 3 80320 XTGI0-4BX: § 0.0585 NO-Bi> 44320
Microflex Glove, Ultra One Latex Glove XX Large UL-315‘XXLJ 5 O.068% NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID Hu685
INNOVATIVE DIGICARE 265-
Alternate Alternaie NO-BID! 115350 §  0.6320 XTG10-5BX! § 0.0585 NO-BID £.0320
DigiCare Glove, Nitrile DFR10 Small NO-BID DFRI1O-1. § G724 265-DFR10-1BX: § 0.0743 NO-BID 40720
Microflex SU-690-
Alternate Alternatel S{smalld § 00685 KC 35086 § HA668 NO-BID; NO-BID S.G660
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CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS |
LY i e e L R B A R T T T
Emergency Medical Supplies
Tabulati
DigitCare Gilove, Nitrile DFR10 Medium NO-BID DFR1C-2; § 49720 265-DFR10-2BX; & 0.0743 NO-BID 0.4720
Microflex SU-690-
Alternate Alternate M(med): §  0.0685 KC 35087 § A.0600 NO-BID NO-BID b.0660
DigitCare Glove, Nitrile DFR10 Large NO-BID: DFRIO-3! & GG6720 265-DFR10-3BX. § 0.0743 NO-BID 0.8720
Micreflex SU~690-
Alternate Alternate Lz §  0.0685 KC 55088] % 0.6606 NO-BID NO-BID X/
DigitCare Glove, Nitrile DFR10 X-Large NO-BID DFR10-4: § 0.6720 265-DFR10-4BX] § 00473 NO-Bilx 00473
Microflex SU-6906-
Alternate Alsernate XLix-igyi §  0.0685 KC 55086 § 6642 NO-BID: NO-BID 6542
DigitCare Glove, Nitrile DFR10 XX-Large NO-BID DFR16-5: § au720 263-DFRIG-5BX; § 0.0743 NO-BID 96720
Alternate Alternate! NO-BID KC 55089 § (L0642 NO-BID NO-BiD» 8642
Kendall Heaithcare 10x30 Muiti-Trauma Dressing NO-Bil} 1967: § 2.6500 47-1967 § 2.7900 EFA-1175 § {8900 0.&%60
Alternate Alternatel NO-BIDY DUKAL 1030TI» § 1.2300f DUKAL 276-1030TD;, § 4.9940 NO-BID 0.99G0
Kendall Healthcare 2X2 Sterile Gauze Pads NO-BID: 441211 § 0.6480 47-3381 § 0.0792 NO-BID 80486
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID DUKAL 276-1212; § 40220 NO-BID; #6220
Kendall Healtheare Nosn-Adherent dressing 3x4 NO-BiD 1050. § 01464 479642, 5 G.1258 NO-BID 0.1258
AMD-RITMED
Alternate Alternate; NO-BID: 1934! 3 (L6545 DUKAL 276-134" § 0.6610 NO-BID 0. 60543
Kendall Healthcare 4x4 Sterile 10/tray NO-BEDE 442214% § 843350 47-6120 § 0.0880) EFA-1033) § 1.0500 $.0350
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Emergency Medical Supplies
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID DUKAL 276-1414-10¢¢ § 04814 NO-BID G481 8
Kendall Healthcare Personal Protection Gown NQ-BID NO-BID; NO-BID EIC-5101; § 4.8400 a.5400
PRO ADVANTAGE, |
Alternate Alternate NO-BID P704020 6.3760 DUKAL 276-301. 8 0.3375 NO-BiD G.3106
3M Tegaderm 2 3/8" x 2 3/4" NO-BiD! 1624W #2630 803-1624WBX: § 0.3065 EFA-3524, § 6.2800 2658
Alterniate Alternate NC-BID NO-BID DUKAL 276-4067 § 3.2700 NO-BID 0.2766
BEFA-1021 ($1.52 box
Kendail Heaithcare 4x4 Non-Sterile NO-BID 441217 04070 47.23561 § 0.0307]  of 200 -normelized), $ 0.0076 06078
Alternage Alternate NO-BID? NO-BID; DUAKL 276-8509; § 90075 NO-BID 00075
: ' EFA-1071{$4.95 box
Kendall Healthcare ACE 3" NO-BIL 4423 0.7100 47-4203: § 1.0700 of 10-normalized); § 0.4950 04958
: MEDSOURCE 533-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMD-RITMED 621 3508 MS-EROC3: § 0.3900 NO-BID 83560
Kendal Healticare ACE 4" NO-BID 4424 .8166 47-4204! § 1.3400 NO-BKD‘ 08100
MEDSOURCE 533- :
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMD RITMED 622 04580 MS-EBOG4, § 0.5000 NO-BID &4508
Kendall Healtheare ACE 6" NO-BID 4426? 1. 4806 47-4206: § 2.0300 NO-BID 14808
MEDSOURCE 533-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMD RITMED 623 8.7600 MS-EBO06! § 0.7500 NO-BID . 7060
Kendall Healthcare 4X4 Sterile Topper NO-BID 141412 40644 47-2913) § 0.0736 NO-BID 6640
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID DUKAL 276-5444 § 8.0374 NO-BID 20370
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CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS
REP-FH-07-08-1376 '
Kendalt Healtheare 5x9 Combo Pads NO-BID 7196y §  0.1340 47-7196D) § 0.1667 NO-BID! 0.7340
AMD RITMED
Alternate Alternate] NO-BID AT059 §  G.1170F DUKAL 276-5590 § 0.7057 NO-BID a.1067
Kendall Healthcare 8x7.5 ABD Pads NO-BID 7197 8§ 0.20060 47-1197D] § 0.2317 NO-BID 0.2000
AMD RITMED:
Alternate Alternate NO-BID: AT087 §  £7800] DUKAL 276-5875: §$ 0.1980 NO-BID 0.1800
Kendall Healthcare Kling 3" Non-sterile NO-BID: 441501 § 60958 472244 5 0.3475 NO-BID 0.6958
Alternate Alfernate NO-BID NO-BID DUKAL 276-603! § 0. 1440 NO-BID 1l
Kendall Healthcare Kling 4" Non-sterile NO-BlD§ 441502 § 61125 47-2247 % 0.5370 NO-BID 01125
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID DUKAL 276-604 § 0177 NO-BID G6.4177
Kendall Healthcare Klingﬁ" Non-sterile NO-BID 441503 5 10.2083 47.22490 § 0.8000 NO-BiD 6. 2083
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID DUKAL 276-606] § 0.2419 NO-BiDi 0.2416
Kendall Healthcare Rand-Aid 1x3 NO-BID TOIRLE § p.e244 47-7028LF § 0.0350 NO-BID 00244
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NUTRAMAX 999021 §  4.0739] DUKAL 2767031 § 0.0156 NO-BID 60139
Kendall Healthcare Band-Aid 1x3 NO-BID T628LF 8§ (0244 47-6135LF § 0.0428 NO-BID 00244
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NUTRAMAX 999920 §  f.0739FDYNAREX 279-3612 § 0.0218 NO-BID G139
Disposable Fitted Sheets 50/case NO-BID DU;(ALH%@ £ 4.7796] DUKAL276-7106 3 £.8000 EIC-1874) § 0.8900) 6.7796
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CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS |
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Emergency Mcdical Supplies
Core Item Tabulation )
Disposable Yeliow Blanket NO-BID DUKAL 7303; § 1.320C{GRAIAM 351-54849 § 1.2400 NO-BID 12466
¥Kendall Healthcare Cloth tape 1" NO—BID. 7138 § 0.7330 47-7138; 0.9317 NO»B[Dg 47330
Alternate Alternate NO-BID. AS2100 & £.6000 DUKAL 372-7111] § (6250 NO-BID a.6000
Kendall Heaithcare Cloth tape 2" NOC-BID 7136 § 14660 47-7139. § 1.8633 NG-BID L4660
Alternate Alternate NO-BID /&52203 b L2064 DUKAL 372-7112; § 12500 NO-BiD L2000
Kendall Healthcare Cloth tape 3" NO-BID 7140: § 22606 47-7140: 3§ 2.7200 NO-BID 2.2000
Alernate Alternate NO-BID AS52300 § 1.8040 DUKAL 372-7113; $ 1.8750 NO-BID 860G
Kendall Healthcare Aleohol prep pads 100/box NO-BID 5033 § 0.0124 47-6818! § 80091 NO-BID 0.009F
Alternate Alternate NO-BID: DYNAREX 1166 § 4.0166 | DYNAREX 279-1106, $ 0.0170 NO-BID Ga160
Kendail Healthcare Todine Prep Pads 100/box NO—BID. NO-BID NO«BIDf NO-BID a.6600
Alternate Alternate NO-BID PDi 800030 § G.0288 IDYNAREX 279-1108! § 0.0319 NO-BID 05288
Kendall Healthcare lodine Swabs NO-BID NO-BID% NO»BID% NO-B{D% G.0080
Alternate Alternate NO-BID PDI 8000402 3 06836 DYNAREX 2'."3~120?.E & a.6843 NO—BID‘: 4845
MNail Polish Remover pads NO-BID PDIB71200, $ 0.03308 TRIAD 362-10620G! 3 40274 NO-BID o274
Scalpel #11 NO-BID EXEL 29552% § 04384 | DYNAREX 279-411 i $ (3800 NO-BID 8.0384
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CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS
RFP-FH-07-08-1376

Emergency Medical Supplies
Core { i

RAZOR NO-B%D? DYNAREX 4251% ) #3500 [DYNAREX 279-42511 § 0.3600 NO-BID 8.3560

Cotton Tip Ap 6" Steriie NO-BID DYNAREX 4303 § 0.0265] DYNAREX 279-4303 § 0.0168 NO-BID 8.4168

Tongue Depressor 6" sterile NO-BID DYNAREX 43 3045 % 0.0261}DYNAREX 279-43 14 3 G.0217 NO-BID: G63Fi

Berman OP AIRWAY 40MM NO-BID 4715E b3 81200 DYNAREX 279-47155 b & 12648 EAW-2400 § 0.1400 8.1208
Berman OP AIRWAY 60MM NO—BID; 4725 § 1200 DYNAREX 279-4725 § a.1200 EAW-2402;, § 0.1400 0. 1208
Berman . OP AIRWAY S0MM NO-BIDI 4735 % 8.1280 279-4735 § $.1208 EAW-2403 % 0.1400 4,124
Berman OF AIRWAY S0MM NO-BID 47451 § f1208 279-4745; § 4264 EAW-240G4] § 0.1400 4.1260
Berman OP AIRWAY 100MM NO-BID 4755 § 01200 279-4755 § (31200 EAW-2405; § 0.1400 01208
Berman OP AIRWAY 110MM NO-BID 4765, § 02200 279-4765% b G126 EAW-2410) § 0.1400 G.1260
Spider Strap Spider Strap RED/BLACD NO-BID EP-501i § 64,7500 282-EP-301; § 63,5004 EST-382L § 74.2500 63.5060
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID MORRISON 56-1280 % 63,0000 NO~BEDé 630000

EPR (Responder AV} Inflatable pedi-car seat NO-BID. EP-70! § 2785904 282-EP-96: §  317.0000 EBB-PI-550: §  325.0000 278.5000
¥erno KED NO-RID NO-BID 308-125‘ 5 Gi.4000 EBB-4660. § 106.50004 41,4600

PRODUCT% KODE1 KENDRICKS
Alternate Alternate NO-BID RESEARCH KL« $ 72.1060f EP&R 282-KE70l § 5 3004 EBB-4665 $ 76.5000 59,8004
Evaluemed 3{)1-001-;
SUCTION CATH COILED 6FR NO-BID ASMINO A5361C; 3 $.2704 1206: § 0.3100 EAW-2201 § 0.3400 82704
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CIIYORFARMINGTONHILLS -
RFP-FH-07-08-1376 :
Emergency Medical Supplies 1
Core Trem Tabulati
Evaluemed 301-00 {
SUCTION CATH COILED 10FR NO-BID ASMINO A5363C. §  0.2760 12110 § 0.3100 EAW-22030 § 0.3400 4.2700
Evaluemed 301-001-
SUCTION CATH COILED 14FR NO-BID ASMINOG AS365C: § 92700 12114 $ 0.3100 EAW-2205 % 0.3400 0.2790
Hudson Nasal Cannuta Aduit NO-BID 1163 & 03360 36-1;03§ § 0.5850 EAW-2000-HD § 0.4800 0.3306
MEDSOURCE EAW-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID VENTLAB 87-1107. § 0, 2460 2000 $ 0.3800 2.2900
Hudson Oxygen Supply tubing NO-BID 115 8 63006 36-1115 $ 0.4900 EAW-2030. § 0.4400 6.3000
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID VENTLAB 87-3007, § 250 NO-BID G.2100
Hudson Medium Concentration Mask Aduit NO-BID 10480 § 1.0200 36-1041 § a.9768 NO-BID 6.9706
EVALUEMED 30i-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID 180 § 8.5800 NO-BID 05800
Hudson Partial Non-Rebreather Adult NO-BID 1059 §  Lozo8 36-105% $ 1.6200 EAW-2012-HD! § 1.3800 L9266
MEDSOURCE EAW-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID VENTLAR §7-2101! § 2.7000 20120 § 0.9%00 4, 7060
Budson Non-Rebreather Adsuit Total NO-BID 1060 §  Loz200 36-1065 8 1.6000 NO-BID: § 1.4200 o200
MEDSOQURCE EAW-|
Alternate Alternate NO-BIY NO-BID VENTLAB §7-2102] § &, 7600 2011} $ 1.0200 0. 7064
Hudsen NEBULIZER ADULT WITH TUBING NO-BID 18820 § 67500 36-1732) § 1.2600 EAW-2020-HD! § 1.2800 2. 7560
EVALUEMED 301+
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID 2000 8 8. 7008 NO-BID 4. 7060
AMBU BVM w/C02 Check Infant NO-BID: 544-212-800° §  TR.E500 065-544-211-8000 $ 404200 NO-BID 19,6500
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CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS
REP-FH-07-08-1376 T e T T T T T T T
Emergency Medical Supplies 1
“ore [tem T tio
; EVALUEMED 301~ VENTLAB EAW-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID 5579 20.6300 27180 §  19.2800 19,2800
AMRBU BVM w/C02 Check Pedi NO-BID 530-213-8000 §  i9.4500 065-530-213-300§ 43.2900 NO-BID 19.6500
EVALUEMED 301+
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID 3580 20,6300 NO-BID 20,6300
AMBU BVM w/c02 Check Adult NO-BID! 520-611-700. §  19.6508 065-520-611-700 24.1500 NO-BID 19.6500
EVALUEMED 301-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID: NO-BID 5581BA 15.6200 NO-BID 56200
LSP Regulator wibarb outlet NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.8460
PRECISION EVALUEMED 301-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID MEDICAL 168750 § 399508 RB2225R 40.9000 NO-BID 19.9500}
LSP Regulator barbed fitting NO—BID; NO-BID NO-BiD NO-BID 5.0600
, MEDICAL OPA-: EVALUEMED 30i-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID| 850! $  48.1000 RB2225R 40,9000 NO-BID 40,9000
LSP Regulator 1liter flow, 2 DISS ports NO-BID, NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 30000
MEDICAL MPR- EVALURMED 301-
Alternate Aliernate NO-BIDY 804/ S 72.5000 RB2225R2 54,0000 NO-BID 54,6000
Excel nternational Butterfly 19g NO-BID, 26702 8 6.0265 30-26702 0.2800 NO-BID, 0.0265
Excel International Buttf:rfiy 2lga NO-BID: 26704 % 60263 30-26704 02800 NO-BID 8.026%
Excel Infernational Butterily 23ga NO-BID| 26706. 3 40265 30-26706 0.2800 NO-BID §.0265
' U.S.E SURGICAL
Window Punch NO-BID| 14-0600 § L8508 EMI 303-1076] § 2.7000 NO-BID! 1.8500
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CITY OF FARMING T ON HIL LS |
REP-FII-07-08-1376
Emergency Medical Supplies
Core Item Tabulation
Keily forceps straight 5.5 NO-BID § D.6860 EMI303-1740 0.8200; EDL-T215; & 1.2000 0.6800
U.S.E SURGICAL 5
Kelly forceps curved 5.5 NO-BID: 035 § 4.6868 EMI 303-1750 0.8200 EDI-7219 § 1.2000 0.6304)
WORK-N-LEISURE! MEDSCQURCE 533- EMI-7120 ($4.45 pk
Penlights Disposabie 6/pak NO-BID: WL8200: § 06200 MS-PE2100 0.6650 of 6-normalized). $ 0.7417 0.6206
U.S.E. SURGICAL 6
Magill child NO-BID 114 % 2.9700 EMI 303-2750 3.0500 EAW-23611 § 28300 2.8560
[1.S.E. SURGICAL 6 .
Magill Adult NO-BID 1150 % 3.9100 EMI 303-2760; 3.0300 EAW-2360 % 28560 28500
.5, E. SURGICAL
Ring Cutter NO-BID 10-090! $ 4.5000 EMI 303-3235 4.8800 EMI-7107: § 4.2500 £.2500
MEDICAL
Seat belt cutter NO-BID INSTRUMENTS; $ 2.0500; EMI 303-4060 19400 EMI-7105 § 2.8500 19400
EFA-4200 ($9.75 case
GAM Industries ice Packs NO-BID 612-0010-9824! § 0.4060 321-12-10 0.4400 of 24-normalized), $ 0.4063 §.4660
EFA-4205 {316.95
GAM Industries HOT PACKS NG-BID 612-003-9824! § 44312 321-13-01 0.5400f case ¢ 24-normalized) $ 0.7063 04312
GAM Industries Burn Sheet NO‘BIDi 650-3001-01000 § 3.5000 321-36-01 3.2500; EFA-1 171% & 29900 2.9%00
’ MEDSOURCE 533- :
Alternate Alfernate NO-BID NO-BID MS-BS0033 2.8060 NO-BID 2.8006
GAM Industries OB kit NO-BID 650-40601-0000; % 3.7600) 323-40-01 4,5800 EFA-5400; § 41560 41300
GAM Industries FOIL NO-BID 650-4006-0600, § 4,8500 321~41-01§ 6.1200 EFA-5359! & 39066 3.9900
Emesis Bag NO-BID 3933 8 10664 KR 353-7000 1.1000 NO-BID! 70008
Hudson Medium Concentration Pedi N()—BIDE 1035% 3 143640 36-1035 1.3000: NO-BIDS 14800
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CITY OF FARMINGFONHILLS
RFP-FH-07-08-1376
Emergency Medical Supplies 1 e
Core Item Tabulati
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AS5T4030: § 077001 VENTLAB 87-2200) § 4.5360 NOC-BID 3.5300
Hudson High Concentration Mask Pedi NO-BI 1000 § 22000 36-1000: § 22100, NO-BID 22008
HOSPITAK 355-3224
Alternate Alternate NO-BID 64009 § 1.4700 E § 12206 NO-BID 12200
Hudson Non-Rebreather Partial Pedi NO-BID 10581 § 1.2200 36-1058. § 2.3400 NO-BID L2200
Alternate Alternatel NO-BID NO-BID VENTLAR 87.2261: § . 7600 NO-BID G, 7604
{Hudson Medium Concentration Mask Infant NO-BID 10351 § IRL 36-1042: § 1.2800 NC-BID i.a800
HOSPITAK. 355-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID 32665 % Losan NO-BID FO8OB
Hudson Non-Rebreather Infant NO-BID NO-BID, NO-BID EFA-2009 Lis500 L1506
HOSPITAK 355-3266
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID E! § L4190 NO-BID! LAHG
Lube Jelly NO-BID Oct-d4; & L.0255F TRIAD 362-10-8344; $ 0.6291 NO-BID 0.4255
Uni-Vent Impact Uni-Vent transport vent NO-BID 800-0706-000 § 1,195.0000 386-760: 8§ 1,225.0000) EAW-2075 Li165.0800 1165, 0060
1-Tec/EMS,LLP Multi-Grip Head Holder Aduit NO-BID 10t § 4.8500 4231010 § 4.1000 EH}-1480 5.6500 40500
[-Tee/EMS,LLP Multi-Grip Head Holder Child NO-BID: 102 % £.050¢ 4231020 § 4.10001 EHI-1481 5.6500 4.0580
Kendall Healthcare Sharps-A-Gator 1gt. NO-BID. 31143657 % E 3566 47-31134637: $ 1.4000 EIC-3517 1.4500 13506
Kendal! Healtheare Sharps-A-Giator 1 gallon NO-BID 31143699 § 2.7208 47-31 1436995 $ 2.7900; #1C-3518 4,1500 2. 7208

Page 15 of 32




CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS

RFP-FII-07-08-1376

Emergency Medical Supplics

Core Hem Fabulati

Kendall Healthcare Sharps-A-Gator 5 gt. NO-BID 31144010{ § 28800 47-31144010) § 3.0000 EIC $ 6.7500 2.8800
EIC-5150 ($28.50 bpx
Kendat] Healthcare Fuidshield Mask NO-BID KC 47147 §  0.8740 NO-BID of 50-normalized), 3 0.570¢ 0.5700
MEDICAL ACTION KIMBERLY CLARK,

Alfernate Alternate NO-BID 999061 8 0.6860 108-47147: $ ¢.9100 NO-BID 6.6800

King KING LT-D AIRWAYKIT,3,YELLOW.5 NO-BID NO-BID 477-KLTD13 § 340000 NO-BID 34.0060
; MALLINCKRODT

Alternate Alternate NO-BID, 5-18337 8 548300 NO-RID NO-BID 54.8560

King KING LT-D AIRWAY KIT,4.RED NO-BID NO-BID 477-KLTD214) § 340000 NG-BID 24,0000
MALLINCKRODTS

Alternate Alternate NO-BID, 18441} 8 64.8560 NO-BID NO-BID 64,8500

King KING LT-I> AIRWAYKIT,5,PURPLE NQ-BID NO-BID: 47T-KELTDRS § 34.0000 NO-BID 34,0000
1 MALLINCKRODT,

Alternate Alternate] NO-BID 5-18537 § 548500 NO-BID NO-BID S4.8500

King KING LTS-D,KIT,3,YELLOW NO-BID NO-BID 477-KLTSD413 §  39.0060 NO-BID 25,0000
MALLINCKRODT

Alternate Alternate NO-BID 5-18337, §  S4.4500 NO-BID NO-BID: S4.8500

King KING LTS-D,KIT,4,RED NO-BID NO-BID ATTKLTSDAN4 §  39.0009 NO-BID 790000
MALLINCKRODT

Alternate Alternate NO-BID 5184410 § 648500 NO-BID NO-BID, 54,8500

King KING LTS-DKIT,5,PURPLE NO-BID NO-BID 477-KLTSD415. §  39.60060 NO-BID: 200000
; MALLINCKRODT

Alternate Alternate] NO-BED% 5-18337: § 548500 NO-BID 54.8500
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CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS
RFP-FH-07-08-1376 !
Emergency Medical Supplies
Core Iem Tabulati
Kendall Healthcare Sharps Shuttle NO-BIDY 83011 % 16700 47-8301F $ 1.7300 EIC-3511 & 1.5844 L3804
Kendall Healthcare Sharps 5gt NO-BID 85121 5 L2000 47-85121 % 4.3900 EIC-3542! % 6.8500 420600
Kendall Healthcare Clear tape Kendatl Curity NO-BID 8534 & 18206 47-8534, % 1.1400 NO-BID 1.6206
AMD RITMED
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AS0LL $ 0.6510] DUKAL372-8il11) § 05200 NO-BID .5200
Kendali Healthcare Needle 18gax1” NO-BID 3881230040) 5 f0445) 47-8881250040; § 0.0465 NO-BiD» #0445
Alternate Alternate NO-BID EXEL 26419 §  £.0365 NO-BID NO-BID 00365
Kendall Healthcare Needle 20gax1” NO-BID 8881250123: 8 f.0445 47-88812501231 § 0.0465 NO-BID 0.0445
Alternate Alternate NO-BID 26417 8 0.6365 NO-BID - NO-BID 80365
Kendall Healthcare Needle 23gx1" NO-BID 88B1250255: §  A0U443 47-8881250255; § 0.0463 NO-BID B.4:445
Alternate Alternate NO-BID 26408 & 0.0365 NO-BID NO-BID. 8.0365
EDI-3050 ($14.85;
Kendail Healthcare Blood Tube 5ml Red NO-BIDY 88813014131 §  a.1175 47-888130413. § 0.1260] bex 100-normaiized); $ 0.1485 a.1175
¥Kendall Healtheare Syringe 27g x 1/2 NO-BID 88813501 i60§ & D038 NO-BID NO-BID USRS
Alternate Alternate NO-BID EXEL 260400 8§ 0.0895 47-8881501160 § 0.1085 NO-BID 0.0885
Kendall Healtlicare Syringe lec 27gax 1/2 NO-BID 8881501368 § 01635 47-8881501368 3 0.1685 NO-BID & HIZS
TERUMO 355+
Alternate Alternate NO-BID 01T2713) §  0.0845 NO-BID! NO-BID 24845
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C}'TY O}i‘ FARMINGTON HlLIJS ....................................

REP-FH-07-08-137¢

Emergency Medical Supplies

Core Hem Tabulati

Kendali Healthcare Syringe lec no needle TB NO-BID 8881501400] % 0815 47-8881501400 0.1085 NO-BID H0815
Alfernate Alternate NO-BID EXEL 26048 % 733 NO-BID NO-BID 80735

EDI-3404-M ($8.84

Kendall Healthcare Syringe 12¢c¢ LL NO-BID 88815{2878 § 01962 47-8881512878 0.1106]  box 80-normatized) 01062

Kendall Healthcare Syringe 3ce LL NO-BID 83815 13934% $ #.053% 47-8881513934 0.0560 EDI-3401 0.0539
Alternate Alternate NO-BID EXEL 26200; § #0530 NO-BID NO-BID 0.0536

Kendall Healtheare Syringe 6¢cc LL NO-BID 8881516937 § G.1020; 47-8881516937 0.1060 EDI-3406 96967

Kendalf Healtheare Syringe 20cc LL NO«BID% 8881520657 § 0.2980) 47-8881520657 0.3178 EDi-3407 2776

Kendsl Healtheare 12cc Safety Syringe NO-BID 888152000; § 0.3874 47-888152000 0.4160 NO-BID 63870

Kendalf Healthcare Joc Safety Syringe NO—BID% 8881533908 § $}.1875 47-8881 53908§ 0.1940 NO-BID; $1873
Alternate Alternate NG-BID: EXEL 28200: § 8.1685 NO-BID NO-BID 61655

Kendail Healtheare Syringe 353¢c LL NO-BID 8881535762 § 0.3783 47-888153762 0.3900 ED:-3408 0.3468

Kendall Healthcare Syringe 60cc LL NO-BID% 8881560125 § 0.5575 47-8881560125 G¢.5750 EDI-3403-L 4.5004
Alternate Alternate NO-BID; EXEL 26300; § G.4420 NO-BID NG-BID 4420

Laerdal Medical Little Anne CPR Trainers NO-BID NO-BIDy 485-020024 1667500 NOnBIDg 16607504
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMBU 234-005-0000 § 4489.04060 NO-BID% 469.0600
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CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS

RFP-FI-07-08-1376

Emergency Medical Supplies

Core ftem Tabulati

Laerdal Medical Baby Anne CPR Trainers NO-BIiD 20300; § 1.7566 485-050000! $ 46.9000 NO.BID o

Laerdal Medical Baby Anne Soft Pack NO-BID 50010] 8 732600 485050610 $ 77.6500 NO-BID a0

Laerdal Medical Baby Anne airways NO~BID§ 50100: § 05625 485-050100: § 0.6450 NO-BID 8355628

B oy NO-BID 50200 § 6.8500 485-050200, $ 7.1600 NO-BID 66560

Laerdal Medical Little Anne faces NO-B]D% NO-BID 485.3102101 § 7 1600 NO-BID o
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMBU 234-000-703; § 6.3000 NO-BID NO-B]D% 63000

1aerdal Medical Resusci Face Shields NO-BID. NO-BID ss5a600006d s e NO_BID: —
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMBU 248-001-000; § 13300 NO-BID NO-BID 13306

Laerdal Medicat THOMAS ET HOLDER ADLT NO-BID NO-BID 485-600-10000EA] $ 2. 7009 EAW-2338! § 1 3400 27000
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMBU 320-264-041; § 26800 NO-BID: NO-BID © s

Laerdal Medical THOMAS ET HOLDER PEDI NO-BID NO-BID 485-600-20000EA, ¥ 2.7066 EAW-2338-P; § 1.5500 2 760
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMBU 320-264-041; § 2.6800 NGC-BID NOBD  ss0s

1aerdal Medical Sta-Block Head lmmob NO-BID NO-BID 485-700-00001] § 4.4500 N O-BiDg \ason
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMBU 264-034; § 38500 NO-BID NO-BED; 3.9500

o — S NO‘BID% 485-8450212 s asso NO-BID 8.8500
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CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS

RFP-FH-07-08-1376

Emergency Medical Supplies

Core Item Tabulati
Alternate Alternate NO-BID! AMBU 530-213-000! §  &7500 NO-BID: NO-BID 8.750¢

Laerdal Medical BYM Infant NO-BID NO-BID 485-845031; § 8.8560 NO-BID 8.8500
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMBU 540-212-000; &  &8.7560 NO-BID NO-BID 37589

Laerdal Medical BVM Aduit NO-BID NO-BID 485-845011 § 8.8500 NQO-BID 8.8500
Alternate Alternate| NO-BID AMBU 520-211-000; §  &7564 NO-BID! NO-BID: 8.7500

Lacrdal Medical Stifneck Select Adj. Collar NO-BID! NO-BID 485—9800{0E § 55500 NO-BID 55500
Alternate Alternate NO-BID: AMBU 281~O(}O: 5 52000 NO-BID NO-BID 5.2600

[aerdal Medicat V-Vac Starter Kit NO-BID NO-BID 485-985000 § 70,7500 NO-BID 74,7500
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMBU 276-000-001; 5  S£5000 NO-BID NO-BID 54.5000

1.aerdal Medical V-Vae Cartridge NO-BID: NO-BID 485-985001 § 13.2300 NO-BID 13,2390
Alternate Alternate] NO-BID AMBU 276-000-010, 3 88704 NO-BID NO-BID 8.8100

Laerdal Medical V-Vac Adapter Tip 4/pk NO-BID: NO-BID 485-985002! § 2.9708 NO-BID 3.9706
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMBU 276-000-012: §  3.2084 NO-BIDZ NO-BID! 32000

Mallinckrodt Medical Combi-ube trainer NO-BID NO-BID% 307-5-1841. 8 9750660 NO~BID§ §7.5000
Alternate Alternate NO—B}D% AMBU 5-1 8141 § Fd2ioe NO-BID NO-BID 742104
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CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS
RFP-FH-07-08-1376 )
Emergency Medical SUpplies 1 e,
T :
Mallinckrodt Medical Combitube 37f; NO-BID NO-BID 507-5-18437 $ 71.4600 EAW-2448§ § 39.4508 39.4500
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMBU 5-18537% § F48500 NO-BID NO-BID §4.8500
Mallinckrodt Medical Combitube 41fr NO-BID% 5-184410 §  64.8500 507-5-18441 $ 71.4000 EAW-2448; § 38. 7400 38. 7400
Mabis Healthcare Multicuff Kit system 3 NO-BID 01-550-018. &  95.6000 508-01-550-018; § 88,4000 EDi-7325§ $ 91.7500 8840060
MEDSOURCE 533-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID! NO-BID MS-MEDSN, § 63,5600 NO-BID! 63. 5004
Mabig Healthcare Digital Therm NO—BID% 15-600-000 § 4.2500 508-15-600-600; & 4.8000 NQO-BID 4. 2566
MEDICAL ACTION.
Alternate Alternate NQ-BID 060-2210: 3 3E504 NO-BID NO-BID 3.83560
B. Braun Healthcare IV Cath, Ingrocan 24ga NO—BID% 4252500-020 8 1.9006 519-4252500-02, § 1.8008 EDI-3005-[: § 1.8400 1. 800
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID SMITHS 258.3123; § 14564 MNO-BID 1. 4660
B. Braun Healthcare IV Cath, introcan 22ga NO-BID 4252519-02) $ 1.9006 519-4252519-02; § 18604 EDI-3004-1; § 1.8400 L8000
Alternate Alternate NO-BID, NO-31D: SMITHIS 258-31600 § T 4608 NO-BID 1.4600
B. Braun Healthcare IV Cath, Infrocan 20ga NO-BID 4252535-02, $ 1.90G0 519-4252535-02; 3 1.8064 EDI-3003-1 1.8400 {8006
Alternate Alternate NO-BID? NO-BID SMITHIS 258-31 66 b 14664 NO-BID i.45060
B. Braun Heaithcare v Cath, Introcan 18ga NO-BID 4252560'02( $ 1.9000 519-4252560-02; 3 LR008 EDI-3002-1 $ 1.8400 L&0H00
Alternate Alternate NO-BID! NO—SIDE SMITHS 258-3165, § L4608 NO-BiD F 4800
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CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS
RFP-FH-07-08-1376
Emergency Medical Supplies
Core Ttem Tabulation
B. Braun Healthcare 1V Cath, Infrocan l6ga NO-BID 4252586-021 § 1.9600 519-4252586-02; § 1.8009 EDI-3001-1 § 1.8400 18000
Alternate Alternate NO-BID% NO-BID SMITHS 258-3162; § L4nat NO-BID 14660
B. Braun Healthcare 1V Cath, Introcan i4ga NO-BID 4252594-02) § 1.9000; 519-4252594-020 § 18460 EDI-3000-10 § 1.8400 L8606
Alternate Alternate] NO-BID NO-BID SMITHS 258-3168; § L4500 NQO-BID 14600
MEDICAL ACTION
Biohazard Red Bag 33Gallon NO-BID 104M} 8 0.1874 520-104M: § 0.1920 NO-BID G874
MEDICAL ACTION
Biohazard Red Bag 7-10Galion NO-BID 1i6] § 64823 520-116; § G.0880: NO-BID 40823
SPECIALISTS SPECIALISTS 526-
Prosplint Adult Kit NO-BID 113696. § HaA544 1139%6) §  117.0000 ESP-3995! § 144.2500 1168500
: UNISTIK 675 EDI-3278 (§12.15
Lancets (Safety style) NO-BID§ DI 24-088130 § 04156 ATIO0T: & (1850 box 100-normalized); $ 0.1215 00150
Mabis Healthcare Adult BP cuff NO-BID 01-149-0010 § 66000 508-09-141-011; § 219500 EDI-7302: $ 7.1500 6.6000
MEDSOURCE 533-
Alternate Alternate] NO-BIDy NO-BID MS-BP100: § 42560 NO-BID/ 5.2300
Mabis Heaithcare Large adult BP cuff NO-BID! 010-149-016, % 9.3500 308-09-141-016! § 26.80001 EDI-7303; § 71568 715640
MEDSOURCE 533~
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID MS-BP206G § & 8000 NO-BID: 68000
Mabis Healthcare Child BP cuff NO-Bil> 01-14%-015; § 8.7000 508-09-141-015! $ 21.9500; EDI-7301; § 7IR00 71500
| MEDSOURCE 533-
Alternate Alternate NOQ-BID! NO-BID MS-BP300; § 6. 8000 NO-BID 6.8000
Mabis Healthcare Infant BP cuff NO-Bil; 01-149-013; § 8.70001 508-09-141-013, 21.9500 EDI—?BDOE $ 7 i564 71500
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REP-FH-07-08-1376

CITY OF FARMINGTON IIILLS &

Emergency Medical Supplics

Core § Tabulati

'MEDSOURCE §33- |
Alternate Alternate| NO-BID NO-BID MS-BP4G0 6.8000 NO-B?D% 58000
Medsource International BLACK SHEARS NO-BID I46BK-7 §  09600f  533-MS-SHO0I 0.9500 EMLT260, 5 0.8900 0.8900
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID! NO-BID NO-BID 0.0006
Medsource Enternational Sprague Stethoscope Black NO-BID NO-BID/ $33-MS-STBK 5.2000 NO-BID 5.2000
Alternate Alternate] NO-BID ADC 058149, §  8.5600 NO-BID NO-BID 8.5000
EFA-1090 ($3.25 per
Medsource Intemational Triangutar bandage 40x40 NO-BID NO-BID 533-MS-TRI40 0.2200] pk of 12-normalized) §  0.2709 0.2200
AMD-RITMED
Alternate Alternate NO-BID 64600 5§ 0.2366 NO-BID NO-BID 0.2300
Meédegen Medical Products Fracture Bed Pan NO-BID H100-05| §  &.7500 721-1T100-05 0.8250 NO-BID! 2.7500
Medegen Medical Products Male Utinal NO-BID HI0D-01 §  04500]  72:-1T140H-01 0.3901 NO-BID 0.3900
Medegen Medical Products Emesis Basin NO-BID H300-05] §  0.1000 721-H3000-05 0.0978 NO-BID 20970
MEDICAL ACTION
1V START KIT LATEX FREE NO-BID 269175 §  0.8908] MOTION 540-1502 11200 NO-BID 7.8900
Mosrison Medical OB kit NO-BID 006SNL, $  5.5400 56-0965NL 5.6400 EFA-S400, §  4.5460 45400
Mortison Medica! 1V arm board padded 3x9 case 100 NO-BID, 1009-100 §  6.3895 56+1009-100 0.4900 NO-BID 0.3895
Morrison Medical IV arm board padded 3x18 case 100 NO-BID! 1019100/ § #3895 56-1019-100 0.5200 NO-BID 0.3895
Morrison Medical Strap 5 loop NO-BID 1390 $ 27700 56-1390R| 2.9300 EST-1390/ § 19800 19500
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Emergency Medical Supplies

Core Item Tabulation

Mortison Medical Strap 9 disposble (3 pk preferred) NO-BID? 1392: § 27706 56-13920R - 2.9300 EST-1392: § 1.88a4 L&8u)
Morrison Medical Big Blue Head Immob NO-BI 1420, § 741680 56-1420BLYU 81,9200 NO-BID 79. 1000
Morrison Medical Cardboard splint 12" NO-BID 1500 8 (6800 56-1504; {0.9100 NO-BiD} 80000
Morrison Medical Cardboard splint 18" NO-BID 1510 § G.7700 56-1530 1.0000 NO-BID 8. 776
Morrison Medical Cardboard spiint 24" NO-BID! 15200 % . 9804 56-1540 14200 NO-BH (. 9864
Morrison Medical Padded Board Splint 18" NO-BID 181 5 $ 2.4408 56-1818 2.9600 NO-BID 24400
Morrison Medical Padded Board Splint 36" NO-BID 1836‘ 3 39200 56-1836 4.0100 NO-BID 39200
Morrison Medical Padded Board Splini 54" NO-BID 1854 § 58900 56-1854 6.0400 NO-BID 5.8%04
Morrison Medical Splint Pack Kit NO-BID 18';’5‘g § 332068 561875 34.0200 NO-BID 332000
Sager Single Traction Splint NO-BID 5301; § 2098500 576-5301 202.5006 ESP-3i19 §  238.0000 2025080
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID FARETEC ESP-31000 § 1380000 138006006

AMD-RITMED NORTH 623-
N95 MASK One Size fits all NO-BID 2321 % 4.5375 T130N95 0.5420 NO-BID 0.5375

MEDICAL ACTION NORTH 621-
Safety Giasses black/clear lens NO-BID 206: § 32600 T56555B 3.7400 NO-BID 3. 2008

OWEN MUMFORD UNISTIK 3 675-
Lancets Safety NO-BID ATO702! § 61565 ATO07 0.1850 NO-BID L1565

PRINT MEDIA PRINT MEDIA 684.
Life Pak 10 paper NO-BID 254637 § L8786 2549637 0.8900 NO-BID! 8788
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Emergency Medical Supplies
Core [tem Tabulati
PRINT MEDIA PRINT MEDIA 684-
Zall M Fan fold NO-BID 3476189 % 1.8400 3476189 § 1.8500 NO-BID 18400
PRINT MEDIA LEONHARD LANE
Life Pak 12 paper NO-BID 6693246: § 1.8200, 492-12394% & 1. 7663 NOG-BID 1, 7600
PADDOCK L.ABS PADDOCK 687-0060;
Instant Glucose NO-BIDy (0574007030 § 31006 30PK! § 3.4600 NO-BID: 3.1664
Stif-Neck Coilar Baby NO-BID NO-BID 485-980-100; 3 4.8900 NG-BiD £.9960
MEDSOURCE ECO-
Alternate Alternatel NCO-BID NO-BID! ’ PHILLY 690-1P1, 3§ 2.9901 37501 $ 32400 29900
Stif-Neck Collar No-Neck NO-BID NO—BID; 485.98030G 3 4. 9900 NO-BID 49500
MEDSOURCE ECO-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMBU 264-503; § 28400 PHILLY 690-1PL: § 2.9900 37520 8 3.2400 29400
Stif-Neck Collar Pedi NO-BID NO-BID 485~~980200E § 4.9900 NO-BID 4.9904
MEDSOURCE ECO-
Alternate Alternate NG-BID AMBU 264-502: § 29400 PHILLY 690-1PP} $ 2.9%00 3751 8 3.2400 29400
Stif-Neck Collar Regular NO-BID NO-BID 483-880500 § 4.90840 NO-BID 4.9900
MEDSOURCE ECO-
Alternate Alternate] NC-BID AMBU 264.505: § 25400 PHILLY 690-1PR; § 2.9900: 3754 § 3.2400 28400
Stif-Neck Collar Short NO-BID NO-BID 485-980400; £ 4.9900 NO-BID 49901
MEDSQURCE ECO-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID AMBU 264-504; § 29400 PHILLY 69G-1PS: § 2.9900 3753 5 3.2400 2.9400
Stif-Neck Collar Tall NO-BID NO-BID 483-980600: § 4.9800 NO-BID 4.9904
MEDSOURCE ECO-
Alternate Alternate NO-BIDY AMBU 264-506; § 29408 PHILLY 690—1P’Tj $ 2.9900 3755 % 3.24004 2.9406
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RFP-FH-07-08-1376
Emergency Medical Supplies
Core ltem Fabalation
Philadelphia Cervical Collars Philly EMT's Choice Collar NO-BID NO-BID 690-EMT L6006 NC-BI 46000
Alternate Alternate NO-BID 281-000: § 4.5306 NO-BID 4.5566
Smith's Medical Sharpsafe 6Gliter NO-BID 4126; § 3.1500 70-4126 3.2500 EIC-3514) § 30400 J.0406
: PARKER LABS 15-
Defib Gel 60gram NO-BID: 60 § 128647 PARKER 70-13-60 1.3509, NO-BID £.2800
MEDICAL PRECISION 715-

OX Flow Meter NO-BID SMFALDDS § 29.2500 SMFA1005 27.2580 NO-BID 272506
Rico Suction Labs RICO LINERS NO-BID: 1019 § G.2794 735-101 9; 0.2863 NO-BIDB £.2790
Repro-Med Systems Res-Q-Vac NO-BID PIN1511050 §  64.8500 737-PIFISIIONl 617560 NO-BID 61 754
Redi-Rite Clipboard Redi-Rite 8.5x 12 NC-BID 11017 & 173500 75-110%7 17.53060 NC-BID I7.3504
Redi-Rite Clipboard Redi-Rite 8.5 x 14 NO-BID! 150197 § 789800 75-1 1019§ 19.2300 NO-BID 189800

‘ INTERNATIONAL%

Giove Pouch NO-BID 88871 § 6.2500 T39-3103% 2.8006 NO-BID 2.8000
Rusch Lite Blade Kit NO-BID 0048: § 770060 76-0048 100.890¢ NOG-BID Fre000
Rusch Laryn Blade, Disp. Lite Macl NG-BID 004801100 $ 4.2500 76-004801100 42800 EAW-2601-D-5 § £.2060 42000
Rusch Larya Blade, Disp. Lite Mac2 NO-BIDY 064802200, $ 4,2500 76-004802200 4.2800 EAW-2602-D-S: § £.2000 £. 2060
Risch Laryn Blade, Disp. Lite Mac3 NO-B§D§ 0048033000 § 4.2500 T60-004803300 4.2800 EAW-2603-D-S§i & £.2600 42000
Rusch Larvn Blade, Disp. Lite Macd NO-BID 004804460, § 4.2500) 76-004804400 4.2800 EAW-2604-D-S| § 42000 4, 2000
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Rusch Laryn Blade, Disp. Lite Mil 0 NO-BID 0048500500 % 4.2500 76-004830050 $ 4.2800 EAW-%OS-D»S% & 4.2000 4.2060
Rusch Laryn Biade, Disp. Lite Mil 1 NO-BID; 00485’15{)03 $ 4.2500 76-00485100; $ 4,2800; EAW-26006-D-8; § 4,.2000 4.2008
Rausch Laryn Blade, Disp. Lite Mil 2 _ NO-BID 004852200 § 4.2500 76-0048352200: % 4.2800 BAW-2607-D-5; § 4,2860 4.2000
Rusch Laryn Blade, Disp. Lite Mil 3 NO-BID% 004853300, § 4.2500 76-004853300! $ 4.2800 EAW-2608-D~S§ 3 42000 £.2000
Rausch Rusch Lite Case only NO-BID 008650500, §  33.6000 76-008650500; § 34.8000 EAW-26451 § 36.9500 33,6004
502505,502507,502
Rusch STYLETTE 5.0-10.0MM NO-BIDY 501,502503 § 21500 76-10000 $ 2.9500 NO-BID: 21500
Rusch ET Tebe 2.5, Uncuffed NO-BID 100382025, § 1.1800 76-100382025: § 1.1500 EAW-2300-5; § {3300 09508
SUNMED 7921 :
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID 7330-25 3 H9208 NO-BIDY 0.9200
Rusch ET Tube 3.0, Uncuffed NO-BID 100382030 § 1.1800 76-100382030: § 1.1500 EAW-2301-S; § §.9500 4.9508
SUNMED 792-1-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID 733G-30) 3 0.9200 NO-BID, 69260
Rusch ET Tube 3.5, Uncuffed NO-BID! 100382035: § 1.1800 76-100382035! $ 1.1500 EAW-2302-8 § 0.9586 0.9504
: SUNMED 792-1~
Alternate Alternate NO-BiD NO-BID/| 7330-3% % #.926¢ NO-BID; 9280
Rusch ET Tube 4.0, Uncuffed NO-BID 100382640; § 1.1800 76-1006382040; § 1.1560 EAW-2303-8 § 09500 BUSG0
SUNMED 792-1-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID 733040 § 49260 NO-BID . 9240
Rusch ET Tube 4.5, Uncuffed NO-BiD 100382045, § 1.1800 76-100382045 3 1.3500 EAW-2304-8, % 0.9500 4.5508
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SUNMED 792-1-
Alernate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID 733045 § 0.9200 NO-BID H9200
Rusch ET Tube 5.0 Uncuffed NO-BID 160382050 £.1800 76-100382050 % 1.1500 EAW-2305-8 $ 8.9506 g.8500
SUNMED 792-1-
Alternate AMernate NO-BID NO-BID 7330-50) § #9266 NO-BID 692601
Rusch ET Tube 3.3, Uncuffed NO-BID 100382055 1.1800 76-100382055¢ % 1.15040 EAW-2306-8; § 39560 0.9500
SUNMED 792-1-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID: NO-BID, 7330-55 § 49208 NO-BID: 4.9284
Rusch ET Tube 5.0, cuffed NO-BID? 112082050% £.2500) 76-112082050] § 1,3100 EAW-2305-8. & 0. 8500 89500
SUNMED 792-1-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID 7333-50) § . 9800 NO-BID 49800
Rusch ET Tube, 5.5, Coffed NO-BID 112082055 1.2500) 76-112082055¢ % 1.3100 EAW-2306-S; § 0. 9500 49500
SUNMED 792-1-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID! 7333-55 % . 9804 NG-BID 0.9800
Rusch ET Tube, 6.0, Cuffed NO—BIDé 112082060 1.2500 76-112082060! § 1.3100 EAW-2312-§] % a,.9504 A8500
SUNMED 792-1-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID 7333-60) § 0.9806 NO-BID 0. 9804
Rusch ET Tube, 6.5, Cuffed NO-BID§ 112082065 1.2500 76-1120820651 $ 1.3100 BAW.2313-S § 9560 9354
SUNMED 792-1-
Alternate Alteroate NO-BID NO-BID 7333-65 & L9806 NO-BID . 9806
Rusch ET Tube, 7.9, Cuifed NOG-BID 132082070 1.2500 76-11208207¢1 § 1.3100 EAW-2314-8 § 0. 9508 0. 9504
SUNMED 792-1-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BIDi 733370 § 89864 NO-BID; 0.9804
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Rusch ET Tube, 7.5, Cuffed NO-Bilx 112082075 $ 1.250C 76-1120820751 § 1.3100 EAW-2315-5 § 0. 9500 09504
SUNMED 792-1-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BIDY 7333-75¢ % 4.9800 NO-BID 0.9300
Rusch ET Tube, 8.0, Cuffed NO-BID 112082080: § 1.2500 76-112082080! $ 1.3100 EAW-2316-5; § 093500 #.9504
SUNMED 792-1-
Alternate Alfernate NO-BID NO-BID, 7333-80] § 4.9809 NO-BID &.9808
Rusch ET Tube; 8.5, Cuffed NO-BID 112082085 §5-  1.2500 76-112082085; § 1.3169 EAW-2317-8] § 89,9500 0.9500
SUNMED 792-1-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID; 7333-85, § 0.9808 NO-BID 0.980¢
Rusch ET Tube, 9.0, Cuffed NO-BID 112082090, §  125.0000 76-112082090: % 13100 EAW-2318-5. § 0. 3500 0.85G4
SUNMED 792-1-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID/ 733390 % 0. 2846 NO-BID 08800
Rusch ET Tube, 9.5, Cuffed NO-BID 112082095: § 1.25004 76-112082095; § 1.3100 EAW-2319-8: § 84,2500 09500
SUNMED 792-1~
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID 733395 § G.9804 NO-BID 0.980¢
Rusch ET TFube 10.0mm, cuffed NO-BID 1120820100! $ 1.2500 76-112082100; 3 1.3100 EAW-ZBQO-S? 3 6.9500 29560
SUNMED 792-1- :
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BiD 7333-10¢ % o8t NO-BID 49808
Rusch Cuick Trach 2.0 Child NO-BID 1209000200 §  131.2560 76-120900020) § 14287900 NO-BID 131.2560
Rusch Quick Trach 4.0 Aduit NO-BID 1209000400 § 13125608 76-1209000400 §  142.8700 NO-BID 1312500
Rusch STYLETTE 2.0-4.5MM NQ-BID 500 § 29200 76-500; $ 2.9500 NO-BED% 2.9200
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Rusch STYLETTE 4.0-6.5MM NO-BID: 750§ 2.9200 76-750 § 2.9500 NO-BID 2.9200
Safetec America infection Control Kit NO-BID 17606 §  4.1540 768-17606! $ 4.2700 NO-BID £.1500
Safetec America Hand Sanitizer 20z NO-BID 18355, 8 0.7800 768-17355 8 0,650 NO-BID 0.6500
DERMARITE
Alternate Alternate NO-BID: 00104 § 6400 NO-BID NO-BID 8. 6400
Safetec America P.AW.S. Persanal Wipes NO-BID 344000 § 0.0348 768-344000 3 7.0334 NO-BID 6.0330
Philtips Defib Pads Heartstart NO-BID 31177713, 13.6500 4131177713 8 7,050 NO-BID 70500
Rusch NP Airway 284r fatex NO-BID! 123028 § 29500 76-123028 % 5.6700 EAW-2428-5 § 1.9400 0.8508
| SUNMED 792-1-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID NO-BID 507628 § 17760 NQ-BID L7700
Rusch NP Airway 301t Jatex NO-BID! 123630: §  8.9560 76-1238301 § 5.6700 HAW-2430-8 § 1.9400 09500
SUNMED 792-1.
Alternate Alternate NO-BIDI NO-BID 5067-30; 3 L7708 NO-BID L7700
Rusch NP Ajrway 32fr latex NO-BID 123632 5 0.9500 76-1230320 $ 56700 EAW-2432-5 § 1.940C a.9500
SUNMED 792-1-
Alfernate Alternate NO-BID; NO-BID! 5067-321 % L7700 NO-BID 17700
Rusch NP Airway 34fr latex NO-BID 123034, §  4.9500 76-123034. § 56700 EAW-2434-S % 1.54001 a.9500
| 5 SUNMELD 792-1-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID: NO-BID: 5067-34] 3 1.7760 NO-BID L7708
Rusch NF Airway 36fr latex NO-BID 123036 §  0.9508 76-1230361 § 5.6700) EAW-2436-S:§ $ 1.9400 $.9500
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SUNMED 792-1-
Alfernate Alternate] NO-BID NO-BID 5067-360 § IL.77608 NO-BID 170
Prolite Backboard Prolite XT GREEN NOQ PINS NO-BID§ TIING, 8§ 129.8501 806-7T17T-NG. § 135.8800 NO-BID 129.8580
Prolite Backboard Prolife XT GREEN W/PINS NO-BID 717NG~P§ 8 143.5066 806-717-PNG; § 146.9500 NO-BID 143.5600
Kendall Heaitheare Buttcrﬂy Closure Med NO-BID NO-BiD NQO-BID NO-BID i.4g00
DYNAREX 279-
Alternate Alternate NO-BID ASO LLC CBD6418, 3 0.0275 3615BX 8§ 00142 MNO-BID G.3142
Kendall Healthcare Band-Aid Kids NO-BID 613 ]IF § 0386 NO-BID NO-BID 0.0384
Alternate Alternate NO-BID ASO LLC GARS293: § 84390 SWIFT 834-0104458; § 0.1040 NO-BID 0.8394
TEXTILECSE
Ammonia Inhalants NO-BID MEDIQUE 27212; $ 0.1480F SWIFT 834-281005: § 81254 NO-BID #1254
SWIFT FIRST AIDE: SWIFT 834-
Wire Ladder splint boxed NO-BID> 35221INS § 2.3500 35221WS. § 2.3460 NO-BID 23400
Ventilab 1V Pressure Infus, 1000m} NO-BID NO-BID 87-VCA1GEA § 8. 1060 NO-BID 8. 1000
ETNOX CORP.
Alternate Alternate NG-BID 4010 § 8.4804 NO-BID NO-BID 8.40860
Waismed ADULT BONE INJECTION GUN,B LG NO-BIiD WMBIGAL, § 533060 934-WMBIG-A1; § 59.0006 NO-BID 335000
Waismed PED.BONE INJECTION GUN,B.IG. NO-BID WMBIGC2: § 335600 G34.WMBIG-C2. § 59.0000 NO-BID 53,5000
Welch Allen Suretemp Plus 690 thermometer NO-Bil> 01690-2000 § 2037504 04-01690-200: § 227 8400 NO-BIDY 203, 7568
Welch Allen Disposable covers for Suretemp NG-BID 05031-101: § 3.4386 94-05031-101; § 0.0408 NO-BID 04386
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MEDICAL PX-54061 MEDSOURCE 533+
Oxygen Tank M NO-BID, 1§ 1907500 MS-MED-MM: $ 2050000 NO-BID 190, 7500
MADA MEDICAL
NO-BID 18021TE! § 7857500 NO-BID NO-BID 185.7500
MEDICAL PX-8702
Oxygen Tank, Alom DD w/oggie NO-BID! ITH §  481000]  533-MS-MED=DT. §  45.8000 EAW-2813] § 522500 45.0000
: MADA MEDICAL
NO-BID 1S02E] §  46.7500 NO-BID NO-BID 46, 7540
_ MEDICAL PX-8703 WESTERN 96-PX-
Oxygen Tank, Alum E w/oggle NO-BID 1T 8§ 47.5060 8703-ITI §  48.2000 EAW-2815 $  359.9500 47.5600
LOW ON BRAMNDED ITEMS 5 ii2 68 66
o 31 23 8

'LOW ON UN-BRANDED ITEMS)
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