
CITY OF ROCHESTER HILLS, MICHIGAN
PROJECT: PARKING LOT STRIPING & CRACK SEALING

ITB-RH-05-039-1 TABULATION
Bids Read: October 5, 2005 3:00 PM

NAME Frank Galley Striping Pave Tech Systems Inc.
ADDRESS 55115 Shady Lane 25975 Beach Court

Shelby Township, MI 48315 Southfield, MI 48034
Project 1:  City Hall 
   A.  Employee Parking Lot 
        1.  Crack Sealing NO BID 3,551.00$                        
        2.  Striping NO BID 320.00$                           
   B.  Visitor Parking Lot
        1.  Striping NO BID 210.00$                           
Project 2:  Borden Park 
   A.  West Parking Lot 
        1.  Crack Sealing NO BID 5,310.00$                        
        2.  Striping NO BID 250.00$                           
   B  North Parking Lot 
        1.  Crack Sealing NO BID 6,784.00$                        
        2.  Striping NO BID 475.00$                           
   C.  East Parking Lot 
        1.  Crack Sealing NO BID 5,194.00$                        
        2.  Striping NO BID 240.00$                           
Project 3:  Avondale Park 
   A.  Public Parking Lot
        1.  Crack Sealing NO BID 1,510.00$                        
        2.  Striping NO BID 60.00$                             
Project 4:  Borden Park 
   A.  Tennis Courts
        1.  Crack Sealing NO BID 1,680.00$                        
   A.  Tennis Courts
        1.  Crack Sealing NO BID 420.00$                           
Alternate Bid: 
Project 1:  Spencer Park 
   A.  Tennis Courts
         1.  Crack Sealing NO BID 450.00$                           
Project 2:  Avondale Park 
   A.  Basketball Courts
         1.  Crack Sealing NO BID 210.00$                           
   B.  Tennis Courts
         1.  Crack Sealing NO BID 390.00$                           

Total Crack Sealing - Base NO BID $24,449.00
Total Striping - Base NO BID $1,555.00
Total Crack Sealing - Alternate NO BID $1,050.00

Total All Crack Sealing (base & alternate) NO BID $25,499.00
Total All Striping NO BID $1,555.00
TOTAL EVERYTHING $27,054.00
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