CITY OF ROCHESTER HILLS, MICHIGAN
PROJECT: Aggregates for 2019 and 2020

ITB-RH-18-063 TABULATION

Bids Read: December 20, 2018 @ 3:00 P.M.

NAME Osburn Industries Edw. C. Levy Co Michigan Sand and Gravel Richmond Transport Inc. Troy Aggregate Carriers, Inc. San Marino Exc. Inc. Gary's Transport Inc. Mound Road Crushed Concrete
5850 Pardee 9300 Dix Ave. 200 E. Sutton Rd. 4020 County Line 6075 Elmridge 5550 Mitchell Way 54255 Card Rd. 33200 Mound Rd.
ADDRESS Taylor, MI 48180 Dearborn, M1 48120 Metamora, M1 48455 Lenox, M1 48050 Sterling Heights, M1 48313 Howell, M1 48843 Macomb, M1 48042 Sterling Heights, M1 48310
6A Natural Stone - No Award
2019 Cost per ton $17.30 $22.39 $21.50 $22.50 $24.00 $28.50 NO Bid No Bid
2020 Cost per ton $18.73 $23.22 $22.75 $23.65 $27.40 $34.20 NO Bid No Bid
21AA Natural Stone:
2019 Cost per ton $16.10 No Bid $20.00 $20.85 $22.50 $32.60 No bid No Bid
2020 Cost per ton $16.58 No Bid $21.25 $21.90 $25.60 $39.12 No bid No Bid
22A Road Gravel:
2019 Cost per ton $16.00 No Bid $14.49 $16.75 $21.50 $21.00 No bid No Bid
2020 Cost per ton $17.60 No Bid $15.74 $17.60 $24.30 $25.20 No bid No Bid
5G Slag:
2019 Cost per ton $21.20 $22.59 No Bid $20.70 $21.00 $29.30 $19.75 No Bid
2020 Cost per ton $23.32 $23.31 No Bid $21.75 $24.00 $35.16 $20.25 No Bid
22X Slag:
2019 Cost per ton $11.70 $13.70 No Bid $11.70 $12.00 $18.95 $10.75 No Bid
2020 Cost per ton $12.87 $13.95 No Bid $12.30 $13.00 $22.74 $11.25 No Bid
21AA Crushed Concrete:
2019 Cost per ton $13.10 $22.09 No Bid $16.75 $15.00 $20.50 No Bid $14.00
2020 Cost per ton $14.41 $22.79 No Bid $17.90 $17.00 $24.60 No Bid $14.00
Initialed delivery is FOB? No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes
Alternate Bid: 6HC A“:mazt;f:’é: M'ETCHAAtS'ag
Exceptions: Natural Stone for 6A or rushed t.oncrete None None 50 Ton minimum load None None None
| Stone Please see response for additional
Natura exceptions.
Accept MasterCard? | Yes Yes No No No No No No
Preferred Payment Method: [ ACH Left Blank Check or ACH ACH Check ACH Check Check
Estimated Annual Qty 21AA Crushed Concete (tons)
500 $6,550.00 $7,000.00
$7,205.00 $7,000.00
$13,755.00 $14,000.00




	Tabulation

