

**CITY OF ROCHESTER HILLS, MICHIGAN**

**PROJECT: Asphalt Paving Materials**

**ITB-RH-18-061 TABULATION**

**Bids Read: December 19, 2018 @ 3:00 P.M.**

<b>NAME</b>	<b>Ajax Materials Corp.</b>	<b>Cadillac Asphalt LLC</b>
<b>ADDRESS</b>	<b>Troy, MI</b>	<b>Canton, Michigan</b>
<b>Bituminous Mixture 1100 Leveling</b>		
2019 Cost per ton	\$68.00	\$68.00
2020 Cost per ton	\$73.00	\$72.00
<b>Bituminous Mixture 1100 Wearing</b>		
2019 Cost per ton	\$68.50	\$68.00
2020 Cost per ton	\$73.50	\$72.00
<b>Bituminous Mixture 36A Wearing</b>		
2019 Cost per ton	\$78.00	\$72.00
2020 Cost per ton	\$83.00	\$76.00
<b>Bituminous Mixture 20AM Wearing</b>		
2019 Cost per ton	\$71.00	No Bid
2020 Cost per ton	\$76.00	No Bid
<b>Bituminous Mixture 13AM</b>		
2019 Cost per ton	\$72.75	\$69.00
2020 Cost per ton	\$77.75	\$73.00
<b>Bituminous Mixture 5E3 Wearing</b>		
2019 Cost per ton	\$81.00	\$80.00
2020 Cost per ton	\$86.00	\$83.00
Distance from DPS Garage:	3.97 Miles	8.9 Miles
Plant Location:	2240 Avon Industrial Drive, Rochester Hills, 48309	2040 Barrett Drive, Troy 48084
Terms:	Net 30 days upon receipt of inv.	No Discounts
Accept MasterCard?	No	Yes
Preferred payment method:	ACH	ACH

**City of Rochester Hills, Michigan**  
**Project: Asphalt Paving Materials 2019 and 2020**  
**ITB-RH-18-061 Tabulation**

	<b>Ajax Paving Materials</b>		<b>Cadillac Asphalt</b>	
	Troy, MI 48084		Canton, MI 48188	
	<b>2019</b>	<b>2020</b>	<b>2019</b>	<b>2020</b>
	<b>Per Ton</b>	<b>Per Ton</b>	<b>Per Ton</b>	<b>Per Ton</b>
Bituminous Mixture 1100 Leveling	\$68.00	\$73.00	\$68.00	\$72.00
Bituminous Mixture 1100 Wearing	\$68.50	\$73.50	\$68.00	\$72.00
Bituminous Mixture 36A Wearing	\$78.00	\$83.00	\$72.00	\$76.00
Bituminous Mixture 20AM Wearing	\$71.00	\$76.00	No Bid	No Bid
Bituminous Mixture 13AM	\$72.75	\$77.75	\$69.00	\$73.00
Bituminous Mixture 5E3 Wearing	\$81.00	\$86.00	\$80.00	\$83.00

2240 Avon Industrial Drive,  
Rochester Hills 48309

2040 Barrett Drive, Troy 48084

Miles from Garage to Plant as determined by MapQuest:  
Minutes Round Trip as determined by MapQuest:

4.1  
16

8.5  
34

**Cost per Minute**

Light Equip Operator (49.75/hr inc. benefits) 0.829  
Tandem Dump Truck (57.87 per hour) 0.965

Cost labor/round trip \$13.27      Cost labor/round trip \$28.19  
Cost vehicle/round trip \$15.43      Cost vehicle/round trip \$32.79

**Revised Costs w/Labor/Equipment Included**  
**Roundtrip between Garage to Plant**

	<b>Ajax Materials Corporation</b>		<b>Cadillac Asphalt</b>	
	Rochester Hills, MI 48309		Troy, MI 48084	
	<b>2019</b>	<b>2020</b>	<b>2019</b>	<b>2020</b>
<b>Cost Per Ton Based on Round Trip to Plant:</b>	<b>Per Ton</b>	<b>Per Ton</b>	<b>Per Ton</b>	<b>Per Ton</b>
Bituminous Mixture 1100 Leveling	\$96.70	\$101.70	\$128.98	\$132.98
Bituminous Mixture 1100 Wearing	\$97.20	\$102.20	\$128.98	\$132.98
Bituminous Mixture 36A Wearing	\$106.70	\$111.70	\$132.98	\$136.98
Bituminous Mixture 20AM Wearing	\$99.70	\$104.70		
Bituminous Mixture 13AM	\$101.45	\$106.45	\$129.98	\$133.98
Bituminous Mixture 5E3 Wearing	\$109.70	\$114.70	\$140.98	\$143.98