
CITY OF ROCHESTER HILLS, MICHIGAN
PROJECT:   Asphalt Paving Materials
ITB-RH-17-003 TABULATION
Bids Read:  January 25, 2017 @ 3:00 P.M.

NAME Ajax Materials Corp. Cadillac Asphalt LLC
ADDRESS Troy, MI  48084 Canton, MI  48188

Bituminous Mixture 1100T (20AA)
2017 Cost per ton $55.50 $54.00
2018 Cost per ton $58.50 $57.00

Bituminous Mixture 36A Wearing
2017 Cost per ton $65.00 $58.00
2018 Cost per ton $68.00 $61.00

Bituminous Mixture 20AM Wearing
2017 Cost per ton $56.50 No Bid
2018 Cost per ton $59.50 No Bid

Bituminous Mixture 13AM 
2017 Cost per ton $58.00 $58.00
2018 Cost per ton $61.00 $60.00

Bituminous Mixture 5E3 Wearing
2017 Cost per gallon $68.75 $65.00
2018 Cost per gallon $71.75 $68.00

Distance from DPS Garage 4 Miles 8.7 Miles

Terms: Net 30 Days Net 30 Days

Accept MasterCard? No Yes + 4%

Preferred payment method: ACH Check



Name:
Address:

2017 2018 2017 2018
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
$55.50 $58.50 $54.00 $57.00
$65.00 $68.00 $58.00 $61.00

Bituminous Mixture 20AM Wearing $56.50 $59.50 No Bid No Bid
$58.00 $61.00 $58.00 $60.00
$68.75 $71.75 $65.00 $68.00

4.1 7.9
14 28

Cost per Minute
Light Equip Operator (49.02/hr inc. benefits) 0.817
Tandem Dump Truck (70.18 per hour) 1.170

Cost labor/round trip $11.44 Cost labor/round trip $22.88
Cost vehicle/round trip $16.38 Cost vehicle/round trip $32.75

Revised Costs w/Labor/Equipment Included
From Location of Material Pickup

2017 2018 2017 2018
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
$83.31 $86.31 $109.63 $112.63
$92.81 $95.81 $113.63 $116.63
$84.31 $87.31
$85.81 $88.81 $113.63 $115.63
$96.56 $99.56 $120.63 $123.63

Minutes Round Trip as Determined by MapQuest:

Rounded

Bituminous Mixture 1100T (20AA)
Bituminous Mixture 36A Wearing
Bituminous Mixture 20AM Wearing

Cadillac Asphalt

Bituminous Mixture 5E3 Wearing

2575 Haggerty Rd

Rochester Hills, MI 48309 Shelby Township, MI 48315

Ajax Materials Corporation

Miles from Garage to Plant:

Ajax Paving Materials
830 Kirts Blvd, Ste 100

Troy, MI  48084

Cost Per Ton Based on Round Trip to Plant:

2240 Avon Industrial Drive 12345 23 Mile Road

Bituminous Mixture 13AM
Bituminous Mixture 5E3 Wearing

Canton, MI  48188

Bituminous Mixture 1100T (20AA)
Bituminous Mixture 36A Wearing

Bituminous Mixture 13AM

Cadillac Asphalt
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