
City of Farmington Hills, MI
Bid Tabulation
Rock Salt
ITB-FH-14-15-1881
Bid Opening 4/15/2015
**AS READ**

Oakland Cty Macomb Cty Wayne Cty

2015/16 Season Early fill Late fill Early fill Late fill Early fill Late fill
Vendor City/State $/Ton $/Ton Total(late fill) $/Ton $/Ton Total(late fill) $/Ton $/Ton Total(late fill) Mined/Storage Exceptions
Morton Salt Chicago, IL $102.91 $107.91 $4,650,921.00 $103.37 $108.37 $3,310,703.50 $102.01 $107.01 $1,284,120.00 Detroit/  
Compass Minerals America Overland Park, KS $79.95 $79.95 $3,445,845.00 $79.95 $79.95 $2,442,472.50 $79.95 $79.95 $959,400.00 Goodrich Ontario/River Rouge 80%min/100% max
Detroit Salt Detroit, MI $56.61 $57.11 $2,461,441.00 $58.40 $58.90 $1,799,395.00 $54.57 $55.07 $660,840.00 Detroit/Detroit

Oakland Cty Macomb Cty Wayne Cty

2016/17 Season(option) Early fill Late fill Early fill Late fill Early fill Late fill
Vendor City/State $/Ton $/Ton Total(late fill) $/Ton $/Ton Total(late fill) $/Ton $/Ton Total(late fill) Mined/Storage Exceptions
Morton Salt Chicago, IL $107.91 $112.91 $4,866,421.00 $108.37 $113.37 $3,463,453.50 $107.01 $112.01 $1,344,120.00 Detroit/  
Compass Minerals America Overland Park, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Goodrich Ontario/River Rouge 80%min/100% max
Detroit Salt Detroit, MI $58.61 $59.11 $2,547,641.00 $60.40 $60.90 $1,860,495.00 $56.57 $57.07 $684,840.00 Detroit/Detroit

43,100 30,550 12,000

43,100 30,550 12,000


