

CITY OF ROCHESTER HILLS, MICHIGAN
PROJECT: Aggregates for 2017 and 2018
ITB-RH-17-006 TABULATION
Bids Read: February 15, 2017 @ 3:00 P.M.

NAME	B & W Landscape	Edw. C. Levy Co.	Gary's Transport Inc.	Glenn Eisenhardt Exc., Inc.	Tri-City Aggregates, Inc.	Osburn Industries, Inc.	Fiore's Crushed Concrete Inc.	Richmond Transport	Supreme Soils LLC
ADDRESS	43291 North Ave. Clinton Twp, MI 48036	9300 Dix Ave. Detroit, MI 48120	54255 Card Rd. Macomb, MI 48042	200 E. Sutton Rd. Metamora, MI 48455	P.O. Box 182 Holly, MI 48442	5850 Pardee Taylor, MI 48180	33200 Mound Rd. Sterling Heights, MI 48310	4020 County Line Lenox, MI 48050	47850 Van Dyke Rd. Shelby Twp., MI 48317
6A Natural Stone									
2017 Cost per ton	\$18.24	\$18.20	\$17.40	\$17.41	No Bid	\$17.50	No Bid	\$17.00	\$21.59
2018 Cost per ton	\$18.64	\$18.70	\$18.40	\$18.21	No Bid	\$18.73	No Bid	\$17.50	\$22.09
		*Substituted 6AC Natural				*Substituted 6AC Natural			
21AA Natural Stone:									
2017 Cost per ton	\$17.94	\$18.86	No Bid	\$17.70	No Bid	\$15.05	No Bid	\$16.75	\$27.57
2018 Cost per ton	\$18.44	\$19.36	No Bid	\$17.95	No Bid	\$16.10	No Bid	\$17.25	\$28.07
		*Substituted 21AC Natural							
22A Road Gravel:									
2017 Cost per ton	\$17.24	\$15.16	No Bid	\$12.50	\$12.00	\$16.15	No Bid	\$13.50	\$20.46
2018 Cost per ton	\$17.74	\$15.66	No Bid	\$13.00	\$13.00	\$17.28	No Bid	\$13.90	\$20.96
5G Slag:									
2017 Cost per ton	\$17.72	\$17.51	\$17.35	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.65	No Bid	\$17.50	\$22.60
2018 Cost per ton	\$17.96	\$18.01	\$17.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.96	No Bid	\$18.00	\$23.10
22X Slag:									
2017 Cost per ton	\$10.14	\$9.88	\$10.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.65	No Bid	\$10.50	\$14.04
2018 Cost per ton	\$10.38	\$10.38	\$11.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.40	No Bid	\$10.80	\$14.54
21AA Crushed Concrete:									
2017 Cost per ton	\$11.44	No Bid	\$13.95	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.35	\$14.00	\$12.00	\$12.21
2018 Cost per ton	\$11.94	No Bid	\$14.55	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.14	\$14.00	\$12.40	\$12.71