

City of Rochester Hills, Michigan

ITB-RH-21-004 Aggregates for 2023 and 2024 - Tabulation

Bids Due: January 26, 2023 @ 3:00 P.M.

NAME	Bedrock Express LTD	Dani's Transport	Gary's Transport, Inc.	Fiore's Crushed Concrete Inc., dba Mound Road Crushed Concrete	Tri-City Aggregates Inc.
	Ortonville, MI	South Rockwood, MI	Macomb, MI	Sterling Heights, MI	Holly, MI
6AC Natural Stone:					
2023 Cost per ton	\$18.95	\$23.21	\$24.25	No Bid	No Bid
2024 Cost per ton	\$20.49	\$25.54	\$24.75	No Bid	No Bid
21AA Natural Stone-Road Gravel:					
2023 Cost per ton	\$38.95	\$25.19	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2024 Cost per ton	\$42.95	\$27.71	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23A Natural Stone-Road Gravel:					
2023 Cost per ton	\$22.45	\$18.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2024 Cost per ton	\$23.25	\$19.91	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21AA Limestone					
2023 Cost per ton	\$24.95	\$20.59	\$20.50	No Bid	No Bid
2024 Cost per ton	\$26.95	\$22.65	\$21.75	No Bid	No Bid
5G Slag - No Award					
2023 Cost per ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2024 Cost per ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21AA Crushed Concrete:					
2023 Cost per ton	\$18.95	\$16.18	No Bid	\$21.95	No Bid
2024 Cost per ton	\$19.95	\$17.95	No Bid	\$22.95	No Bid
Class II Fill Sand					
2023 Cost per ton	\$10.95	\$11.14	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.24
2024 Cost per ton	\$11.49	\$12.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.24
Initialed delivery is FOB?	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
Exceptions:					
Accept MasterCard?	Yes	Yes +5%	No	No	Yes
Preferred Payment Method:	Credit Card	ACH	Check	Check	Check
Terms:	2% Discount, Net 10 Days of Credit Card Paymnet				30 Days