City of Rochester Hills, Michigan

Project: Aggregates (Road Gravel) 2015 and 2016

ITB-RH-15-001 Tabulation |

Bid Names Read: January 20, 2015 @ 3:00 PM

Name: Edw. C. Levy Co. Gary's Transport Inc Richmond Transport, Inc.* [Fiore's Crushed Concrete Inc.|] Tri City Aggregates Inc**
Address: 8800 Dix Avenue 54255 Card Rd 4020 County Line 33200 Mound Rd PO Box 182

Dearborn, Ml 48209-1093 Macomb, Ml 48042 Lenox, Ml 48050 Sterling Heights, Ml 48310 Holly, Ml 48442

2015 2016 2015 2016 2015 2016 2015 2016 2015 2016

Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
21AA Road Gravel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 16.30 | $ 17.10 | $ 15.00 | $ 15.00 No Bid No Bid
22A Road Gravel $ 13.00 | $ 13.25 No Bid No Bid | $ 1275 | $ 13.35 No Bid No Bid | $ 8.85 No Bid
5G Slag $ 1715 | $ 1740 | $ 16.25 | $ 16.55 | $ 1790 | $ 18.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22X Slag $ 10.70 | $ 1095 | $ 925|% 950 | $ 1090 | $ 11.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Initialed prices FOB? Yes No Yes No Yes

Payment due 30 days from date Vendor does not carry an

Exceptions: None of invoice umbrella liability policy None
Accept MasterCard? Yes Yes - 4% Processing fee Yes - 3% Processing fee
Preferred Payment Method: ACH Check Check Check Check

Notes:

*Vendor can not meet insurance
requirements.

**The vendor submitted pricing of
$26,550.00 per ton for 2016 cost. The
vendor took the estimated annual usage
times the 2015 cost/ton and entered
that amount in the 2016 cost field
(estimated usage of 3,000 x $8.85 =
$26,550). The solicitation was a sealed
bid. The bid process does not allow for
pricing errors to be corrected after the
public bid opening, therefore, a "no bid"
was recorded for the 2016 cost. The
soliciation requires pricing for both 2015
and 2016. Since the vendor did not
provide costs for both years the bid is
non-responsive and could not be
considered in the evaluation process.




