
City of Rochester Hills, Michigan

Project:  Asphalt Paving Materials 2015 and 2016

ITB-RH-15-002 Tabulation

Bid Names Read:  January 20, 2015 @ 3:00 PM

Name:

Address:

2015 2016 2015 2016 2015 2016

Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton

$52.50 $55.50 $48.00 $49.50 $49.50 $51.00

$59.00 $62.00 $54.00 $55.50 $59.00 $61.00

$53.25 $56.25 $48.00 $49.50 No Bid No Bid

4 8 8.5

12 26 28

Cost labor/round trip 9.36$            Cost labor/round trip 20.27$         Cost labor/round trip 21.83$              

Cost vehicle/round trip 12.76$          Cost vehicle/round trip 27.64$         Cost vehicle/round trip 29.77$              

Revised Costs w/labor/eqpt included

from location of material pickup

2015 2016 2015 2016 2015 2016

Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton

$74.61 $77.61 $95.91 $97.41 $101.10 $102.60

$81.11 $84.11 $101.91 $103.41 $110.60 $112.60

$75.36 $78.36 $95.91 $97.41 No Bid No Bid

Cost per minute

Light Equip Operator (46.78/hr inc. benefits) 0.779666667

Tandem Dump Truck (63.79 per hour) 1.063166667

Rochester Hills, MI 48309 Shelby Township, MI 48315 Troy, MI 

Cost per ton based on round trip to plant

Rounded

Ajax Materials Corporation Cadillac Asphalt Barrett Paving Materials Inc

2240 Avon Industrial Drive 12345 23 Mile Road 2040 Barrett Drive

Bituminous Mixture 1100T (20AA)

Bituminous Mixture 36A Wearing

Bituminous Mixture 20AM Wearing

2575 Haggerty Rd 67 Mary St

Miles from garage to plant:

Minutes round trip as determined by MapQuest:

Ajax Paving Materials

830 Kirts Blvd, Ste 100

Troy, MI  48084

Cadillac Asphalt Barrett Paving Materials Inc

Canton, MI  48188 Mt. Clemens, MI  48046


