
City of Farmington Hills

RFP TABULATION

RFP-FH-12-13-1748

AUTO PARTS

Opened 05/14/2013

General Info

Company City/State

1 original, 1 

copy & 1 

electronic Section A-General

Section B-Customer Service 

Approach

Section C-Statement of 

Qualifications

Section D-Personnel 

Qualfications

Section E-Discount 

Proposal page

Section F-Mfg Price 

Lists

State Wire & Terminal Davisburg, MI No-bid

General Parts Distributors-DBA 

CARQUEST Auto Parts Livonia, MI

No electronic 

copy included Incomplete Incomplete Incomplete Partial Complete Incomplete

Recommend Disqualification - Did 

not follow format requested, Issuing 

US Communities Contract terms & 

Crossed out sections of Request for 

Proposal including parts of section 

24 (Title IV reference)

Scanned hard 

copy

A notebook page of 

location names & phone 

numbers is included but 

not specific to this contract

Included price will be 

from "Retail" price. 

Additional Discounts 

refer to US 

Communities Pricing & 

Master Agreement 

terms

No catalog was included. 

There is a reference to 

"Retail Price List 3" but 

no info on how to access 

it. Can NOT verify prices 

listed on sample sheet

Kirk's Automotive Detroit, MI Yes Complete Complete Complete Complete Complete Complete

Established in 1946, 39 full time 

employees. Distributes NAPA and 

has access to their inventory as well

Will deliver stock orders on agreed 

upon day of week, ROD order M-F 9-5 

& A staff member will handled EOD 

orders-Account Mgr. is Bruno Andreoli. 

On-line will be done through NAPA Pro-

Link, Kirks will do inventory 

changeover

Wayne County Road Commission, 

SMART, City of Detroit, Macomb 

County Dept. of Roads & City of Troy

Most customer service 

people have 15 + years of 

experience. see discount list

Electronic catalog was 

included on flash drive. 

Motown Automotive Farmington Hills, MI Yes Complete Complete Complete Complete Complete Complete

Established in 1971, 235 

employees. 12 warehouses. There 

are some "price Lists" they are 

unable to provide but will create for 

purposes of this agreement.  

Payment terms are net 25th of the 

month - will accept p-card but only 

for purchases before 10th of month

Agreed to all 3 options for delivery. 

Entities can order by phone, fax or on-

line. They have their own fleet vehicles 

Their goal is 30 minutes or less for 

ROD & EOD orders. Any product clean-

up or buy back plan will considered on 

a case by case basis.

Farmington Hills, Sterling Heights, 

Southfield, Rochester Hills, Lansing, 

Community EMS

Most customer service 

people have 15 + years of 

experience. see discount list

Electronic catalog was 

included on flash drive

Genuine Parts Company/Napa Detroit, MI

No electronic 

copy included Complete Complete Complete Complete Partial Incomplete

Scanned hard 

copy

Napa Detroit is a $30,000,000 a 

year supplier in SE MI which 

included 64 Napa Distributors, 4 

Balkamp, 15 Traction, 4 Rayloc, 2 

Altrom, 1 Heavy & 1,100 Company 

owned

Will service all from Warehouse in 

Ecorse & stores located throughout 

area. Orders can be done through Pro-

Link. Stock orders will be handled by 

rep once a week or 3% rebate for 

orders through Pro-Link. Local Store 

Manager can handle ROD & EOD but 

dependent on misc. factors timing may 

not meet 1 hour delivery time. Will do 

inventory changeover for "salable" 

items.

City of Detroit, Macomb County Sheriff, 

City of Westland, City of Sterling 

Heights & City of Dearborn.

Will use a combination of 

Sales force (4 years) of 

experience with NAPA & 

Store & Distric Store level 

people with average of 

over 20 years experience 

each.

did not include but 

stated that prices will 

be at minimum NAPA 

Prolink-50% - but many 

are deeper discounts

No catalog was included. 

There is reference to 

NAPA Prolink but no 

information on how to 

access to verify

Varsity Ford Ann Arbor, MI Yes Incomplete Incomplete Incomplete Incomplete Complete Incomplete

Possible Disqualification-Did not 

follow format requested

Dealer Auto Parts Redford, MI

No electronic 

copy included Incomplete Incomplete Incomplete Incomplete Complete Incomplete

Possible Disqualification-Did not 

follow format requested

Scanned hard 

copy



City of Farmington Hills

RFP TABULATION

RFP-FH-12-13-1748

AUTO PARTS

Discount listing

Manufacturer

General Parts 

Distributors DBA 

CARQUEST-

Discount off Retail 

Price

Kirk's Automotive-NAPA 

OEM MFG list price- 45% 

except as noted in 

exceptions section below Motown Auto

Genuine Parts 

Company/NAPA-Did state 

all prices at least 50% off 

NAPA Prolink Varsity Ford Dealer Auto Parts

AC Delco Retail-12% No-Bid Can special order Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Airtex Retail-17% No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Anco Retail-30% NAPA-WIP list-45% Jobber- 45% Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

AP Parts No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Auto Vehicle Parts Company (Au-Ve-Co) No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

BBP No-Bid
No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

BCA No-Bid NAPA-BCA list-45% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Bendix No-Bid NAPA-TWD list-35% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Bepco No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Betts No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Borg Warner No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Bosch Retail-17% NAPA-BSH list-45% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Boston Gear No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Browning No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Cambro No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

CarCal No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Champion Spark Plugs Retail-12% NAPA-CHA list-45% Jobber- 15% Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Cole Hersee No-Bid NAPA-TWD list-35% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Cyclo No-Bid NAPA-CRC list-45% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Dayco
No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Donaldson No-Bid NAPA-TWD list-35% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Dorman Retail-14% NAPA-BK list-45% Jobber- 15% Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Drawtite No-Bid NAPA-BK list-45% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Euclid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Everco No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Exide No-Bid No-Bid Jobber- 22% Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Federal Signal No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Federated No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Fleetguard No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Four Seasons Retail-17% NAPA-TEM list-45% Jobber- 18% Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Fram Retail-12% No-Bid Jobber- 20% Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid



City of Farmington Hills

RFP TABULATION

RFP-FH-12-13-1748

AUTO PARTS

Discount listing

Manufacturer

General Parts 

Distributors DBA 

CARQUEST-

Discount off Retail 

Price

Kirk's Automotive-NAPA 

OEM MFG list price- 45% 

except as noted in 

exceptions section below Motown Auto

Genuine Parts 

Company/NAPA-Did state 

all prices at least 50% off 

NAPA Prolink Varsity Ford Dealer Auto Parts

Gabriel Shocks Retail-22% No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Gates Retail-37% NAPA-NBH list-55% Jobber- 16% Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

GE No-Bid NAPA-LMP list-45% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Goerlich Retail-30% No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Goodyear Belts No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

GP No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Grote Retail-15% NAPA-GRO list-45% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Grover No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Guardian No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Gunite No-Bid NAPA-TWD list-35% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Hygrade No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Lee No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Leland No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Lister Petter No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Luberifiner No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Martin No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Maxim No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Meritor No-Bid NAPA-TWD list-35% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Meyer No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

MGM No-Bid NAPA-TWD list-35% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Midland No-Bid NAPA-TWD list-35% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Modern Mechanic No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Monroe No-Bid NAPA-NS list-45% Jobber- 37% Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Moog No-Bid NAPA-MRC list-45% Jobber- 30% Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Mopar No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Motorcraft Retail-8% No-Bid Can special order Sheet Not Included 58% 45% (50% off maint items)

Motorola No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Napa No-Bid See Napa Discounts No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

National No-Bid NAPA-NTL list-45% Jobber- 20% Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Nelson No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

New Holland No-Bid NAPA-BK list-45% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

NGK Spark Plugs Retail-12% NAPA-NGK list-45% Jobber- 18% Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Niehoff No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Parker No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid



City of Farmington Hills

RFP TABULATION

RFP-FH-12-13-1748

AUTO PARTS

Discount listing

Manufacturer

General Parts 

Distributors DBA 

CARQUEST-

Discount off Retail 

Price

Kirk's Automotive-NAPA 

OEM MFG list price- 45% 

except as noted in 

exceptions section below Motown Auto

Genuine Parts 

Company/NAPA-Did state 

all prices at least 50% off 

NAPA Prolink Varsity Ford Dealer Auto Parts

Partsmaster No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Performance Friction No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Peterson MFG No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Precision No-Bid No-Bid Jobber- 20% Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Pro Quality No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Proven Quality No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Raybestos Retail-22% NAPA-NGK list-45% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Reman No-Bid NAPA-RAY & WIL list-50% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Root No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Signal Stat No-Bid NAPA-NGK list-45% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Spicer Retail-22% No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Standard Retail-11% NAPA-ECH list-45% Jobber- 16% Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Stant Retail-20% NAPA-BK list-45% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Stemco Retail-07% NAPA-TWD list-35% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Sylvania No-Bid NAPA-LMP list-45% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Timken No-Bid NAPA-TWD list-35% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Truck Lite No-Bid NAPA-LIT list-45% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

TRW No-Bid NAPA-MRC list-45% No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Unity No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Wagner Retail-30%
NAPA-SS list-50%

Jobber-20% Belts & Jobber -

32% brakes Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Walker No-Bid NAPA-EXH list-45% Jpbber -30% Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Whelen No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid Sheet Not Included No-Bid No-Bid

Wix Retail-66% NAPA FIL list-75% Jobber -52% Sheet Not Included 30% No-Bid

Alternate Brands not listed US Cummunities NAPA PROlink list less 45% No-Bid Sheet Not Included Baldwin 42% No-Bid



Sample Price Sheet

Agency Manufacturer Part # Description Current Price Brand Name Part # Each Price Brand Name Part # Each Price Brand Name Part # Each Price Brand Name Part # Each Price Brand Name Part # Each Price Brand Name Part #

Each 

Price

Farmington Hills Anco 30-18 Winter Windshield Wiper 4.19$           Trico 357180 6.06$           NAPA WIP 601857 7.91$            Anco 30-18 4.22$                      6000181 7.19$         Motorcraft WW1801PF 7.50$     

Farmington Hills Anco 31-22 Windshield Wiper 2.65$           R155220 3.49$           NAPA WIP 60022 9.34$            Anco 31-22 2.59$                      60022 8.49$         Motorcraft WW2201PF 7.50$     

Farmington Hills AC Delco 12576414 Injector 49.95$         Standard FJ707 51.43$         NAPA CRB 239040 46.58$          Standard FJ706 62.03$                    2-18879 83.76$       

Farmington Hills Bendix 145260 Brake Pad 23.74$         Rotor? 55055 36.07$         NAPA NB 488628 39.21$          Silver Brand / Gren SB56828 25.25$                    488628 35.64$       

Farmington Hills Champion 7983 Spark Plugs 4.09$           Champion 7983 6.48$           NAPA CHA 7983 4.09$            Champion 7983 5.18$                      7983 3.78$         

Farmington Hills Cole Hersee 57006-01 Toggle Switch 16.03$         Cole Hersee 5700601 9.52$           NAPA TWD 5700601BX 8.86$            NO BID

Farmington Hills Delco Remy 8200433 Alternator 379.95$        WAI 726803N 239.17$        NAPA WIL 91014760N 353.43$        NO BID. SPECIAL ORDER ONLY 91014760N 471.29$     

Farmington Hills Delphi CS130D Alternator Reman 124.79$        WAI 718216N 83.99$         NAPA RAY 133160 180.12$        NO PART NUMBER FOUND. NO INTERCHANGE

Farmington Hills Donaldson P607969 Filter 25.85$         None NAPA FIL 2488 9.45$            NO PART NUMBER FOUND. NO INTERCHANGE

Farmington Hills Federated/Standard TX-89 Temperature Sendor 9.19$           Wells 712509 19.04$         NAPA ECH TS5732 10.05$          Standard Ignition TX-89 7.73$                      TS5732 9.59$         

Farmington Hills Federated D698 Professional Premium Ceramic Brake Pads 35.76$         P. Raybestos BXD698h 59.28$         NAPA TS TS7387AX 25.97$          Federated SST D698 31.71$                    TS7387AX 17.31$       

Farmington Hills Ford 7W7T-10300-AA 200 Amp Alternator 181.88$        11026A 235.19$        NAPA RAY 2139738 215.27$        USA Industries A3026 160.30$                   Motorcraft GL-671 227.97$     Motorcraft GL-671 325.67$ 

Farmington Hills Motorcraft CM5119 Injector 30.18$         Standard FJ958 35.19$         NAPA CRB 239019 35.58$          Standard Ignition FJ958 30.70$                    239019 30.73$       Motorcraft CM-5119 22.08$       Motorcraft CM-5119 26.29$   

Farmington Hills NGK BPR6ES 7131 Spark Plugs 3.40$           NGK 7131 2.63$           NAPA CHA 7131 2.34$            NGK BPR6ES 7131 1.58$                      7131 2.22$         

Farmington Hills Pollak 34-576 Toggle Switch 4.62$           Pollack 34576 6.91$           NAPA TWD 5592BX 7.72$            Grote 82-2114 6.03$                      

Farmington Hills Raybestos SB-56828 Brake Pads 23.74$         Rotor? 55088 53.29$         NAPA NB 488628 122.76$        Silver Brand / Gren SB56828 25.25$                    488628 35.64$       

Farmington Hills Sloan 421140 Solenoid 21.66$         Phillips 54140 18.31$         NAPA ECH ST550 66.15$          Grote 82-0307 18.38$                    54-140 27.49$       

Farmington Hills Wagner QC-784 Brake Pads 35.75$         P. Raybestos BXD7844H 51.97$         NAPA UP UP76522X 78.27$          Wagner QC784 40.11$                    UP7652M 59.84$       

Farmington Hills Wagner MX931 Brake Pads 34.30$         P. Raybestos BXD931H 51.97$         NAPA SS SS7834X 46.81$          Wagner MX931 38.48$                    UP7834M 47.16$       Motorcraft BRF-931 34.99$       Motorcraft BRF-931 39.98$   

Farmington Hills Wix 51036 Filter 2.94$           Wix 85036mp 2.25$           NAPA FIL 1036 2.88$            Wix 51036 2.76$                      1036 5.18$         Baldwin B35-S 3.26$         

Farmington Hills Wix 46134 Filter 4.17$           Wix 88134 3.47$           NAPA FIL 6134 4.13$            Wix 46134 3.96$                      6134 7.44$         Baldwin PA2152 5.59$         

Farmington Hills Wix 33651XE Filter 12.29$         Wix 86651xe 8.67$           NAPA FIL 3651XE 12.17$          Wix 33651XE 10.28$                    3651XE 19.27$       Baldwin PF7680 6.25$         

Warren Federated SB680110 Brake Rotors 18.39$         Raybestos 54103 42.24$         NAPA NB 488880110 46.89$          Silver Brand / Gren SB680110 19.58$                    488880110 42.62$       Motorcraft BRRF-36 31.49$       

Warren Raybestos ATD931P Brake Pads 42.10$         P. Raybestos BMD931 49.27$         NAPA UP UP7834X 74.70$          Raybestos ATD931P 42.94$                    SS7834X 44.47$       Motorcraft BRSD-931 33.59$       

Warren Anco 31-22 Wiper Blades 2.65$           R155220 3.49$           NAPA WIP 60022 9.34$            Anco 31-22 2.59$                      NB22 3.27$         

Warren Moog K6711 Lwr Bll Joint 36.13$         Raybestos 5051349 40.16$         NAPA MRC 104383 37.84$          Moog K6711 33.16$                    104383 38.45$       

Warren Moog ES3693 Tie Rod End 38.33$         Raybestos 4011875 42.50$         NAPA MRC ES3693 32.09$          Moog ES3693 35.18$                    ES3693 32.60$       

Warren Gates K060923 Serpentine Belt 26.38$         Gates k060923 27.08$         NAPA NBH 25060923 26.87$          Gates K060923 25.07$                    25060923 28.36$       Motorcraft JK6-926 19.71$       Motorcraft JK6-926 21.12$   

Warren Moog K200168 Sway Bar Bushings 10.67$         Raybestos 5501595 10.91$         NAPA NBH 2562669 13.06$          Moog K200168 9.79$                      2562669 11.50$       

Warren Napa Gold Filter FIL6678 Air Filter 24.50$         Wix 88678 7.95$           NAPA FIL 6628 31.61$          Wix 46678 9.38$                      6678 17.60$       Baldwin PA4134 10.09$       

Warren Napa Ultra Premium UP880000 Front Brake Rotors 96.13$         Raybestos 55072 32.17$         NAPA NB 4888000 39.21$          Silver Brand / Gren SB580000 25.37$                    88000 96.13$       

Warren Napa Ultra Premium UP7652ASD Front Brake Pads 72.37$         P.Raybestos BXD784h 51.97$         NAPA UP UP7652ASD 82.71$          Wagner SX784 47.53$                    UP7652SD 68.92$       

Warren Napa Bearing BR930406 Hub Bearing Assembly 242.43$        National 515041 169.35$        NAPA BRG BR930406 266.68$        Moog 515018 & Others 183.82$                   BR930406 213.34$     

Warren Delphi FG0085 Fuel Pump 232.94$        Delphi FG0085 250.65$        NAPA DFP FG0085 278.84$        Delphi FG0085 185.66$                   FG0085 208.42$     

Warren Napa Gold Filter FIL3837 Fuel filter 126.48$        Wix 86837 38.42$         NAPA FIL 3837 53.74$          Wix 33837 45.39$                    3837 85.12$       Baldwin BF7933KIT 51.05$       

Warren Napa Bearing BR930506 Hub Bearing Assembly 160.55$        National 513230 109.49$        NAPA BRG BR930506 176.61$        Moog 513230 117.20$                   BR930506 176.61$     

Sterling Heights ANCO 30-22 WIPER BLADES $2.65 Trico 357225 $9.91 NAPA WIP 602257 15.33$          Anco 30-22 4.22$                      NBW22 7.35$         Motorcraft WW2201P 4.99$     

Sterling Heights WIX 51085 OIL FILTER $3.14 Wix 85085mp $2.43 NAPA FIL 1085 3.11$            Wix 51085 2.99$                      1085 5.60$         Baldwin B34 3.46$         

Sterling Heights GATES K060923 SERPENTINE BELT $26.38 Gates k060923 $27.08 NAPA NBH 25060923 26.87$          Gates K060923 25.07$                    25060923 28.36$       Motorcraft JK6-926 19.71$       Motorcraft JK6-926 21.12$   

Sterling Heights WAGNER 1157 MINIATURE LAMP $0.17 Wagner 1157 $0.69 NAPA LMP 1157 1.42$            Wagner 1157 0.15$                      1157 0.49$         

Sterling Heights MOOG DS1460 TIE ROD END $77.60 Raybestos 4101079 $81.11 NAPA MRC DS1460 51.58$          Moog DS1460 71.22$                    DS1460 53.45$       

Sterling Heights FOUR SEASONS 83044 A/C ACCUMULATOR $19.17 210230 $31.72 NAPA TEM 408911 31.90$          Four Seasons 83044 19.78$                    408911 26.10$       

Sterling Heights WAGNER 9007 HEADLIGHT BULB $4.43 Wagner 9007 $7.69 NAPA LMP 9007 8.46$            Wagner 9007 3.51$                      9007 7.69$         

Sterling Heights EXIDE 65X BATTERY $49.35 East Penn 6560 $81.93 NAPA BAT 7565 83.90$          EXIDE 65X 82.54$                    7565 97.61$       

Sterling Heights FEDERATED SB780143 BRAKE ROTORS $28.25 Raybestos 53012 $49.72 NAPA NB 48880143 54.98$          Silver Brand / Gren SB780143 30.06$                    48880143 49.98$       

Sterling Heights WAGNER MX965 BRAKE PADS $31.21 P. Raybestos BMD965h $50.43 NAPA SS SS7864X 46.81$          Wagner MX965 35.01$                    SS7864X 29.65$       

Sterling Heights HAPCO 4104 LIMITED SLIP ADD $6.31 K & W 402058 $9.01 NAPA TWD SG3101B 30.46$          Hapco 4104 6.31$                      

Sterling Heights CHAMPION 436 SPARK PLUG $2.22 Champion 436 $2.14 NAPA CHA 91 1.40$            Champion 436 1.82$                      436 1.75$         

Sterling Heights 86 2.5" MUFFLER CLAMP $1.00 Goerlich U212 $0.88 NAPA BK 7335336 2.60$            Nickson 86 0.93$                      733-5414 1.56$         

Sterling Heights CYCLO C111C BRAKE CLEANER $2.34 CRC 1005 $3.85 NAPA CRC 091314 3.99$            Cyclo C111C 2.10$                      091314 2.69$         

Sterling Heights FELPRO RDS55341 REAR DIFF GASKET$4.64 $4.64 Victor P27608TC $5.17 NAPA FPG RDS55341 5.49$            Felpro RDS55341 3.83$                      BDS55341 5.09$         

SMART Luberfiner 23516489 Water Filter 30.83$          Wix 89088 31.45$          NAPA FIL 4088 44.00$          Wix 24088 37.17$                    4088 69.70$       Baldwin BW5200 41.34$       

SMART 23529744 Oil Filter 10.15$          Wix 85799mp 12.41$          NAPA FIL 1799 18.17$          Wix 51799 15.35$                    1799 28.79$       Baldwin B7030 15.22$       

SMART 24210956 Transmission Filter 29.96$          96021 14.97$          NAPA ATP 15918 16.57$          Wix 58608 10.33$                    15918 16.48$       Baldwin 18027 21.50$       

SMART 29539579 Transmission Filter 25.44$          96054 9.70$            NAPA ATP 18592 10.08$          Wix 57701 9.47$                      7701 17.76$       Baldwin BT8460 9.99$         

SMART 29548987 Transmission Oil Filter Kit 28.71$          Wix 84741xe 31.62$          NAPA TWD PT9416MPGKIT 49.11$          Wix 57741XE 37.37$                    7741XE 70.07$       Baldwin PT9416 43.06$       

SMART 51734 Oil Filter 8.64$            Wix 85734mp 6.93$            NAPA FIL 1734 10.23$          Wix 51734 8.64$                      1734 16.20$       Baldwin B7039 9.17$         

SMART Delco or Donaldson A2959C Air Filter 22.70$          Wix 83154 26.86$          NAPA FIL 9154 37.50$          Wix 49154 31.68$                    9154 39.40$       Baldwin CA5370 34.05$       

SMART CA8130 Air Filter 48.45$          Wix 88748 55.42$          NAPA FIL 6748 77.46$          Wix 46748 65.43$                    6748 127.69$     Baldwin PA3493 72.67$       

SMART FS1022 Fuel Filter 12.15$          Wix 86422 11.90$          NAPA FIL 3422 16.48$          Wix 33422 13.92$                    3422 26.10$       Baldwin BF1272-SPS 13.77$       

SMART Fleetguard LF9009 Oil Filter 20.22$          Wix 85748XD 20.57$          NAPA FIL 1748XD 28.84$          Wix 51748XD 24.36$                    1748XD 45.68$       Baldwin BD7309 26.89$       

SMART PH2 Oil Filter 2.51$            Wix 85372mp 2.43$            NAPA FIL 1372 3.11$            Wix 51372 2.99$                      1372 5.60$         Baldwin B329 3.77$         

SMART PH3387A Oil Filter 2.53$            Wix 85040mp 2.25$            NAPA FIL 1040 2.88$            Wix 51040 2.76$                      1040 5.18$         Baldwin B43-S 3.35$         

SMART Fram/Delco or Napa PH9100 Oil Filter 2.09$            Wix 84202mp 4.08$            NAPA FIL 7202 5.96$            Wix 57202 5.04$                      7202 9.45$         Baldwin B1441 5.24$         

SMART Fleetguard WF2071 Water Filter 5.22$            Wix 89071mp 5.23$            NAPA FIL 4071 7.58$            Wix 24071 6.40$                      4071 12.00$       Baldwin BW5071 6.73$         

SMART 19259309 Fuel Filter Kit 72.90$          Wix 86837 38.42$          NAPA FIL 3837 53.74$          Wix 33837 45.39$                    3837 85.12$       

SMART 1820479C1 Fuel Filter 3.85$            Wix 86420 4.89$            NAPA FIL 3420 6.87$            Wix 33420 5.80$                      3420 10.88$       Baldwin BF7531 6.70$         

Rochester Hills Anco 30-22 22" wiper blades 4.30$           Trico 357225 9.91$           NAPA WIP 602257 10.11$          Anco 30-22 4.22$                      60022 8.49$         Motorcraft WW2201P 4.99$     

Rochester Hills WIX 51791XE Oil filter 18.24$         Wix 85791xe 12.92$         NAPA FIL 1791.XE 18.06$          Wix 51791XE 15.25$                    1791.XE 28.61$       Baldwin B76-MPG 18.72$       

Rochester Hills WIX 46981 Cabin air filter 24.16$         Wix 88891 71.40$         NAPA FIL 6981 11.96$          Wix 46981 10.10$                    6981 26.10$       Baldwin PA5337 12.52$       

Rochester Hills WIX 33422 Fuel filter 16.63$         Wix 86422 11.90$         NAPA FIL 3422 16.48$          Wix 33422 13.92$                    3422 18.94$       Baldwin BF1272-SPS 13.77$       

Rochester Hills WIX 57624 Hydraulic filter 45.25$         Wix 84624 31.96$         NAPA FIL 7624 44.80$          Wix 57624 37.84$                    7624 70.96$       Baldwin BT9347-MPG 41.20$       

KIRK'S AUTOMOTIVE MOTOWN (Please see proposal for additional alternates)General Parts-CARQUEST GENUINE AUTO PARTS/NAPA VARSITY FORD DEALER AUTO PARTS
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Rochester Hills Gates K060930 Micro V-Belt 25.39$         Gates K060930 25.82$         NAPA NBH 25060930 25.86$          Gates K060930 24.13$                    25060930 27.30$       Motorcraft JK6936 28.02$   

Rochester Hills GMC 12562943 Oxygen sensor 50.82$         Bosch 754057 44.79$         NAPA NGK 21059 52.09$          Delphi ES20095 42.94$                    21516 67.17$       

Rochester Hills GMC 26092432 Transmission shift control assy 170.36$        None NAPA ECH VSS852 40.42$          NO PART NUMBER FOUND. NO INTERCHANGE

Rochester Hills GMC 15804953 Hi pressure power steering hose 40.28$         No Interchg NAPA NPS 73275 18.45$          Omega 1235 50.63$                    

Rochester Hills GMC 15943453 Draglink rod assembly 144.76$        No Interchg NAPA MRC 1880631 18.14$          NO PART NUMBER FOUND. NO INTERCHANGE

Rochester Hills AC Delco 19241583 Durastop disc pads 42.95$         No Interchg NAPA SS SS8472X 46.81$          Wagner QC1363 45.55$                    

Rochester Hills AC Delco 19175334 Durastop brake rotors 65.99$         No Interchg NAPA NB 48880279 41.77$          Silver Brand / Gren SB580279 23.60$                    

Rochester Hills AC Delco 31-900CT Battery 96.48$         East Penn 31s30 87.63$         NAPA BAT 7236 87.99$          EXIDE HP31D 96.31$                    7236 99.00$       

Rochester Hills AC Delco 78-PS Battery 74.77$         East Penn 7860 69.10$         NAPA BAT 7578 72.02$          EXIDE 78X 82.54$                    7578 83.80$       Motorcraft BXL78A 59.95$   

Rochester Hills Grote 53762 Tail light assembly 26.03$         Grote 53762 30.34$         NAPA TWD 53762 28.31$          Grote 53762 22.74$                    53762 29.69$       

Rochester Hills Cole Hersee 8486 Body-up switch 9.35$           Cole Hersee 8486 9.33$           NAPA TWD 8486BX 8.42$            NO BID SL128 12.96$       

Rochester Hills Trucklite 97861 West coast mirror 22.94$         Grote 16273 30.85$         NAPA LIT 97861 21.58$          Grote 16273 25.68$                    97861 29.91$       

Rochester Hills Trucklite 40203 Dome lamp 6.99$           Grote 51051 8.49$           NAPA LIT 40203 6.07$            Grote 61051 6.37$                      40203 8.40$         

Rochester Hills Trucklite 60202R Stop/turn/tail lamp 7.28$           Grote 52892 5.09$           NAPA LIT 60202R 5.42$            Grote 52892-5 6.33$                      60202R 7.51$         

Macomb Co. Roads Bosch WPR-4841 Wiper Blade 22" 11.19$          Bosch 4841 11.19$          NAPA WIP 602257 10.11$          Anco A22UB 5.96$                      60-022 8.49$         Motorcraft WW2201PF 7.50$     

Macomb Co. Roads AC Delco 22841380 Front Hub Assembly-'08 Silverado 260.92$        National 515096 164.97$        NAPA BRG BR930693 311.27$        Moog 515097 159.07$                   BR930693 249.02$     

Macomb Co. Roads Napa P355 U-Joint / Front - GM PU 12.84$          Spicer 2103105 12.47$          NAPA PUJ 892 117.40$        Moog 355 13.13$                    355 14.81$       

Macomb Co. Roads MotorCraft WW1901P Wiper Blade 19" 7.33$            R155190 2.79$            NAPA WIP 601959 12.09$          Anco A19UB 5.96$                      60019 7.75$         Motorcraft WW1901P 4.19$         Motorcraft WW1901P 4.99$     

Macomb Co. Roads 8237 Alternator-Chev Silverado (145 AMP) 190.00$        MPA 8237a 159.59$        NAPA RAY 134801 145.01$        USA Industries 8237 116.55$                   2134807 145.01$     

Macomb Co. Roads AC Delco D1565E Brake Light Switch 8.94$            Wells 5354432 9.34$            NAPA ECH SL503 10.20$          Standard Ignition SLS213 8.17$                      SL503 9.74$         

Macomb Co. Roads  BHB-9006 9006L Halogen Bulb 3.84$            Wagner 9006 7.69$            NAPA LMP 9006 8.46$            Wagner 9006 2.86$                      9006 7.69$         

Macomb Co. Roads Mileage Plus Wires MPW3152 Spark Plug Wire Set GR 14.8 27.58$          Presolite 3152 27.58$          NAPA MPW 3152 47.49$          Standard Ignition 7874 47.66$                    3152 13.12$       

Macomb Co. Roads Napa 1255H11 Daytime Running Bulb 8.08$            Phillips H1B1 5.24$            NAPA LMP BP125H11 17.41$          Wagner BP1255H11 7.58$                      BP125H11 10.30$       

Macomb Co. Roads BRSD1414 Frt Brake Pads-  '11 Ford F150XL 56.48$          CXD1414 25.40$          NAPA SS SS8528X 46.81$          Wagner QC1414 44.19$                    SS8528X 82.99$       Motorcraft BRSD-1414 34.99$       Motorcraft BRSD-1414 41.65$   

Macomb Co. Roads BR1012C Rear Brake Pads- "     "      " 42.92$          CXD1414 25.40$          NAPA SS SS85289X 43.69$          Wagner QC1012 31.95$                    SS7916X 32.99$       Motorcraft BR-1012C 26.59$       Motorcraft BR-1012C 31.65$   

Macomb Co. Roads 19241883 Rear Rotors-'04 Chev Silverado 1500 45.19$          Raybestos 55066 34.07$          NAPA NB 4886825 27.27$          Silver Brand / Gren SB56827 19.09$                    

Macomb Co. Roads 45U040 Front U-Joint-'04 Chev Silverado1500 19.47$          Spicer 2103105 7.01$            NAPA PUJ 534G 15.16$          Moog 534G 8.87$                      

Macomb Co. Roads 45U0106 Rear U-Joint-'04 Chev Silverado 1500 10.17$          Spicer 2103105 7.01$            NAPA PUJ 235 22.81$          Moog 354 8.80$                      354 12.59$       

Macomb Co. Roads 88876337 Inner Tie Rod-'04 Chev Silverado1500 17.97$          Raybestos 4102366 38.21$          NAPA MRC ES3492 20.16$          Moog ES3488 35.29$                    

Macomb Co. Roads 88909670 Front Brake Pads-GMC 2500 4WD 48.59$          CXD784 25.40$          NAPA UP UP7652M 75.38$          Wagner QC784 40.11$                    TS7652M 19.25$       


